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1  Introduction and summary

The purpose of the Government Pension Fund is 
to support long-term considerations in the spend-
ing of petroleum revenues and government saving 
to finance public pensions under the National 
Insurance Scheme. Sound long-term management 
will help ensure that Norway’s petroleum 
resources may benefit both current and future 
generations.

The Government Pension Fund comprises the 
Government Pension Fund Global (GPFG) and 
the Government Pension Fund Norway (GPFN). 
The two funds are managed by Norges Bank and 
Folketrygdfondet, respectively, under mandates 
issued by the Ministry of Finance.

In this white paper to the Storting (the Norwe-
gian parliament), the Ministry of Finance presents 
performance figures and assessments of the man-
agement of the Government Pension Fund in 
2015. Further development of the investment 
strategy for the Fund is discussed, with an empha-
sis on unlisted real estate and infrastructure. The 
work on responsible management is also 
accounted for. 

The investment strategy

The investment objective of the Government Pen-
sion Fund is to achieve the highest possible 
return with a moderate level of risk. There is 
broad political agreement that the Fund should 
not be used as a foreign policy or environmental 
policy instrument. The investment strategy builds 
on the Ministry’s investment beliefs, as well as the 
purpose and distinctive characteristics of the 
Fund. The strategy has been developed gradually 
on the basis of thorough assessments. Important 
strategic choices are anchored in the Storting. 
This contributes to the sustainability of the cho-
sen, long-term strategy, including in periods of 
financial market turbulence.

The investment strategies for the GPFG and 
GPFN are set out in the management mandates, 
and are expressed through, among other things, 
the composition of the benchmark indices. In both 
cases, the equity portion is set to 60 percent, 
reflecting a trade-off between long-term expected 

risk and return. Fixed-income securities account 
for the remainder of the benchmark index for the 
GPFN. For the GPFG, up to five percent of the 
Fund may be invested in a separate real estate 
portfolio, with a correspondingly lower share allo-
cated to fixed-income.

Norges Bank and Folketrygdfondet are per-
mitted to deviate somewhat from the benchmark 
indices set by the Ministry of Finance. The scope 
for deviations allows the managers to exploit the 
distinctive characteristics of the Fund – such as 
long investment horizon and size – to seek a 
return exceeding that of the benchmark index. A 
further advantage is the opportunity for cost-effec-
tive implementation of the benchmark indices.

The investment strategies for the GPFG and 
GPFN are discussed in sections 2.1 and 4.1.

Positive performance in a turbulent year

Global financial markets were turbulent in 2015. 
The year was characterised by low interest rates, 
falling oil prices and weaker outlook for emerging 
markets. Exchange rates fluctuated considerably 
over the year, as did the quarterly returns on the 
Fund. The GPFG achieved an annual return of 2.7 
percent, measured in the currency basket of the 
Fund. This represents a sharp drop compared to 
the high returns generated in recent years. Real 
estate delivered the highest return, while the 
fixed-income portfolio generated almost no 
return.

The market value of the GPFG at yearend was 
NOK 7,471 billion after asset management costs. 
Measured in Norwegian kroner (NOK), the mar-
ket value increased more than NOK 1,000 billion 
in 2015. Net inflow of new capital amounted to 
approximately NOK 50 billion, while returns in 
foreign currencies totalled close to NOK 350 bil-
lion. More than half of the increase in the value of 
the Fund can be attributed to the depreciation of 
the Norwegian krone, which does not affect the 
Fund’s international purchasing power.

The real rate of return on the GPFG in 2015 
was 1.8 percent after asset management costs. In 
the period 1998–2015, the GPFG has achieved an 
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average annual real rate of return of 3.7 percent. 
Every year, the Fund receives recurring income 
in the form of equity dividends, interest and rental 
income. This cash flow is expected to remain rela-
tively stable over time, and totalled NOK 193 bil-
lion in 2015, equivalent to 2.8 percent of the 
Fund’s capital.

The Nordic financial markets outperformed 
the global market in 2015. Measured in NOK, the 
GPFN achieved a return of 7.0 percent, with equi-
ties generating a significantly higher return than 
the fixed-income portfolio. The market value of 
the GPFN at yearend 2015 was NOK 198 billion. 
Annual net real return in 2015 equalled 4.7 per-
cent. 

Norges Bank and Folketrygdfondet aim to 
maximise return net of costs, subject to the limits 
stipulated in the mandates set by the Ministry. 
The return generated by the GPFG in 2015 was 
0.45 percentage points above the benchmark 
index. This excess return is higher than can be 
expected over time, given the limited scope for 
deviation from the benchmark index. The highest 
excess return was generated by the equity portfo-
lio. Since 1998, annual excess return has averaged 
0.26 percentage points. In total, this equals about 
NOK 82 billion. Last year, the GPFN outper-
formed its benchmark index by 0.48 percentage 
points. This figure is in line with the average 
annual excess return since 1998.

The reported excess return is not adjusted for 
asset management costs. The return on the bench-
mark indices cannot be achieved without incurring 
costs. Estimates indicate that the asset manage-
ment costs of Norges Bank and Folketrygdfondet 
approximate the costs of index management. The 
Ministry of Finance therefore considers the 
reported excess return a reasonable measure of 
the value added through active management. 
Measured as a proportion of capital under manage-
ment, costs amounted to 0.06 percent (GPFG) and 
0.09 percent (GPFN) in 2015. These figures are 
within the limits set by the Ministry, and low 
compared to the costs of other funds.

In evaluating performance, a distinction can be 
made between the excess return a manager 
achieves by taking on more systematic risk and 
excess return attributable to other factors. This 
approach may help explain excess returns ex-
post. Excess returns stemming from higher risk-
taking in active management can in theory be 
achieved more efficiently by adjusting the compo-
sition of the benchmark index. Although different 
models are used to explain performance, these do 
not provide an unambiguous description of how 

risk has impacted performance or what adjust-
ments to the benchmark index are feasible. This 
report presents several risk-adjusted return mea-
sures. These indicate that Norges Bank and 
Folketrygdfondet have generated robust excess 
returns given the risks taken in active manage-
ment.

The results achieved by the GPFG and GPFN 
are discussed in sections 2.2 and 4.2, respectively. 
The principles governing performance and risk 
assessment in the management context are cov-
ered in a special thematic article in chapter 7.

Uncertainty about the future value of the Fund

Measured in Norwegian kroner, the market value 
of the GPFG has almost doubled in the three-year 
period 2013–2015. The return achieved during 
this period is high compared to the average 
expected return over time and, additionally, the 
Fund has received substantial inflows of oil and 
gas revenues. Nonetheless, around half of the 
increase in the value of the Fund is attributable to 
the depreciation of the Norwegian krone, which 
does not increase the Fund’s international pur-
chasing power. Although the development of 
these variables is uncertain, several factors sug-
gest that the Fund is likely to grow more slowly 
going forward.

International interest rates have been low and 
falling for many years. This is reflected in low 
yields on the government and corporate bonds 
held by the Fund. Declining interest rates have 
generated capital gains for the Fund, but the 
scope for further gains is limited given the cur-
rent low interest rate level. Although the US Fed-
eral Reserve began raising its policy rate late last 
year, the Bank of England and European Central 
Bank have stated that rate hikes will not come 
until a later date.

The value of the Fund is also influenced by 
transfers to and withdrawals from the Fund. The 
GPFG is an integral part of the fiscal budget and 
the fiscal policy framework. The state’s oil and gas 
revenues are transferred to the GPFG in full, while 
spending via the fiscal budget over time corre-
sponds to the expected real rate of return on the 
Fund (the fiscal policy guideline). Spending is thus 
decoupled from current revenue accrual. This 
helps insulate the fiscal budget from fluctuations in 
petroleum revenues and supports a stable develop-
ment of the Norwegian mainland economy.

Over the past 10–15 years, elevated production 
and oil and gas prices have contributed to the 
rapid accumulation of capital in the GPFG. Pro-
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duction on the Norwegian continental shelf 
appears to have peaked, and oil prices have fallen 
sharply in recent years, reducing the state’s net 
cash flow from petroleum activities. At the same 
time, petroleum revenue spending via the fiscal 
budget has gradually increased after the adoption 
of the fiscal policy guideline in 2001. In the budget 
for 2016, the non-oil deficit was estimated at NOK 
209 billion. Measured as a proportion of the Fund 
capital, the spending of petroleum revenue falls 
well within the limits stipulated by the fiscal policy 
guideline. The cash flow from petroleum activities 
was estimated at NOK 204 billion. Oil prices have 
fallen further since the budget was presented last 
autumn.

Already at the introduction of the fiscal policy 
framework it was envisaged that the Fund would 
experience an initial phase of substantial net 
inflows and rapid capital accumulation followed by 
a prolonged period of net withdrawals and weaker 
growth in the value of the Fund. In the phase we 
are entering into, the non-oil deficit is likely to be 
covered in part by Fund returns in the form of 
equity dividends, interest and rental income. This 
shift has occurred a few years earlier than antici-
pated due to the decline in oil prices. Nonetheless, 
depending on the development in oil prices, pro-
duction levels and the non-oil fiscal budget deficit, 
net inflows to the Fund may turn positive in com-
ing years.

For an extended period, net inflows have 
boosted the GPFG capital year by year, including 
in periods of low returns. Going forward, growth 
in the market value of the Fund will primarily be 
determined by international financial market 
returns.

Unlisted investments

A key theme of this year’s report is investments in 
unlisted real estate and infrastructure. The Minis-
try of Finance has assessed whether the propor-
tion of the GPFG invested in real estate should be 
increased, and whether investment in unlisted 
infrastructure should be permitted. Consideration 
has also been given to whether one should open 
up for the GPFN to be invested in unlisted real 
estate and infrastructure. The Ministry has 
received recommendations from Norges Bank 
and an expert group (Van Nieuwerburgh, Stanton 
and de Bever) on the scope and regulation of such 
investments in the GPFG. Folketrygdfondet has 
given advice on the GPFN.

The Government Pension Fund is primarily 
invested in listed equities and bonds. The bench-

mark indices for equities and bonds can be 
closely tracked at low cost. The benchmark con-
struction facilitates broad diversification to 
reduce risk. Performance and the risk associ-
ated with deviation from the benchmark indices 
can be measured on an ongoing basis. Unlisted 
markets do not offer the same opportunity to 
diversify risk through broad-based ownership 
and small ownership shares. Operational man-
agement is more complex, and requires differ-
ent, more specialised expertise. Nor are there 
reliable benchmark indices for unlisted invest-
ments. Risk and return cannot be measured reg-
ularly as in listed markets, since changes in 
value are estimated, for example through 
appraisals.

In principle, unlisted investments may help 
increase returns or reduce risk in two different 
ways. Firstly, in the longer term unlisted invest-
ments may have distinct risk and return character-
istics from corresponding listed investments. As a 
result, the average investor can expect to profit 
from the inclusion of unlisted investments in the 
portfolio, in the form of either improved diversifica-
tion of risk or higher expected returns. Secondly, 
investors with advantages in unlisted markets can 
generate excess returns compared to the average 
investor. Potential advantages include investment 
horizon, size and management expertise.

Real estate investments in the GPFG

In 2008, it was decided that up to five percent of 
the GPFG should be invested in a separate real 
estate portfolio. The objectives included risk 
diversification and the harvesting of premiums 
from less liquid assets. The real estate portfolio is 
still being scaled up, and accounted for some 
three percent of the Fund at the end of 2015. 
Norges Bank’s actual real estate investments are 
included in the Fund’s benchmark index. A global, 
appraisal-based index (IPD) of unlisted real estate 
values has been adopted as the return objective. It 
is not possible to undertake investments that 
closely mirror the index. 

Norges Bank and the expert group have recom-
mended changes to the regulation of the GPFG’s 
investments in unlisted real estate. In their view, 
the current return measure is less suited to the 
intended purpose, and a benchmark index com-
posed of listed equities and bonds would be prefer-
able. This would also enable improved manage-
ment of the risk associated with the Fund’s real 
estate investments. In its report the expert group 
shows that it is uncertain whether investments in 
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unlisted real estate have resulted in better diversifi-
cation of risk or higher expected returns. It also 
points out that real estate valuations are currently 
high. Norges Bank, on the other hand, builds on 
different analyses than the expert group and is of 
the opinion that real estate investments improve 
the risk-return ratio over time.

The Ministry of Finance intends to set aside 
the current provision that up to five percent of the 
GPFG’s capital shall be invested in a separate real 
estate portfolio that forms part of the benchmark 
index. The benchmark index will thus only 
include listed equities and bonds. The real estate 
investments are to be measured against a broadly 
composed index which, in principle, can be 
tracked closely and at low cost.

The proposed change entails that the scope 
and composition of the real estate investments will 
be decided by Norges Bank subject to the limits 
set in the mandate from the Ministry of Finance. 
It also reflects the fact that this type of manage-
ment demands specialist expertise and market 
proximity. The expected return is uncertain and 
will depend on the comparative advantages of the 
asset manager and choice of specific investments. 
Moreover, this solution gives a clear division of 
labour between the Ministry and Norges Bank, 
mirroring the arrangement for other active man-
agement strategies.

To improve risk management, the Ministry of 
Finance plans to include unlisted real estate 
investments under the existing limit on deviations 
from the benchmark index, as proposed by 
Norges Bank. As a result, all strategies entailing 
deviations from the benchmark index will be sub-
ject to an overall risk limit.

In addition, the Ministry of Finance is prepar-
ing to cap investments in unlisted real estate at 
seven percent of the GPFG. Returns on real 
estate may at times differ from the return on 
listed equities and bonds. Accordingly, Norges 
Bank must aim for a lower proportion of unlisted 
real estate to avoid breaching the limit and hav-
ing to liquidate holdings in the event of sharp, 
sudden drops in the value of listed investments. 
In the Ministry’s opinion, a cap of seven percent 
allows for a long-term unlisted real estate propor-
tion of approximately five percent of the GPFG. 
The Ministry considers this limit sufficient to 
realise any economies of scale offered by the 
market.

The GPFG’s real estate investments are dis-
cussed in a separate section.

Unlisted infrastructure investments in the GPFG

Lack of data on unlisted infrastructure makes it 
difficult to assess whether such investments 
improve risk diversification or raise expected 
returns for the average investor. An additional 
question is whether the Fund has advantages 
compared to other investors for such investments.

The expert group and Norges Bank consider 
that the range of investment opportunities can be 
expanded by permitting investments in unlisted 
infrastructure. However, the Ministry of Finance 
has emphasised a number of significant factors 
that speak against permitting such investments.

Numerous infrastructure investments are 
exposed to high regulatory or political risk. 
Within the infrastructure sector, long-term con-
tracts where profitability is subject to the direct 
influence of political authorities in other countries, 
through the setting of tariffs or other regulation, 
are commonplace. There have been several exam-
ples in recent years of authorities changing the 
conditions for such investments through the rene-
gotiation of signed agreements or changes to sub-
sidy schemes.

In the case of unlisted investments, the owner-
ship share in each individual investment will gen-
erally be large. As a result, Fund investments will 
be more visible and more likely subject to criti-
cism. Conflicts with the authorities of other coun-
tries on issues such as the regulation of transport, 
energy supply and other important public goods 
will generally be difficult to manage, and can 
entail reputational risk for the Fund. The Ministry 
considers that a transparent, politically endorsed 
sovereign fund like the GPFG is less suited to 
bear this type of risk than other investors. High 
transaction costs and low liquidity make divest-
ments more difficult if complications were to 
arise.

The unlisted infrastructure market available to 
the GPFG is small. Infrastructure is primarily 
owned by public authorities, and is scarcely avail-
able to investors. Uncertain estimates indicate 
that unlisted infrastructure only accounts for 0.5 
percent of the global investable capital market. 
The majority of the infrastructure market is listed. 
In this respect, infrastructure differs from real 
estate, where most of the market is unlisted. Per-
mitting investment in unlisted infrastructure will 
therefore to a lesser degree expand investment 
opportunities for the Fund than the decision to 
open up for investments in unlisted real estate.
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Both the expert group and Norges Bank have 
discussed potential management advantages and 
the distinctive characteristics of the Fund. Such 
benefits are difficult to quantify. Norges Bank has 
just a few years’ experience in the unlisted space, 
and the real estate portfolio is still being built up. 
The Ministry is of the opinion that more experi-
ence should be gained in this area before any 
expansion to include additional types of unlisted 
investment.

Following an overall assessment, the Minis-
try of Finance is not prepared to permit the 
GPFG to be invested in unlisted infrastructure at 
this stage.

The GPFG has a financial target, and is not an 
instrument for promoting state investment in 
developing countries or renewable energy. There 
is no financial rationale for permitting infrastruc-
ture investments in these selected sub-markets 
only. The level of risk within these sub-markets is 
higher than that of other unlisted infrastructure 
investments. A desire to invest on a non-financial 
basis should be pursued through other means 
than the GPFG. There are already several public 
schemes to promote investments in developing 
countries and renewable energy. Furthermore, 
the Storting has asked the Government to pre-
pare the establishment of a limited company 
mandated to invest in partnership with the 
private sector in companies that develop and 
utilise green technologies. The Government will 
revert to this question in its revised budget for 
2016.

Unlisted infrastructure investments in the 
GPFG are discussed in a separate section.

Unlisted investments in the GPFN

Folketrygdfondet has recommended allowing the 
GPFN to be invested in unlisted infrastructure 
and real estate. In its view, access to a wider range 
of investment opportunities will help diversify risk 
and increase returns net of costs. 

The GPFN is invested primarily in Norway. The 
rest of the Nordic region accounts for a smaller 
portion of Fund investments. The investment strat-
egy for the GPFN, unlike that of the GPFG, does 
not seek the widest diversification of investments 
possible. In isolation, permitting investment in 
unlisted real estate and infrastructure may help 
diversify risk. However, improved diversification of 
risk may also be achieved by other, simpler means. 
The state already has substantial real estate and 
infrastructure holdings in Norway. Accordingly, 
there is little rationale for the state investing part of 

the GPFN in unlisted real estate and infrastructure 
to improve risk diversification.

The Norwegian market for infrastructure 
investments is small and underdeveloped. Any 
investments in infrastructure by the GPFN will 
most likely result from the sale of such assets by 
central or local government. Such a transfer of 
ownership will leave the state’s overall risk level 
unchanged, and usually generate significant trans-
action costs. 

Unlisted investments normally require differ-
ent, more specialised expertise than listed invest-
ments. It is uncertain whether Folketrygdfondet 
can realise economies of scale or has other advan-
tages for such investments.

Following an overall assessment, the Ministry 
of Finance is not prepared to permit the GPFN to 
be invested in unlisted real estate and infrastruc-
ture.

Unlisted investments in the GPFN are dis-
cussed in chapter 5.

New reporting and risk management requirements for 
the GPFG

The Government aims to promote the greatest 
possible transparency in the management of the 
GPFG. The Fund is currently viewed as one of the 
world’s most transparent. Transparency is both of 
independent value and vital for the governing and 
supervision of the Fund.

The scope for deviations from the benchmark 
index was increased somewhat on 1 February 
2016, as proposed in last year’s white paper and 
endorsed by the Storting. In conjunction with this, 
the Ministry of Finance has introduced a new limit 
on risk and more detailed reporting requirements 
relating to the risk assumed by Norges Bank in its 
active management. Norges Bank’s Executive 
Board is now required to cap the negative excess 
return which in extreme cases may be expected 
from the Bank’s active management strategies.

Transparency facilitates a broad discussion 
and understanding of the management of the 
Fund, and provides a foundation for evaluating 
Norges Bank’s management performance. Trans-
parency may also strengthen the ability to pursue 
profitable long-term strategies in periods with per-
formance below that of the benchmark index. The 
mandate now requires, inter alia, reporting on 
investment strategies, the sources of positive and 
negative excess returns, and the results achieved 
under all investment strategies entailing substan-
tial costs or high relative risk. Furthermore, the 
Executive Board of Norges Bank has to issue a 
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public assessment of its management perfor-
mance. The new reporting requirements apply 
starting with the 2015 annual report.

Reporting and risk management requirements 
are discussed in section 3.4.

Responsible management

The Government Pension Fund has overarching 
financial objectives, but also aims to be a responsi-
ble investor. Strong long-term financial returns 
depend on well-functioning markets and a sustain-
able development. This applies particularly to 
large, diversified, long-term investors whose 
returns are primarily linked to value creation in 
the global economy.

The mandates for the GPFN and GPFG refer 
to internationally recognised responsible manage-
ment standards. Norges Bank and Folketrygdfon-
det exercise ownership rights on behalf of the two 
funds. Important instruments in this context 
include the promotion of international standards 
and research, company dialogue, clarification of 
expectations and the submitting of proposals and 
voting at general meetings. In February 2016, 
Norges Bank published an expectation document 
on human rights.

The Ministry of Finance has adopted ethically 
motivated guidelines for the observation and 
exclusion of companies from the GPFG. Certain 
criteria exclude companies based on their prod-
ucts, for example tobacco, weapons and coal. 
Other exclusion criteria are based on conduct, 
such as serious human rights violations and 
severe environmental damage. The Council on 
Ethics recommends companies for exclusion or 
observation, and the final decision rests with 
Norges Bank. Until 2015, such decisions were 
made by the Ministry of Finance. Four companies 
were excluded in 2015.

In 2016, two new criteria have been included in 
the guidelines for observation and exclusion, 
reflecting the Storting’s feedback on the report on 
the Fund for 2014 and on the National Budget 2016. 
One criterion targets conduct resulting in unac-
ceptable greenhouse gas emissions at an aggregate 
company level. The other criterion is product-
based, and targets mining companies and energy 

producers who derive 30 percent or more of their 
revenues from thermal coal or base 30 percent or 
more of their operations on thermal coal.

As part of the GPFG’s responsible manage-
ment efforts, separate mandates have been 
adopted for environment-related investments. 
Around NOK 54 billion was invested under these 
mandates as at the end of 2015. In recent years, 
the returns under the environment-related man-
dates have been lower than the return on the 
Fund as a whole.

Responsible management is discussed in chap-
ter 6. The discussion includes an evaluation of the 
new division of responsibility for observation and 
exclusion of companies from the GPFG.

Two government commissions

In January 2016, the Government appointed a 
commission mandated to assess the equity por-
tion of the GPFG. The equity portion is the deci-
sion with the greatest impact on the Fund’s overall 
long-term risk and return. The commission is to 
submit its report by 15 October 2016. The Minis-
try of Finance intends to circulate the report 
through a public consultation. An assessment will 
also be sought from Norges Bank. The Ministry 
aims to discuss the question of the GPFG’s equity 
portion in the report on the Fund to be published 
in the spring of 2017.

Norges Bank has developed a competent 
organisation and delivered sound long-term oper-
ational results in the management of the GPFG. 
Nevertheless, the evolution of the investment 
strategy and growth in assets under management 
are making new demands on Fund governance. 
Last year, the Government initiated the appoint-
ment of a new deputy governor at Norges Bank 
with a particular responsibility for asset manage-
ment. Further, a commission was appointed to 
review the Norges Bank Act (the Central Bank 
Act) and the Bank’s governance structure. The 
mandate includes a review of the management of 
the GPFG. The commission will present its rec-
ommendations in the spring of 2017.

The two commissions are discussed further in 
sections 3.5 and 3.6.



2015–2016 Meld. St. 23 Report to the Storting (white paper) 15
The management of the Government Pension Fund in 2015
2  The Government Pension Fund Global: 
strategy and performance

2.1 The current investment strategy

2.1.1 Background

The state saves its net cash flow from petroleum 
activities in the Government Pension Fund Global 
(GPFG). Saving in the Fund is fully integrated 
with the fiscal budget; see Box 2.1. The annual 
withdrawal from the Fund covers the non-oil defi-
cit in the fiscal budget. Over time, the deficit shall 
equal the expected real rate of return on the 
GPFG. The fiscal policy framework supports the 
Fund’s long time horizon.

The objective for the investments of the GPFG 
is to achieve the highest possible financial return, 
given a moderate level of risk. The investment 
strategy is expressed in the management mandate 
for the GPFG issued by the Ministry of Finance. 
Norges Bank carries out the operational manage-
ment of the Fund in accordance with the mandate.

The Government is committed to ensuring the 
highest possible transparency in the management 
of the GPFG. Transparency is both an important 
general principle and a prerequisite for wide-
spread confidence in the management of Nor-
way’s national savings. Important decisions are 
endorsed by the Storting. This approach facili-
tates consistent adherence to the long-term 
investment strategy, also during periods of finan-
cial market turbulence.

2.1.2 The academic foundation

The investment strategy is derived from the pur-
pose of the Fund and its distinctive characteristics, 
the investment beliefs of the Ministry and the com-
parative advantages of the asset manager. The 
strategy has been developed over time based on 
research, practical experience and technical assess-
ments. The strategy is summarised in Figure 2.2.

The investment strategy is premised on finan-
cial markets largely being well-functioning. 
Accordingly, new publicly available information is 

rapidly reflected in financial asset prices. Competi-
tion between market participants is high. Hence, 
systematically outperforming the general market 
or average investor in well-functioning markets 
will be difficult. To the extent that some investors 
may have distinctive characteristics or advantages 
which allow them to achieve an excess return 
over time, this requires market knowledge and 
proximity.

A further key element of the strategy for the 
GPFG is that risk can be reduced through broad 
diversification. Fund investments are currently 
distributed across equities, fixed-income securi-
ties and real estate in numerous countries. Within 
each country, investments are spread across dif-
ferent sectors and companies. Such diversification 
reduces exposure to events that impact individual 
stocks or markets.

However, it is not possible to eliminate all risk 
through diversification. According to financial the-
ory, investors can expect to be compensated for 
accepting risk that cannot be eliminated through 
broad diversification, referred to as systematic 
risk. This expected excess return is termed a risk 
premium. An example is the return achieved in 
stock markets. Investors will expect to be com-
pensated for bearing stock-market risk in the form 
of a higher return than on a risk-free capital 
investment. However, the size of the excess 
return – or equity premium – is uncertain and 
may vary over time. Investors will similarly expect 
compensation for the risk of a borrower defaulting 
on its obligations (credit premium).

Investors have differing time horizons and 
capacity to bear risk. An investor’s choice of port-
folio composition determines the expected risk 
and return level. An investor must accept addi-
tional risk in order to achieve a higher expected 
return over time. Increased risk also means larger 
fluctuations in the value of investments and a 
higher loss probability. The proportion invested in 
equities has the greatest impact on overall risk 
and return of the GPFG.
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Box 2.1 The framework for accrual and spending of petroleum revenues

The accrual of capital in the GPFG is largely a 
conversion of oil and gas resources on the Nor-
wegian continental shelf into foreign financial 
assets. This conversion separates the net petro-
leum revenues from the state’s other income. 
There are, at the same time, considerable varia-
tions in such revenue streams, and they will even-
tually cease. Figure 2.1 illustrates the relationship 
between the GPFG and the fiscal budget. 

A key objective of the GPFG and the fiscal 
policy guideline is to facilitate permanently high 
value creation and stable development in the 

mainland economy. To this end, the state’s net 
cash flow from petroleum activities is trans-
ferred to the Fund in full. An amount is with-
drawn from the Fund annually pursuant to a res-
olution passed by the Storting to cover the non-
oil budget deficit. This approach makes petro-
leum revenue spending in the fiscal budget a vis-
ible part of an integrated budget process. As 
long as the state does not accumulate debt by 
borrowing to fund expenditure, the GPFG’s cap-
ital will reflect true financial saving on the part 
of the state.

Figure 2.1 The relationship between the GPFG and the fiscal budget

Source: Ministry of Finance.

The fiscal policy guideline is aimed at phasing 
petroleum revenues gradually into the Norwe-
gian economy, more or less in line with develop-
ments in the expected real rate of return on the 
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pling spending from accrual shelters the fiscal 
budget from petroleum revenue fluctuations. At 

the same time, wealth is preserved over time, 
thus serving to safeguard welfare for future gen-
erations. Whilst the capital of the Fund can only 
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The state is a large, long-term investor through 
the GPFG. The Fund continues to receive substan-
tial petroleum revenue inflows, and has no clearly 
defined liabilities. It is considered unlikely that the 
state will make large, unanticipated withdrawals 
from the Fund. The size of the Fund allows for eco-
nomies of scale to be exploited in management.

However, the size of the Fund presents various 
challenges. For example, a large fund may find it 
difficult to make major portfolio adjustments 
within a short space of time. It may also prove 
difficult to scale up individual investment strate-
gies, implying that some strategies will be unavail-
able to the GPFG.

The distinctive characteristics of the Fund 
mean that it is better placed than many other 
investors to accept risk that requires a long time 
horizon. This is utilised to, inter alia, harvest the 
expected excess return from investing in equities.

Delegation of authority is commonplace in the 
financial sector. For example, the shareholders in 

a listed company elect a board of directors which 
in turn makes management responsible for the 
day-to-day operations. Investors delegate import-
ant decisions to managers. Delegation may result 
in situations where different stakeholders have 
conflicting interests and asymmetric information. 
These are often referred to as principal-agent 
problems. Good governance and supervision may 
help alleviate such problems. Among other things, 
good corporate governance can help ensure that 
management acts in accordance with investor 
interests.

The GPFG has an overarching financial objec-
tive, but shall also be a responsible investor. For a 
large, long-term fund like the GPFG, with owner-
ship shares in several thousand companies world-
wide, responsible management may be in the 
Fund’s own interest. An individual company may 
profit by ignoring serious harm to others (exter-
nalities). For the GPFG, however, such a gain may 
be accompanied by lower returns on other parts 

Figure 2.2 Overview of investment beliefs and distinctive characteristics of the Fund underpinning the 
investment strategy for the Government Pension Fund Global

Source: The Ministry of Finance.
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of the portfolio, now or in the future. Strong finan-
cial returns over time are considered dependent 
on well-functioning markets and a sustainable 
development. Responsible management is dis-
cussed further in chapter 6. 

2.1.3 Main features of the investment strategy

The management mandate from the Ministry of 
Finance expresses the long-term investment strat-
egy for the Fund, including a strategic benchmark 
index comprising equities, fixed-income and real 
estate. Equities and fixed-income investments 
have separate benchmark indices composed 
exclusively of listed equities and bonds. For real 
estate, a return target has been adopted which is 
intended to reflect developments in the unlisted 
real estate market.

The strategic benchmark index defines a fixed 
equity portion of 60 percent. The equity portion 
has been selected on the basis of the long-term 
trade-off between expected risk and return. The 
real estate portfolio is in a development phase, 
and may account for up to five percent of the Fund 
under the present mandate. Fixed-income securi-
ties account for the remainder of the strategic 
benchmark index. The Fund’s overall risk level is 
primarily determined by the equity portion.

Stock and bond prices fluctuate considerably, 
and will often develop differently over time. Given 
these constant price changes, maintaining a fixed 

equity portion is considered inexpedient, not least 
because this would entail frequent transactions 
and unnecessary transaction costs for the Fund. 
The mandate for the GPFG therefore stipulates an 
actual benchmark index which may deviate from 
the strategic index subject to a specified limit. Fig-
ure 2.3 shows the composition of the strategic and 
actual benchmark indices as at yearend 2015. 

If the equity portion in the actual benchmark 
index is materially higher or lower than the stra-
tegic allocation, this may alter the risk and 
return characteristics of the benchmark. A rule 
has therefore been adopted on the rebalancing of 
the equity portion in the actual benchmark index 
when deviations from 60 percent exceed four 
percentage points. Rebalancing also gives the 
investment strategy a certain counter-cyclical 
element, in that over time the Fund purchases 
the asset class which in relative terms has fallen 
substantially in value and sells the asset class 
which has risen strongly in relative terms. Rebal-
ancing has historically helped boost the return 
on the GPFG.

The underlying equity and fixed-income 
benchmarks are based on broad, global indices 
from leading index providers. The indices provide 
an unambiguous, detailed description of how the 
Fund may in principle be invested across different 
sectors, individual companies and bonds.

The benchmark index adopted for the Fund’s 
equity investments is based on an index prepared 

Figure 2.3 Composition of the strategic and actual benchmark indices for the GPFG at yearend 2015

Sources: Norges Bank and the Ministry of Finance.
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by FTSE Russell, and includes all countries, apart 
from Norway, classified by the index provider as 
developed markets, advanced emerging markets 
or secondary emerging markets. The fixed-
income benchmark is based on indices provided 
by Barclays. It comprises 70 percent government 
bonds and 30 percent corporate bonds, excluding 
Norwegian securities. 

The distribution of equity investments across 
countries and geographical regions is based on 
the size of the listed stock markets in the coun-
tries included in the index. The same applies to 
corporate bonds. In the case of government 
bonds, the starting point is the relative size of the 
economies as measured by GDP. The distribu-
tions have been adjusted in some areas to take 
into account factors such as ensuring a broad geo-
graphical diversification.

The indices for equities and fixed-income 
instruments incorporate thousands of individual 
equities and bonds, and entail diversification of 
investments across numerous securities. This 
helps improve the risk-return ratio of the Fund. 
The index providers have adopted detailed rules 
on the inclusion of securities in the indices. This 
also means that suppliers have made some subjec-
tive choices as to how markets are represented in 
the indices.

Investment risk and return in the GPFG 
largely follow developments in global markets 
for listed equities and bonds. This index-tracking 
strategy facilitates a broad distribution of 
investments with the desired risk level at low 
administrative cost. The distinctive characteris-
tics of the GPFG, such as its long time horizon 
and size, can also be exploited to achieve a 
higher return.

Deviation from the benchmark index requires 
market knowledge and proximity. Hence, the 
implementation of such strategies has been dele-
gated to Norges Bank, which is permitted to devi-
ate somewhat from the benchmark index subject 
to restrictions set in the mandate from the Minis-
try of Finance. The Bank utilises the scope for 
deviations from the benchmark index to achieve 
broader diversification, to tilt the portfolio 
towards systematic factors and in the selection of 
securities. The limits are also used to meet 
requirements in the mandate relating to environ-
ment-related investments and fiscal strength of 
the government bond portfolio. The scope for 
deviations is specified in terms of expected track-
ing error, i.e. how much the return on the GPFG 
is expected to deviate from the benchmark index 
in a normal year.

The mandate also lays down additional invest-
ment guidelines. For example, Norges Bank may 
invest outside Norway only, only in tradable 
bonds and only in equities which are listed or 
where the company board has expressed an inten-
tion to seek such a listing on a regulated and rec-
ognised market place. The Fund may only own up 
to 10 percent of the voting shares in one company. 
There are also provisions on risk, responsible 
management and environment-related invest-
ment mandates. Norges Bank is required to 
report on a wide range of matters, and manage-
ment performance is measured against the actual 
benchmark index.

At the end of 2015, the GPFG’s equity invest-
ments encompassed more than 9,000 securities, 
while the fixed-income portfolio included bonds 
from 1,278 different issuers. Overall, investments 
were linked to 78 countries.

The mandate also stipulates that Norges Bank 
shall invest up to five percent of the Fund in real 
estate. The unlisted space accounts for over 80 per-
cent of the investable real estate market, although 
in this part of the market risk cannot be widely 
diversified through broad ownership and small 
ownership stakes. Unlisted investments generally 
require investors to be more active and involved in 
the operation and development of assets. The mar-
ket value of such investments is normally estab-
lished by appraisals, making it more difficult to 
measure risk and return on an ongoing basis. 
Norges Bank’s experiences with unlisted real 
estate and the Ministry of Finance’s plans for 
changes to the framework for the unlisted invest-
ments of the Fund are discussed in chapter 3.

The mandate tasks Norges Bank with seeking 
the highest possible return after costs, measured 
in the currency basket of the Fund. The currency 
basket corresponds to the currency composition 
of the benchmark index for equities and fixed-
income. The management assignment is consis-
tent with the objective of cost-efficiency. At the 
same time, the aim is to secure high net returns, 
not low costs as such. Comparisons with other 
large funds show that Norges Bank’s asset man-
agement costs are low as a percentage of capital 
under management.

2.1.4 Governance structure

According to the Government Pension Fund Act 
the Ministry of Finance has the overall responsibil-
ity for the management of the GPFG, whilst Norges 
Bank is responsible for the operational manage-
ment. A management mandate issued by the Minis-
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try sets out the investment strategy and the limits 
on the Bank’s management. A clear, robust gover-
nance structure is important for the implementa-
tion of the strategy and to reduce potential conflicts 
of interest, also known as principal-agent problems.

The governance structure must on the one 
hand ensure that the asset owners – represented 
by the Government and the Storting – support the 
strategy and risk profile of the Fund. On the other 
hand, sufficient authority must be delegated to 
allow ongoing operational management decisions 
to be made close to the markets in which the 
Fund is invested. This balance is sought by ensur-
ing that the Government and the Storting endorse 
major strategic choices prior to implementation, 
including through the deliberation of the Storting 
of the annual white paper on the Government Pen-
sion Fund. The mandate issued to Norges Bank 
by the Ministry stipulates general principles and 
regulations.

The management of the GPFG is based on the 
assignment of different roles to the Storting, the 
Ministry of Finance, the Executive Board of 
Norges Bank and Norges Bank Investment Man-
agement (NBIM). A clear division of roles between 
the various administrative governance levels, from 
the Storting down to the individual portfolio man-
ager, also clarifies responsibilities. Tasks and 

authorisations are delegated downwards in the sys-
tem, whereas performance and risk are reported 
upward; see Figure 2.4. Regulations necessarily 
become more detailed further down in the hierar-
chy. Each part of the system has its own supervi-
sory unit which receives reports from and super-
vises its subordinate unit. The exception to this 
principle is that the Executive Board of Norges 
Bank is subject to the supervision of the Supervi-
sory Council, a governing body appointed by the 
Storting that also appoints the Bank’s auditor.

Over time, there should be an interaction 
between the Fund’s governance system and 
investment strategy. The investment strategy 
must take into account the distinctive institu-
tional characteristics of the governance struc-
ture. For example, the need for political endorse-
ment makes it difficult to introduce investment 
strategies that require frequent and rapid deci-
sions on matters affecting the overall risk level of 
the Fund. On the other hand, the governance 
system must also be capable of adapting to new 
investment forms that seek to exploit the distinc-
tive characteristics of the Fund to further 
improve the trade-off between risk and return. 
One example in this regard is increased delega-
tion in connection with the GPFG’s unlisted real 
estate investments. 

Figure 2.4 Governance structure of the GPFG

Source: Ministry of Finance.
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2.2 Performance

Norges Bank’s annual reporting for 2015 encom-
passes several publications in addition to the ordi-
nary annual report. The Bank has published an 
expanded report on responsible investment and, 
for the first time, a separate report on perfor-
mance and risk. These publications and further 
information are available on the Bank’s website.

This section discusses the main points and 
the Ministry of Finance’s assessment of the per-
formance achieved. The Bank will issue an 
expanded report on the real estate investments 
in April.

2.2.1 Market developments

In 2015, financial markets were characterised by 
falling oil prices and weaker expectations for 
emerging-market economic growth. Elements of 
uncertainty included the growth prospects of the 
Chinese economy. Exchange rates also fluctuated 
considerably during the year. In the summer of 
2015, the US Federal Reserve indicated a willing-
ness to raise interest rates, but weaker economic 
growth both in the US and internationally delayed 
the rate hike until December. Government bond 
yields with long maturities remained low in most 
developed economies throughout the year, con-
tributing to low bond returns.

The global stock market return was around 
two percent measured in local currencies.1

Strong stock market performance in the first 
quarter was followed by two quarters of negative 
returns, although performance picked up some-
what in the final quarter. The return in devel-
oped markets was approximately three percent, 
while the return in emerging markets was 
around minus five percent measured in local cur-
rency. In addition, depreciation of several emerg-
ing-market currencies implied that the return dif-
ference was even greater measured in common 
currency.

2.2.2 Market value

At the end of 2015, the market value of the 
GPFG totalled NOK 7,471 billion after deducting 
for asset management costs. The investments 
comprised NOK 4,572 billion in equities, NOK 
2,668 billion in fixed-income securities and NOK 
235 billion in real estate. Investment in green 
bonds amounted to approximately NOK 7 bil-
lion. Figure 2.5 shows the distribution of the 
Fund’s investments in equities, fixed-income 
securities and real estate, as well as the develop-
ment in the market value of the Fund over time. 

1 Measured by means of the MSCI ACWI IMI global equities 
index.

Figure 2.5 Development in the market value of the GPFG since 1996 and distribution of actual investments 
at the end of 2015 

Sources: Norges Bank and Ministry of Finance. 
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In 2015, the market value increased by NOK 
1,044 billion; see Figure 2.6. More than half of 
this increase is due to depreciation of the Nor-
wegian krone (NOK). Since inception, the Nor-
wegian krone depreciation has boosted the 
Fund’s value by NOK 1,331 billion. A weaker 
krone does not influence the Fund’s interna-
tional purchasing power. It is to be expected that 
exchange rates fluctuate over time.

The Fund received net inflows of NOK 46 bil-
lion in 2015, the lowest annual inflow since 1999. 
According to the National Budget 2016, 2016 is 
forecasted to be the first year in which some of the 
Fund’s current returns will have to be used to 
cover the non-oil deficit in the fiscal budget.

2.2.3 Aggregate return 

The return figures in this section are measured in 
the currency basket of the Fund. Norges Bank is 
mandated to seek the highest possible return in 
the currency basket, which also reflects the 
Fund’s international purchasing power.

In 2015, the aggregate return on the Fund was 
2.7 percent before the deduction of asset manage-
ment costs; cf. Table 2.1. Since 1998, the GPFG 
has achieved an average annual nominal return of 
5.6 percent. The annual return on the Fund as 
measured in other currencies is specified in 
Appendix 2.

The equity portfolio produced a return of 3.8 
percent in 2015. Investments in Asia and Oceania 
delivered the highest returns, followed by Euro-
pean and US shares. The return in emerging mar-
kets was significantly lower than that in developed 
markets. Since 1998, the equity portfolio has gen-
erated an average annual return of 5.7 percent.

The fixed-income portfolio achieved a return 
of 0.3 percent in 2015. Corporate bonds and infla-
tion-linked bonds produced the highest return, 
whilst securitised and government-related bonds 
delivered a negative return. The fixed-income 
portfolio has generated an average annual return 
of 4.9 percent since 1998.

The return on the real estate portfolio totalled 
10.0 percent in 2015. The listed real estate invest-
ments generated a return of 7.8 percent, whilst 
the unlisted real estate investments produced a 
return of 10.8 percent. Of the aggregate real 
estate investment return, 4.1 percentage points 
constitute net rental income, 0.1 percentage 
points represent currency effects and the remain-
der comprises changes in the value of properties 
and debt. Transaction costs reduced the return by 
0.2 percentage points. The Fund’s first unlisted 
real estate investment was made in the first quar-
ter of 2011. The average annual return on the real 
estate portfolio from 1 April 2011 up to and includ-
ing 2015 was 6.9 percent. 

Figure 2.6 Development in the market value of the GPFG in 2015 and since inception in 1996. NOK billion 

Sources: Norges Bank and Ministry of Finance. 
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Real return and net current revenues 

The real rate of return after asset management 
costs was 1.8 percent in 2015; see Figure 2.7. The 
average annual net real rate of return since Janu-
ary 1998 is 3.7 percent.

The GPFG received net current revenues of 
NOK 193 billion in 2015, corresponding to 2.8 per-
cent of Fund capital. This represented an increase 
of NOK 35 billion compared to 2014, and com-
prised equity dividends of NOK 107 billion, inter-
est income of NOK 78 billion and NOK 7 billion in 
rental income from unlisted real estate.

2.2.4 Management excess return

Norges Bank is permitted to deviate from the 
benchmark index stipulated by the Ministry of 
Finance subject to the limits set in the manage-
ment mandate for the GPFG. The purpose of 
such deviations is to achieve excess returns and 
to improve the risk-return ratio of the Fund. In 
2015, the return on the Fund’s equities and fixed-
income portfolio was 0.45 percentage points 
higher than the return on the benchmark index; 
see Figure 2.8. The excess return amounted to 
around NOK 30 billion. Since January 1998, 

1 Excess return on the Fund’s equity and fixed-income portfolios.
2 The first real estate investment was made in the first quarter of 2011. The five-year return is the annualised return since 1 April 

2011.
Sources: Norges Bank and Ministry of Finance.

Table 2.1 Return on the GPFG in 2015, in the last 3, 5 and10 years, as well as over the period 1998–2015, 
measured in the currency basket of the Fund and before the deduction of asset management costs.  
Annual geometric average. Percent

2015
Last 

3 years
Last 

5 years
Last 

10 years 1998–2015

GPFG incl. real estate

Actual portfolio 2.74 8.62 7.21 5.34 5.64

Inflation 0.86 1.06 1.60 1.84 1.78

Asset management costs 0.06 0.06 0.06 0.09 0.09

Net real return 1.80 7.42 5.46 3.35 3.70

Excess return (percentage points)1 0.45 0.21 0.14 0.06 0.26

Equity portfolio

Actual portfolio 3.83 12.26 8.77 5.56 5.68

Benchmark index 3.00 11.86 8.56 5.34 5.20

Excess return (percentage points) 0.83 0.40 0.21 0.22 0.47

Fixed-income portfolio

Actual portfolio 0.33 2.39 4.15 4.13 4.87

Benchmark index 0.57 2.61 4.24 4.08 4.73

Excess return (percentage points) -0.24 -0.22 -0.09 0.04 0.14

Real estate portfolio

Actual portfolio2 10.00 10.73 6.91
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Norges Bank has outperformed the benchmark 
index by an average of 0.26 percentage points a 
year. The total excess return over this period 
amounts to approximately NOK 82 billion.

The Ministry of Finance considers gross 
excess return to be a reasonable estimate of net 

value added through Norges Bank’s management 
activities. The ratio between these quantities is 
discussed in a separate thematic article; see chap-
ter 7.

Equities and fixed-income securities

In 2015, Norges Bank’s management secured a 
return on the equity portfolio which was 0.83 per-
centage points higher than the return on the 
benchmark index adopted by the Ministry. The 
return on the fixed-income portfolio was 0.24 per-
centage points lower than the return on the 
benchmark index.

According to Norges Bank, the total excess 
return on the Fund in 2015 (0.45 percentage 
points) stems from the following sources:
– The internal reference portfolio set by the Bank

reduced the return by 0.12 percentage points. 
The internal reference portfolio is based on the 
benchmark index defined by the Ministry of 
Finance, but is tailored to exploit the distinctive 
characteristics of the Fund and, over time, 
improve the trade-off between risk and return. 
A particular factor contributing to the low 
return was a higher proportion of emerging-
market government bonds relative to the 
benchmark index. Another negative factor was 
a higher proportion of so-called value compa-
nies in the equity portfolio, i.e. companies with 
low prices relative to key figures such as earn-
ings and book equity.

Figure 2.7 Real rate of return on the GPFG after the 
deduction of asset management costs, measured in 
the Fund’s currency basket. Percent 

Sources: Norges Bank and Ministry of Finance.
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– Allocation strategies made a positive contribu-
tion of 0.15 percentage points. Examples of 
such strategies include a higher or lower 
equity portion than implied by the benchmark 
index, over- or underweighting of individual 
countries or sectors, and selecting a different 
duration for fixed-income investments than in 
the benchmark index.

– Security selection increased the return by 0.24 
percentage points. Selection of securities 
entails investing a larger or smaller proportion 
of the Fund in individual companies or individ-
ual bonds than implied by the benchmark 
index, based on fundamental analysis of the 
companies. The Bank employs both internal 
and external managers to perform such secu-
rity selection.

– Market exposure made a positive contribution of 
0.14 percentage points. This includes the 
Bank’s strategies for efficient securities trad-
ing. The need for securities trading arises in 
connection with, for example, changes in the 
composition of the benchmark index, injection 
of new capital and other strategies employed 
by the Bank.

– Securities lending also contributed positively, 
with 0.05 percentage points. Such revenues are 
payments Norges Bank receives for lending 
securities to other investors.

Real estate

The return on Norges Bank’s real estate invest-
ments is measured against a global real estate 
index, the IPD index. MSCI prepares an annual 
comparison commissioned by the Ministry of 
Finance. The IPD index is only available with a 
time lag, since it is based on reported figures 
from a large number of real estate investors. 
Accordingly, no report is at present available for 
2015.

The most recent available report relates to 
2014. In 2014, the return on the GPFG’s unlisted 
real estate investments was 0.6 percentage points 
higher than the return on the IPD index when all 
return figures are converted into Norwegian 
kroner. The real estate investments of the GPFG 
achieved a higher increase in property value 
than the real estate included in the IPD index, 
whereas average rental income was somewhat 
lower. Exchange rate fluctuations made a nega-
tive contribution. The report is available on the 
Ministry of Finance’s website.

Environment-related investment mandates

In 2009, it was decided to establish specific man-
dates for environment-related investments within 
the GPFG. The investments form part of the 
active management performed by Norges Bank 
within the limits stipulated in the mandate. The 
market value shall normally be in the range of 
NOK 30 – 60 billion. At yearend 2015, the invest-
ments totalled NOK 53.8 billion, and were spread 
across 224 companies. Norges Bank has given an 
account of the investments in its report on 
responsible investment, published in February 
2016.

The environmental mandates entail that the 
Fund invests a greater relative proportion in envi-
ronment-related companies and industries than 
implied by the benchmark index. This reduces 
Norges Bank’s scope for deviation from the 
benchmark index. Most of such investments are 
in listed equities, but in 2015 Norges Bank also 
established mandates for investments in so-called 
green bonds.

The return on the environmental mandates 
was 1.1 percent in 2015, compared to 3.8 percent 
on the equity investments and 2.7 percent on the 
Fund as a whole. In the period 2010–2015, the 
average annual return on the mandates is calcu-
lated at 2.8 percent, compared to 9.5 percent on 
the equity investments and 7.6 percent on the 
Fund in total. The effect of the environment-
related investments on the overall return on the 
Fund depends on the characteristics of the invest-
ments reduced to free up capital for such man-
dates, but the environment-related investments 
have when taken in isolation reduced the return 
both in 2015 and since 2010.

2.2.5 Risk-adjusted return

The limit on expected tracking error permits 
Norges Bank to adopt a different level of risk than 
implied by the benchmark index in order to 
secure an excess return. Deviations from the 
benchmark index may entail somewhat higher or 
lower absolute risk for the GPFG compared to the 
benchmark index. In financial literature, models 
and measures are used to assess whether an 
investor has been compensated for the risk 
assumed in active management. The Sharpe ratio 
and information ratio are two commonly used 
measures of risk-adjusted returns.
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The literature also employs models to explain 
historical results where a distinction is made 
between returns achieved by the manager 
through the exposure to systematic risk and 
returns stemming from other deviations. Such 
methods are associated with considerable uncer-
tainty; see the discussion in section 7.4. The Min-
istry of Finance regularly reviews the manage-
ment of the GPFG, analysing and evaluating risk-
taking attributable to active management. 

Sharpe ratio

The Sharpe ratio measures the return achieved in 
excess of the risk-free rate relative to total port-
folio risk, as measured by fluctuations in the 
aggregate return on the portfolio.

A high Sharpe ratio means that the investor 
has been well compensated for the assumed risk, 
but provides no insight into the absolute return 
level. If the manager’s deviations from the bench-
mark index entail low aggregate risk in the portfo-

lio, a lower return than that of the benchmark 
index can produce a high Sharpe ratio.

In 2015, the calculated Sharpe ratio was 0.32 for 
the GPFG’s portfolio of equities and fixed-income 
securities and 0.27 for the benchmark index. The 
difference between the two figures is 0.05; see 
Table 2.2 and Figure 2.9A. This indicates that in 
2015 Norges Bank’s active management helped 
secure a better compensation for the portfolio 
aggregate risk than would have been achieved by 
investing in line with the benchmark index. How-
ever, the calculation is based on a limited number 
of observations, and is therefore uncertain. 

In the period 1998–2015, the Sharpe ratio was 
0.49 for the GPFG’s portfolio of equities and fixed-
income securities and 0.48 for the benchmark 
index. The difference between the two Sharpe 
ratios is small, primarily owing to the deviations 
implemented in active management being small. 
The actual portfolio has demonstrated somewhat 
larger return fluctuations than the benchmark 
index, but has also achieved a somewhat higher 

Table 2.2 Absolute and relative risk measures for the GPFG, in the last 3, 5 and 10 years, as well as over the 
period 1998–2015. Figures based on monthly observations

2015
Last 

3 years
Last 

5 years
Last 

10 years 1998–2015

GPFG excl. real estate

Absolute volatility (percent ) 8.88 6.80 7.11 8.93 7.58

Tracking error (percentage points) 0.32 0.40 0.38 0.90 0.72

Sharpe ratio difference 0.05 0.01 0.00 -0.02 0.01

Information ratio 1.39 0.51 0.37 0.12 0.39

Equity portfolio

Absolute volatility (percent ) 13.67 10.24 11.65 15.12 15.13

Tracking error (percentage points) 0.36 0.47 0.45 0.75 0.82

Sharpe ratio difference 0.06 0.02 0.00 0.01 0.03

Information ratio 2.28 0.80 0.49 0.36 0.67

Fixed-income portfolio

Absolute volatility (percent ) 2.86 2.64 2.57 3.53 3.38

Tracking error (percentage points) 0.50 0.54 0.47 1.43 1.08

Sharpe ratio difference -0.07 0.01 0.10 -0.06 0.00

Information ratio -0.49 -0.41 -0.19 0.03 0.13
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return. Thus, the risk-return ratio has been 
approximately equal. 

Information ratio 

Whereas the Sharpe ratio measures the return 
achieved in excess of the risk-free rate relative to 
aggregate portfolio risk, the information ratio mea-
sures the excess return achieved in proportion to 
the relative risk assumed. The mandate restricts 
Norges Bank’s deviations from the benchmark 
index by means of a limit on expected tracking 
error. The information ratio is therefore relevant in 
assessing Norges Bank’s active management.

In 2015, the information ratio was 1.39 for the 
equity and fixed-income portfolios, 2.28 for the 
equity portfolio and -0.49 for the fixed-income 
portfolio. Norges Bank’s management in 2015 
helped secure compensation for the relative risk 
taken in the equity portfolio as measured by the 
information ratio, but not in the fixed-income port-
folio. The calculation is based on a limited number 
of observations, and is therefore uncertain.

In the period 1998–2015, the information 
ratio was 0.39 for the equity and fixed-income 
portfolios, 0.67 for the equity portfolio and 0.13 
for the fixed-income portfolio; see Figure 2.9B. 
Norges Bank’s management contributed to the 
Fund being compensated for the relative risk 
taken during this period, however, the Fund 

received a higher reward for the risk taken in 
the equity portfolio than in the fixed-income 
portfolio.

2.2.6 Risk and limits

Absolute volatility

Norges Bank has calculated that the expected fluc-
tuations in the Fund’s equity and fixed-income 
investments totalled 10.4 percent at the end of 
2015, or about NOK 780 billion, measured by stan-
dard deviation. Assuming a normally distributed 
return figure, the fluctuations are expected to 
exceed one standard deviation in one out of three 
years. Moreover, according to estimates from the 
Bank, the Fund may lose around 24 percent of its 
value over a period of one year if the market expe-
riences a sharp downturn. This amounts to almost 
NOK 1,800 billion.

Analyses of historical fluctuations based on 
monthly figures show that the standard devia-
tion of the GPFG’s equity and fixed-income 
investments totalled 8.9 percent in 2015, while 
the standard deviation of the return on the 
benchmark index was 8.8 percent. Hence, 
Norges Bank’s active management has contrib-
uted to somewhat higher fluctuations in the 
return on the Fund than in the return on the 
benchmark index.

Figure 2.9 Sharpe ratio difference and information ratio for the GPFG’s equity portfolio and fixed-income 
portfolio

Sources: Norges Bank and Ministry of Finance. 
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The standard deviation of the return on the 
Fund’s equity and fixed-income benchmark indi-
ces has varied over time and increased during 
periods of elevated market uncertainty. Typically, 
the fluctuations have been somewhat higher than 
in the benchmark index; see Figure 2.10A. How-
ever, analyses show that 99.4 percent of the fluctu-
ations in the return on the Fund are due to fluctua-
tions in the return on the benchmark index. The 
deviations from the benchmark index imple-
mented by Norges Bank explain only 0.6 percent 
of the return fluctuations. 

Relative risk 

In 2015, Norges Bank utilised only part of the 
scope for deviations from the index, and the Bank 
has estimated the expected tracking error at year-
end at 0.3 percentage points. Based on the develop-
ment of the relative return delivered in 2015, the 
realised tracking error for the equity and fixed-
income investments has also been estimated at 0.3 
percentage points. Figure 2.10B shows the devel-
opment of the realised tracking error over time.

Expected tracking error is affected by both 
the composition of the Fund’s investments and 
prevailing market conditions. Simulations pre-
pared by the Bank based on the deviations from 
the benchmark index at the end of 2015 and 10 
years of historical prices show that the tracking 

error would have varied between 0.26 and 0.50 
percentage points if three-year rolling periods had 
been used.

Norges Bank has estimated the tracking 
error utilisation of various strategies. The calcu-
lations show that the internal reference portfolio 
set by the Bank utilises 0.19 percentage points of 
total tracking error, allocation around 0.13 per-
centage points, security selection 0.14 percent-
age points and strategies for effective market 
exposure 0.07 percentage points. Low covaria-
tion means that the sum of the individual contri-
butions is greater than total tracking error.

Tracking error measures variation under nor-
mal market conditions. Other measures are more 
relevant for extreme market conditions. Norges 
Bank has estimated that the negative excess 
return from active management in the worst 2.5 
percent of cases amounts to about 1 percentage 
point measured on an annual basis (expected 
shortfall). The estimate is based on market devel-
opments over the past 10 years.

Credit risk

The bonds included in the benchmark index of 
the GPFG have been accorded a credit rating by 
at least one of the leading rating agencies. The 
purpose of credit ratings is to indicate how likely it 
is that the borrower will be able to meet the inter-

Figure 2.10 Rolling 12-month standard deviation of the return on the equity and fixed-income portfolios and 
the benchmark index as well as the standard deviation of the differential return. Percent

Sources: Norges Bank and Ministry of Finance. 
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est costs and repay the loan. The portion of bonds 
with a credit rating of AAA2 or AA increased in 
2015, from 56 percent to 59 percent.

Norges Bank is permitted to invest in bonds 
with low credit ratings – so-called high-yield 
bonds – but these are not included in the bench-
mark index for the GPFG. Asset management 
shall be organised with a view to ensuring that 
such bonds represent no more than five percent of 
the market value of the fixed-income portfolio. 
This ensures that Norges Bank is not forced to 
sell bonds which are downgraded. At the end of 
2015, high-yield bonds accounted for 0.7 percent 
of the Fund’s fixed-income investments, the same 
proportion as at the beginning of the year.

Credit risk in the portfolio was reduced some-
what during the year, measured in terms of credit 
rating.

Individual investments

The role of the Fund is to be a financial investor. It 
seeks to diversify risk across many different secu-
rities. The Ministry of Finance has therefore stip-
ulated that the Fund can hold a maximum of 10 
percent of the voting shares of any one company 
in the equity portfolio. At yearend 2015, its largest 
ownership stake in one single company in the 
equity portfolio was 9.2 percent. The market value 
of the Fund’s largest investment in a single com-
pany, measured in Norwegian kroner, was NOK 
51 billion.

Limits defined by Norges Bank 

In addition to the limits stipulated in the mandate 
laid down by the Ministry of Finance for the man-
agement of the GPFG, there is also a requirement 
for the Executive Board of Norges Bank to define 
supplementary risk limits for the management of 
the GPFG. The limits set by the Executive Board 
are available on the Bank’s website.

Norges Bank has chosen to invest a smaller por-
tion of the Fund in some companies than implied by 
the benchmark index. In the equity portfolio, the 
overlap with the benchmark index at the end of 
2015 was 82.8 percent. This implies that the total 
underweighting in individual companies rep-

resents 17.2 percent of the value of the equity port-
folio. The funds released through underweighting 
can be used to increase the ownership stakes in 
other companies in the index, or to invest in compa-
nies not included in the index. Norges Bank has 
invested in about 1,500 companies that are not part 
of the index. This serves, when taken in isolation, to 
further diversify investments relative to the bench-
mark index. Among other things, investments have 
been made in companies whose market values or 
liquidity are too low to qualify for inclusion in the 
index, as well as in companies in emerging markets.

2.2.7 Costs

The mandate for the GPFG implies that the actual 
asset management costs of Norges Bank are cov-
ered up to an upper limit, which for 2015 was fixed 
at 9 basis points of the average market value of the 
Fund. One basis point equates to 0.01 percent. For 
2016, the limit has been reduced to eight basis 
points. Norges Bank is also compensated for per-
formance fees to external managers.

Asset management costs, excluding perfor-
mance-based fees to external managers, 
amounted to NOK 3.4 billion in 2015. This corre-
sponds to 4.8 basis points of the average market 
value of the Fund, up from 4.7 basis points in 2014.

Overall asset management costs increased to 
NOK 3.9 billion in 2015, from NOK 3.2 billion in 
2014. According to Norges Bank, the main rea-
sons for the cost increase were Norwegian kroner 
depreciation, an increase in the number of 
employees and higher external management 
costs due to an increase in the number of man-
dates and externally managed assets. Measured 
as a proportion of capital under management, the 
total costs amounted to 5.7 basis points in 2015, 
down from 5.9 basis points in 2014. Operational 
and administrative costs are incurred by subsid-
iaries established in connection with the Fund’s 
real estate investments. Pursuant to the account-
ing rules applicable to Norges Bank, these costs 
are deducted from the return on the real estate 
portfolio and are not included in the reimburse-
ment of management costs. In 2015, these costs 
amounted to NOK 95 million, up from NOK 83 
million in 2014. 

Allocation of costs to strategies

In its report on performance and risk published 
on 16 March 2016, Norges Bank has sought to 
allocate the Fund’s costs to different investment 
strategies. The allocation shows that the cost of 

2 Standard & Poor’s rating scale for credit quality is AAA, 
AA, A, BBB, BB, B, CCC, CC, C, D, with AAA as the top rat-
ing. Bonds with a credit rating from AAA to BBB, inclusive, 
are deemed to have high creditworthiness and are termed 
“investment grade” bonds. Bonds with a lower credit rating 
are deemed to have low creditworthiness and are termed 
“high yield” bonds.
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achieving efficient market exposure equated to 
2.2 basis points in 2015. This includes most costs 
relating to the holding of securities. Costs attribut-
able to the internal reference portfolio and alloca-
tion totalled 0.4 basis points, while real estate 
management costs amounted to 0.5 basis points. 
Security selection costs equalled 2.6 basis points, 
split into internal (0.8 basis points) and external 
management (1.8 basis points).

Unlisted real estate 

The Ministry of Finance emphasises that costs 
associated with unlisted investments must be 

reported to allow comparison of the return with 
listed investments. In the case of unlisted real 
estate investments, this entails the deduction of 
several cost components when calculating the 
return achieved by the real estate companies. 
Such costs would also be deducted when calculat-
ing the return on a real estate fund or the profit of 
a listed real estate company.

The Fund’s unlisted real estate investment 
costs generally accrue and are distributed in the 
same way as in comparable organisations which 
invest in and manage real estate. 

Box 2.2 Real estate management costs

Net real estate management costs amounted to 
approximately NOK 3.7 billion last year. The costs 
are split into different components. The vast 
majority of these costs are deducted when calcu-
lating the return on the real estate portfolio, as in 
a listed real estate company or real estate fund.

Property costs relate to the daily operation and 
maintenance of the buildings in the portfolio. 
This includes activities linked to letting, cleaning, 
electricity, environment, health and safety and 
janitorial services, billing and ordinary tenant fol-
low-up. In 2015, these costs totalled NOK 2,224 
million, including NOK 1,329 million reimbursed 
by tenants.

Asset management costs primarily comprise 
fees paid to real estate managers responsible for 
managing one or several buildings and imple-
menting action plans to achieve the highest pos-
sible return at the lowest possible risk. In 2015, 
such costs amounted to NOK 651 million.

Holding structure costs are costs incurred by 
wholly or partly owned real estate companies 
with no employees. The costs relating to wholly 
owned companies primarily consist of audit and 
accounting fees, while the costs linked to partly 
owned companies also include the Fund’s share 
of payments to minority shareholders in the US, 
payment to a partner in the United Kingdom to 
compensate for structural benefit to the GPFG, 
non-refundable value added tax and other costs. 
In 2015, the holding structure costs were NOK 
174 million.

Investment management costs are costs 
incurred by Norges Bank in connection with the 

operation of the organisation which manages 
and invests in unlisted real estate on behalf of 
the Fund. This item includes personnel costs, IT 
costs, consultancy and legal services, the cost of 
office premises and a proportion of Norges 
Bank’s overhead costs. The costs accrue at two 
levels in the organisational structure. The high-
est level constitutes costs incurred by Norges 
Bank Real Estate Management, which manages 
the real estate investments. In 2015, these 
amounted to NOK 333 million. The next level 
comprises operating companies with employees 
in Luxembourg, Tokyo and Singapore. The 
costs at this level are comparable to the costs 
incurred by Norges Bank Real Estate Manage-
ment. In 2015, management costs in operating 
companies totalled NOK 52 million.

Tax costs constitute an important cost compo-
nent in the Fund’s investments. In 2015, the 
Fund had a payable tax cost of NOK 100 million 
in connection with its real estate investments, as 
well as a deferred tax cost of NOK 452 million.

Interest costs accrue on some real estate 
investments which are partly financed by exter-
nal debt. This cost was NOK 666 million in 2015.

Transaction costs are one-off costs linked to 
the purchase or sale of real estate, and include 
stamp duty and other taxes and fees to local 
authorities. This item also includes the cost of 
analyses conducted prior to investment (due dil-
igence). In 2015, stamp duty and other taxes and 
fees linked to transactions totalled NOK 83 mil-
lion, while other transaction costs amounted to 
NOK 245 million.
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International cost comparison

The Canadian company CEM Benchmarking Inc. 
has compared the Fund’s costs in 2014 with the 
costs of over 300 other funds. The comparison 
shows that the GPFG is among the funds with 
the lowest costs in the survey, when costs are 
measured relative to assets under management. 
One reason for this is that the GPFG has few 
investments in high-cost asset classes, such as 
unlisted equities and real estate. Moreover, the 
majority of the Fund is managed internally, by 
Norges Bank, and the external management ele-
ment is small. CEM has also found that Norges 
Bank’s internal management is cost-effective 
compared to the management activities of other 
funds. The report is available on the Ministry’s 
website.

Cost developments over time

Excluding performance-based fees, asset manage-
ment costs measured in Norwegian kroner have 
increased over time; see Figure 2.11. Some costs 
depend on the size of the Fund and will therefore 
increase when the value of the Fund grows. 
Norges Bank has expanded its personnel in con-
nection with, inter alia, the real estate invest-
ments. Together with a general increase in sala-
ries, this has resulted in higher internal costs. 
Some of the costs of the Fund are incurred in 
other currencies than Norwegian kroner. Conse-
quently, the krone depreciation over the past two 
years has contributed to an increase in costs 
measured in Norwegian kroner. Over time, how-
ever, this increase has been smaller than the 
increase in the market value of the Fund, thus 
implying that costs have declined as a proportion 
of capital under management.

2.2.8 The Ministry’s assessment 

The financial markets fluctuated considerably in 
2015. The Ministry is satisfied with the fact that 
the GPFG achieved a positive return in a challeng-
ing year. The return on the real estate invest-
ments was particularly high, but the return on the 
fixed-income portfolio was low. Interest levels 
remained low at yearend, and bonds are thus 
expected to continue generating low returns 
going forward.

The return on the equity and fixed-income port-
folios was 0.5 percentage points higher last year 
than the return on the benchmark index. This 
excess return is higher than is to be expected over 

time given the scope for deviations from the bench-
mark index and the proportion of the limit utilised 
by Norges Bank. The Ministry is focused on 
performance development over time. The Ministry 
is satisfied with the fact that the average annual 
gross return since 1998 is approximately ¼ per-
centage points higher than the average return on 
the benchmark index.

Unlisted real estate investments remain a rela-
tively new investment area for the GPFG, and 
expertise and experience need to be acquired 
over time. Investments in unlisted real estate also 
require a different management approach from 
investments in listed equities and bonds. The Min-
istry is focused on results over time, and the his-
tory of real estate investments is too short to draw 
firm conclusions as to the success of management 
efforts. However, the Ministry is satisfied with the 
fact that the return on the real estate investments 
has been high in recent years, both in absolute 
terms and compared to the return target.

On 1 February 2016, the Ministry of Finance 
adopted expanded requirements relating to 

Figure 2.11 Developments in GPFG asset manage-
ment costs. Measured in NOK million (left axis) and in 
basis points (right axis). One basis point = 0.01 percent

Source: Norges Bank.
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Norges Bank’s reporting on and management of 
risk; see section 3.4. The annual report for 2015 is 
the first report prepared in accordance with the 
new mandate requirements. Norges Bank has 
published an expanded report on the perfor-
mance and risk of the GPFG, and will publish a 
separate report on the real estate investments in 
April. For the past two years, the Bank has also 
published a special report on responsible invest-
ment. It also publishes further information on its 
website. An expanded reporting regime supports 
further transparency about the management of 
the Fund.

The Ministry is satisfied with the fact that 
asset management costs are low compared to 
those of other funds when measured as a propor-
tion of capital under management. This indicates 
that Norges Bank is successfully exploiting econ-
omies of scale in its management. Nevertheless, 
the costs are substantial in absolute terms, and it 
is important to consider whether management 
can be made more efficient. Costs may rise 
somewhat as the proportion of real estate invest-
ments in the Fund increases, and may also be 
affected by changes in the value of Norwegian 
kroner. 

2.3 Third party verification 

2.3.1 Review of return data

In the management mandate, the Ministry of 
Finance requires Norges Bank to follow Interna-
tional Financial Reporting Standards (IFRS) in its 
financial reporting, and has specified that perfor-
mance measurement must be based on Global 
Investment Performance Standards (GIPS). The 
Spaulding Group verifies that return data comply 
with GIPS. A separate GIPS report is available on 
Norges Bank’s website.

At the request of the Ministry, the Spaulding 
Group also verifies return data for the GPFG. The 
verification calculations for the financial year 2015 
show no deviations from the return data reported 
by Norges Bank. The report is published on the 
Ministry’s website.

In accordance with the governance model, 
the Supervisory Council of Norges Bank moni-
tors and supervises Norges Bank’s compliance 
with the rules adopted for the management oper-
ations. The Supervisory Council elects the 
Bank’s external auditor and approves its annual 
accounts.

Since 2013, the percentage return on the 
GPFG investments has been included in the 

notes to the Bank’s annual accounts. Accord-
ingly, the external auditor of the Bank carries out 
necessary reviews to verify the return calcula-
tions, before the Supervisory Council approves 
the accounts. 

The agreement between the Ministry of 
Finance and the Spaulding Group relating to 
verification of return figures applied up to and 
including the 2015 financial year. The Ministry 
has no plans to enter into a new agreement with 
external consultants, since the return calcula-
tions are now verified by the Supervisory 
Council with the assistance of the Bank’s 
external auditor. 

2.3.2 Assurance engagement

The Supervisory Council of Norges Bank com-
missioned the Bank’s auditor (Deloitte) to per-
form an assurance engagement relating to risk 
management and compliance framework for real 
estate investments in the GPFG.

The review comprised an assessment of three 
main areas:
– The Executive Board’s governance and compli-

ance framework, including the setting and eval-
uation of risk tolerance and investment objec-
tives and their surveillance.

– The risk management and compliance struc-
ture of Norges Bank Real Estate Management 
(NBREM), including the division of roles and 
responsibilities, policies, procedures and esca-
lation processes, monitoring of financial and 
reputational risk and evaluation of expertise 
and experience.

– Reviews and assessments of investment oppor-
tunities (due diligence) and investment deci-
sions, including criteria for evaluation of invest-
ment opportunities, due diligence guidelines 
and monitoring of investment results and 
returns.

In the assurance engagement, NBREM encom-
passes the part of Norges Bank Investment Man-
agement (NBIM) pertaining to unlisted real 
estate investments, including NBREM’s manage-
ment and relevant parts of Norges Bank’s gover-
nance structure such as the Executive Board and 
CEO of NBIM.

In the auditor’s view, the framework for risk 
management and compliance has been designed 
and implemented in accordance with the assess-
ment criteria laid down for the review. It was 
pointed out that the evaluation was based on the 
current scale of real estate investment.
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The auditor pointed out that the real estate 
operation is undergoing considerable develop-
ment, and that the risk management framework – 
including policies and procedures – will have to be 
updated as the operation increases in size and the 
risk picture changes. In the context of this ongo-
ing development, NBREM is working on mea-
sures including the following: 
– strengthen portfolio analysis and monitoring
– clarify the responsibility of NBREM’s risk man-

agement and compliance function for invest-
ment risk monitoring and establish guidelines 
and procedures which reflect this responsibil-
ity

– complete and implement the process being 
developed for regular evaluation of governance 

and compliance measures established by exter-
nal real estate managers and investment part-
ners

In the auditor’s view, this will strengthen risk man-
agement as the operation develops.

The auditor also pointed out that the real 
estate operation differs materially from NBIM’s 
other investment activities, and that the develop-
ment of the real estate operation and the risks it 
presents may therefore necessitate an evaluation 
of whether the Executive Board should give 
greater priority to clarifying special risk manage-
ment principles.
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3  The Government Pension Fund Global: 
refinement of strategy and management

3.1 Introduction

The investment strategy for the Government Pen-
sion Fund Global has been developed over time 
on the basis of thorough assessments. These 
assessments have focused on the expected impact 
of different choices on the risk-return ratio. 
Important decisions are endorsed by the Storting.

An important topic in this year’s white paper is 
investments in unlisted real estate and infrastruc-
ture. The current mandate for the GPFG provides 
that up to five percent of the Fund shall be 
invested in a separate real estate portfolio. The 
Fund’s real estate investments are still being built 
up, and the real estate portfolio accounted for 3.1 
percent of the Fund’s capital at the end of 2015. 
The current mandate does not permit investment 
in unlisted infrastructure. Real estate investments 
are discussed in section 3.2, including how such 
investments should be regulated in the manage-
ment mandate. Unlisted infrastructure invest-
ments are discussed in section 3.3.

Norges Bank is authorised to deviate some-
what from the benchmark index set by the Minis-
try of Finance. The scope for deviations from the 
benchmark index was raised on 1 February of this 
year pursuant to the decision made by the Stort-
ing in response to last year’s white paper. New 
risk limits and more detailed reporting require-
ments have also been introduced. The new 
requirements are discussed in section 3.4.

The Government has appointed two official 
commissions to report on topics related to the 
management of the GPFG. One of the commis-
sions is to assess the equity portion of the GPFG; 
see section 3.5. The second is to examine the 
Norges Bank Act and the Bank’s governance 
structure; see section 3.6.

3.2 Real estate investments

3.2.1 Introduction

The Ministry of Finance has assessed both 
whether the proportion of the GPFG invested in 

real estate should be increased and how the Min-
istry should regulate such investments in the 
management mandate; see the report on the 
Fund for 2014. As part of these efforts, the Minis-
try obtained analyses and assessments from an 
expert group (Stijn Van Nieuwerburgh, Richard 
Stanton and Leo de Bever) and Norges Bank. The 
expert group was additionally requested to evalu-
ate investments in unlisted infrastructure; see 
section 3.3. The Ministry has also engaged the 
analysis company and index provider MSCI to 
prepare a report on the composition of the global 
investable capital market and other topics.

The report of the expert group and the recom-
mendations from Norges Bank were received in 
December 2015, and were discussed at a specialist 
seminar arranged by the Ministry of Finance on 
17 December 2015. The Ministry also held a dia-
logue meeting with various specialist institutions 
on 21 January 2016 at which real estate and infra-
structure were on the agenda.

The background materials relating to real 
estate and infrastructure are available on the Min-
istry of Finance website.

3.2.2 The real estate investments

In 2008, it was decided that up to five percent of 
the Fund should be invested in real estate; see the 
report on the Fund for 2007 and the subsequent 
deliberation of the Storting. At that time, it was 
pointed out that real estate is the third-largest 
asset class globally. Equities and bonds constitute 
the two largest asset classes. The objectives were 
to improve the Fund’s risk diversification further, 
harvest premiums on investments in less liquid 
assets and increase investment in real assets to 
ensure maximum preservation of the Fund’s inter-
national purchasing power. In 2010, the Ministry 
of Finance amended the management mandate to 
permit the GPFG to be invested in real estate.

At the end of 2015, 3.1 percent of the Fund – or 
NOK 235 billion – was invested in a separate real 
estate portfolio. The real estate investments are 
still under development. The majority of the real 
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estate portfolio comprised investments in unlisted 
real estate (77 percent, equivalent to 2.4 percent of 
the GPFG).1 Geographically, the unlisted real 
estate investments were distributed fairly evenly 
between the USA and European countries.

Norges Bank has adopted a strategy which 
aims to build a global yet concentrated real estate 
portfolio. This strategy entails investment in 
unlisted real estate in a limited number of large 
cities in key markets.

The unlisted real estate investments primarily 
comprise office properties, logistics properties 
and the retail sector. In most cases, Norges Bank 
executes unlisted property investments through 
partnerships (joint ventures) with established real 
estate investors. All investments in unlisted real 
estate are organised through subsidiaries in order 
to limit liability and risk in connection with indi-
vidual investments.

In the period between the initial investment in 
the first quarter of 2011 and the end of 2015, the 
average annual return achieved on the unlisted 
real estate investments was 6.9 percent, measured 
in the currency basket of the Fund and after trans-
action costs. Investment transaction costs will be 
significant during the portfolio development 
phase, and will affect the return. However, the 
impact of transaction costs on the return will 
decline over time. The 6.9 percent return is 
approximately 2.7 percentage points higher than 
the return achieved on the Fund’s fixed-income 
investments in the same period, but around 1.7 
percentage points lower than the return on the 
equity investments of the Fund.

The Ministry of Finance has adopted a return 
target for the real estate investments, defined by 
the IPD index prepared by the index provider 
MSCI. In the period between the initial invest-
ment in the first quarter of 2011 and the end of 
2014, the average annual return on the unlisted 
real estate investments was around 0.8 percentage 
points higher than the return on the IPD index.2

An important factor in this regard is that the 
Fund’s unlisted real estate portfolio deviates from 
the composition of the IPD index, particularly 
because Norges Bank has chosen to invest a 

larger proportion in office properties in key Euro-
pean and US cities than implied by the index. 

The management costs for unlisted real estate 
investments are higher than those relating to 
equities and fixed-income securities. This is a gen-
eral characteristic of unlisted investments. The 
Ministry’s annual comparison of the costs of the 
GPFG relative to those of other large funds, which 
is prepared by the Canadian company CEM 
Benchmarking Inc., shows that the Fund’s 
unlisted real estate costs are approximately on par 
with the costs of other large investors which orga-
nise their real estate management operations 
through subsidiaries.

In the strategy plan for the GPFG, Norges 
Bank expresses the expectation that the real 
estate portfolio will grow by the equivalent of one 
percent of the GPFG per year, with the aim that 
such investments will total approximately five per-
cent of the Fund by the end of the plan period, i.e. 
the end of 2016. The strategy plan also estimates 
that 600 employees will be involved in Norges 
Bank’s management of the Fund by the end of 
2016, including about 200 in the real estate organi-
sation. In a letter of 25 November 2015, Norges 
Bank stated that economies of scale in the opera-
tional management context imply that the 
increase in the number of employees will be 
smaller than the growth in the real estate portfo-
lio. 

3.2.3 Recommendations regarding real estate 
investments

The recommendations of the expert group and 
Norges Bank on real estate investments reflect a 
number of considerations, including:
– the proportion of real estate in the global 

investable capital market;
– analyses of the risk and return properties of 

real estate, equities and fixed-income securi-
ties;

– distinctive characteristics of the GPFG and the 
manager’s advantages in the unlisted invest-
ment space; and

– the real estate investments of comparable 
funds. 

Market size

The expert group and Norges Bank have obtained 
differing estimates of the size of the real estate 
market due to the inclusion of different financial 
instruments in the calculations. Norges Bank 
takes the view that how real estate is financed is 

1 Shares in listed real estate companies accounted for the 
remainder. The investments in listed real estate equities 
included in the real estate portfolio are additional to the 
investments in listed real estate companies implied by the 
equity benchmark index. 

2 The global IPD index features a certain time lag. The 
return target was amended in 2013, when the Ministry of 
Finance also permitted unlisted real estate investments out-
side Europe.
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irrelevant to the investment opportunities of the 
Fund, and estimates of real estate market size 
should therefore include both debt and equity 
financing. Applying this definition, the Bank has 
estimated the total value of investable real estate, 
both listed and unlisted, to be between 10 and 15 
percent of total global financial investments. The 
expert group, which has looked exclusively at 
equity financing, has estimated that the real estate 

market totals around six percent. Under the 
expert group’s definition, debt financing of real 
estate is treated in the same manner as corporate 
debt financing, and the real estate proportion is 
determined in the same way as the proportion of 
equities.

The size of the global capital market has also 
been estimated by MSCI for the Ministry of 
Finance; see Box 3.1.

Box 3.1 The global capital market

In an analysis prepared for the Ministry of 
Finance by MSCI, the global capital market 
available to investors is estimated at close to 
USD 125 trillion as at the end of June 2015. Fig-
ure 3.1 shows the market distribution across dif-
ferent asset classes. According to the analysis, 
real estate accounts for 6.8 percent of the total 

investable market. Infrastructure amounts to 3.2 
percent. While unlisted investments comprise 
the majority of the real estate market, most of 
the infrastructure market is listed. In aggregate, 
the unlisted real estate and infrastructure mar-
kets total 6.1 percent of the market. Market 
portfolio estimates are uncertain.

Figure 3.1 The global investable capital market distributed by asset classes, as of 30 June 2015

Source: MSCI.

The proportion of real estate in the market port-
folio varies considerable from study to study, 
depending on the treatment of debt investments. 
The proportion of real estate is normally esti-
mated based on the value of equity investments, 
just like estimates of the proportion of shares. 
The figures from MSCI are based on this defini-

tion. Some studies include investments in 
unlisted real estate in the form of loans from 
institutional investors, banks and insurance 
companies. With this approach, the proportion 
of real estate in the market portfolio is almost 
doubled.

The global capital market
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31.9 %

Private Equity (PE)
2.0 %

Real estate
6.8 %

Infrastructure
3.2 %

Fixed-income
56.1 %

Government 19.5 %
Financial sector 28.6 %
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Listed infrastructure 2.7 %
Unlisted infrastructure 0.5 %

Listed real estate 1.2 %
Unlisted real estate 5.6 %
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Risk and return

Generally speaking, limited data is available on 
the risk and return of investments in unlisted real 
estate, with the exception of the US market. Both 
Norges Bank and the expert group have pointed 
out that limited data access renders the assess-
ment of risk and return for real estate investments 
difficult and uncertain.

The expert group chose to base its recom-
mendations on its own analyses of historical 
returns on listed real estate. The group identified 
several data problems which make it difficult to 
compare the risk and return figures of listed and 
unlisted real estate indices. These include the 
fact that prices in unlisted indices are based on 
appraisals, and are therefore smoothed and fea-
ture a time lag compared to market values; see 
Figure 3.2. However, a review of research litera-
ture indicates that listed and unlisted real estate 
exhibit the same risk and return properties in 
the long run. The expert group therefore con-
cluded that data on listed real estate indices con-
stitute an appropriate indicator for the real estate 
market as a whole.

The analyses of the expert group show that 
investors in the listed real estate market have 
been compensated for general market risk, but 
that no additional excess return has been 
achieved. The experts pointed out the increasing 
integration of the real estate market with the rest 

of the capital market over the past 20 years, and 
the resulting limited scope for making further 
gains through risk diversification. The expert 
group concluded that there is no basis for recom-
mending a higher proportion of real estate in the 
GPFG. Instead, it recommended that the Ministry 
delegate the decision on the real estate portion of 
the Fund to Norges Bank subject to a specified 
limit.

The experts also pointed out that real estate 
valuations are currently at historical highs in both 
absolute and relative terms (compared to individ-
ual properties’ net operating revenue), particu-
larly in the segment in which Norges Bank is 
invested. Accordingly, any expansion of the real 
estate portfolio should in the view of the expert 
group be implemented gradually. The valuation 
assessment is not based on a comparison with 
other asset classes such as equities and fixed-
income securities.

Norges Bank’s recommendations relating to 
real estate are based on both a review of research 
and the Bank’s own risk and return analyses. The 
adopted starting point is data for unlisted invest-
ments. In its research review, the Bank examined 
studies which have calculated optimal portfolio 
composition. While these studies demonstrate 
considerable variation in estimates of the optimal 
real estate portion, the portion is normally 
between 10 and 20 percent. Norges Bank also 
stated that the assessments in most of the studies, 

Figure 3.2 Quarterly return on listed (REIT) and unlisted (NCREIF) real estate indices. Percent

Sources: Van Nieuwerburgh, Stanton and de Bever (2015).
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and the Bank’s own analyses, indicate that real 
estate investments would improve the risk-return 
ratio of the Fund.

Further, Norges Bank takes the view that the 
link between economic growth and the return on 
unlisted real estate investments is positive and 
stronger than the link between economic growth 
and the return on equities. The Bank has stated 
that this may explain why real estate investments 
appear to support better risk diversification in the 
long term.

Comparative advantages in unlisted real estate

Distinctive characteristics and advantages can 
allow a higher return to be achieved on invest-
ments in unlisted markets than the average inves-
tor can secure. According to Ang, Brandt and 
Denison (2014), leading global investors in 
unlisted markets who have distinctive characteris-
tics such as large capital stocks and a long time 
horizon have good opportunities to hold less liq-
uid assets and develop advantages through inter-
nal management.

Both the expert group and Norges Bank have 
pointed out that the GPFG and its manager have, 
and can probably develop further, distinctive char-
acteristics and advantages in the management of 
unlisted real estate investments, compared to 
other investors.

According to Norges Bank, the GPFG’s dis-
tinctive characteristics allow it to submit bids that 
are not contingent on financing, and to take the 
time needed to develop individual properties. The 
Bank also pointed out the limited likelihood of 
unlisted investments having to be sold due to 
large unexpected withdrawals from the Fund.

The expert group referred to examples from 
comparable funds which have reported a substan-
tial excess return over time relative to listed 
investments. Reference was also made to studies 
which have found that investors who have sub-
stantial capital under management and build up 
internal expertise can achieve both lower costs 
and higher returns than smaller investors. Poten-
tial explanations include that large funds have bet-
ter opportunities to attract and retain more skillful 
managers, more resources available for analysis 
and monitoring of investment objects, or better 
access to investment opportunities. Both the 
expert group and Norges Bank have stated that 
the GPFG has characteristics which are well 
suited to the development and exploitation of this 
type of economy of scale. 

The investments of comparable funds

The expert group and Norges Bank have pointed 
out large variations in the real estate investment 
proportions of different institutional investors. 
The expert group referred to an article based on 
the CEM database which concluded that large 
pension funds maintained a listed and unlisted 
real estate portion of around six to seven percent 
in the period 1990–2011. Norges Bank referred to 
reports from CEM Benchmarking and its own 
review which indicated an average real estate allo-
cation among institutional investors of around 10 
percent, with long-term investors having a some-
what higher proportion.

Recommendations from Norges Bank and the expert 
group

Norges Bank has recommended that the GPFG’s 
real estate portion should be increased from five 
to 10 percent, and that a range of five percentage 
points around this target should be adopted to 
prevent market developments from forcing unde-
sirable adjustments. The expert group did not rec-
ommend a particular fixed proportion of real 
estate, but concluded that decisions concerning 
increases in the scale of real estate investments 
should be delegated to Norges Bank subject to a 
cap of 10 percent.

3.2.4 Current regulation of real estate 
investments

In the mandate to Norges Bank, the Ministry of 
Finance has specified a strategic benchmark 
index comprising the benchmark indices for equi-
ties and bonds, as well as an allocation to a sepa-
rate real estate portfolio. The benchmark index 
plays a key role in the mandate, and helps ensure 
a clear distribution of responsibilities between 
Norges Bank and the Ministry of Finance. The 
mandate contains several requirements relating to 
separate risk management of the real estate port-
folio, including that Norges Bank must adopt sup-
plementary limits to restrict portfolio risk.

The mandate from the Ministry permits the 
real estate portfolio to be invested in listed equi-
ties and interest-bearing securities, as well as 
unlisted real estate. The return on the real estate 
portfolio is measured against the IPD index. The 
Ministry of Finance has previously pointed out 
that the IPD index is not a suitable benchmark 
index for listed real estate investments, or as a 
foundation for measuring and managing risk. 
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Although it is the most recognised and used 
unlisted real estate index, it has several weak-
nesses compared to indices composed of listed 
equities and bonds. In many markets, the IPD 
index represents only a minor proportion of the 
total real estate market. Moreover, it is based on 
self-reported appraisals, not on prices observed in 
a market. The composition and basis for calcula-
tion are known only to the index provider, and it is 
not possible to replicate the return on the index 
by investing in all properties included.

Since the index is not investable and based on 
appraisals, it is difficult to measure the return and 
limit risk as in the case of listed markets. The 
return on the IPD index will fluctuate less and fea-
ture a time lag compared to the return on listed 
real estate companies. This presents challenges in 
terms of measuring, managing and controlling 
risk and results. Norges Bank points to a draw-
back of the current regulatory arrangement, 
namely that real estate investments are not 
included in an overall limit on market risk in the 
GPFG. This makes it more difficult to manage, 
control and report total market and exchange rate 
risk for the Fund. 

3.2.5 Recommendations regarding further 
development of the framework for real 
estate investments

Choice of the real estate benchmark index

The expert group has recommended that, in the 
manangement mandate, the Ministry employ 
listed equities and bonds as the benchmark index 
for all Fund investments, including unlisted real 
estate. The experts pointed out uncertainty as to 
whether a separate strategic allocation to real 
estate will improve the risk-return ratio compared 
to a benchmark index of listed equities and bonds. 
The expert group considers the foundation for 
such an allocation as highly uncertain and should 
therefore not be reflected in the Ministry’s com-
position of the strategic benchmark index for the 
GPFG.

In its report, the expert group wrote that a 
fixed target of the real estate portion, as in the cur-
rent mandate, takes insufficient account of the fact 
that return opportunities in unlisted markets vary 
over time. A fixed portion may result in invest-
ments in unlisted real estate on part of the man-
ager with the sole aim of achieving the adopted 
target, without taking into account variation in 
return opportunities over time. This entails a risk 
that investments may be made when expected 

return is low. The expert group pointed out that 
the Bank is closer to the market than the Ministry 
of Finance, and thus in a better position to assess 
such investments. In the view of the expert group, 
investments in unlisted real estate should there-
fore form part of Norges Bank’s active manage-
ment.

The expert group recommended that Norges 
Bank use the so-called opportunity cost model to 
set a required rate of return tailored to each indi-
vidual investment in unlisted real estate. It was 
pointed out that such a required rate of return can 
be set by first selecting a listed real estate equity 
with corresponding risk and return properties, 
including the type of real estate, its location and 
an adjustment for debt ratio. The market risk 
associated with this real estate equity is then esti-
mated as a combination of the risk in the listed 
equity and fixed-income benchmark indices. The 
required rate of return for each unlisted invest-
ment is the expected return achievable by assum-
ing corresponding market risk through invest-
ments in the indices for listed equities and bonds. 
If the risk can be estimated with a high degree of 
precision and unlisted investments can be funded 
by selling equities and bonds in a ratio which fol-
lows from these estimates, total systematic risk is 
assumed to be unchanged regardless of whether 
or not the unlisted investment is made.

The purpose of the opportunity cost model is 
that the manager will invest in unlisted real estate 
only if the investment is expected to improve the 
risk-return ratio. The model also avoids use of 
benchmark indices for unlisted investments.

Norges Bank has assumed that increasing the 
proportion of real estate in the GPFG will improve 
the risk-return ratio, and recommended that the 
target for real estate investments be increased 
from five to 10 percent of the Fund’s capital. Nev-
ertheless, the Bank considers that such a target 
should not be reflected in the composition of the 
strategic benchmark index, and has proposed that 
all investments should be measured against the 
benchmark index of listed equities and bonds. 
The benchmark index will thus be investable, 
reflect the owner’s capacity to absorb return fluc-
tuations and be used as a starting point for mea-
suring risk and return for the Fund as a whole. 

Risk management

The expert group has proposed that the opportu-
nity cost model be used to manage market risk 
related to unlisted investments. Under this model, 
unlisted real estate investments are funded 
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through the sale of listed equities and bonds from 
the benchmark index with an approximately equal 
estimated market risk, entailing that the total mar-
ket risk of the GPFG will remain unchanged. 
However, the model will not encompass all types 
of risk. For example, unlisted investments often 
involve large individual investments with low 
liquidity compared to listed investments. The 
expert group also pointed out that real estate 
returns may to some extent be determined by 
other factor premiums which are not included in 
indices for listed equities and bonds. Risk which is 
not covered by the opportunity cost model, such 
as other systematic risk and asset-specific risk, 
can instead be managed by including supplemen-
tary risk limits in the mandate. Among other 
things, the expert group recommended that the 
mandate should include special requirements as 
to the diversification of the real estate investments 
and that a 10 percent cap should be set for real 
estate investments to ensure that the asset alloca-
tion of the GPFG does not deviate too much from 
the benchmark index.

Norges Bank’s deviation from the benchmark 
index for equity and bond investments is cur-
rently regulated by means of a limit of 1.25 per-
centage points, measured by expected tracking 
error. Norges Bank recommends that the real 
estate investments be made subject to this limit 
because this would result in an overall limit on the 
GPFG’s market and exchange rate risk. The rec-
ommendation would introduce an overall limit for 
the measurement and management of the risk 
that the return on the Fund will deviate from the 
return on the benchmark index. In a letter of 26 
November 2015, Norges Bank stated that it was 
operationally capable of handling the transition to 
a more integrated framework in line with the 
above proposal. The Bank pointed out that the 
deviations between the return on the Fund’s 
investments and the benchmark index in the 
short and medium term may be somewhat greater 
going forward if the real estate investments are 
made subject to the limit on expected tracking 
error. Norges Bank considers it natural to revert 
to the question of the tracking error limit as the 
proportion of unlisted investments in the Fund 
increases.

Norges Bank has pointed out that the current 
model makes the benchmark index a strategy 
which the manager is generally expected to fol-
low. The Bank has stated that an opportunity cost 
model would assign the benchmark index a differ-
ent role than at present. The benchmark index 
would no longer be a strategy the manager is 

expected to follow closely, but rather an indirect 
reflection of the owner’s risk tolerance. Norges 
Bank indicated that it would continue to work on 
the question of an absolute risk target. According 
to the Bank, such a target would be a better man-
agement tool if the owner primarily wishes to 
manage total market risk in the management con-
text and is less concerned about influencing the 
selection of individual investments. Work will also 
continue on the question of whether the currency 
basket should be defined on a different basis than 
what is implied by the current benchmark index. 
Even though real estate investments are not pres-
ently included in the Fund’s currency basket, it is 
used when measuring real estate returns.

The expert group stated that an opportunity 
cost model will be more difficult to implement 
than the current framework, but also pointed out 
that this type of model is more suitable for long-
term investments than short-term risk targets like 
expected tracking error. However, a challenge 
with both models is that it is difficult to estimate 
market risk for unlisted investments.

3.2.6 The Ministry’s assessment 

Introduction

In the manangement mandate, the Ministry of 
Finance has stipulated that up to five percent of 
the Fund may be invested in a separate real estate 
portfolio. The Fund’s real estate investments are 
still being built up, and the real estate portfolio 
accounted for 3.1 percent of the Fund’s capital at 
the end of 2015. The mandate permits the real 
estate portfolio to include listed real estate equi-
ties, subject to limits set by Norges Bank.

Under the mandate, the real estate portfolio 
forms part of the strategic benchmark index for 
the Fund. The return on the real estate portfolio is 
measured by reference to an unlisted real estate 
index, the IPD index. The Ministry has previously 
been advised by Ang, Brandt and Denison (2014) 
that changes should be made to the regulations 
governing the real estate investments. Both the 
expert group (Van Nieuwerburgh, Stanton and de 
Bever) and Norges Bank have made correspond-
ing recommendations. The expert group and 
Norges Bank have pointed out that the IPD index 
is ill-suited as a return measure for real estate, and 
stated that it would be better to employ a bench-
mark index composed of listed equities and 
bonds. The Ministry recognises the weaknesses 
of the current return measure. The Ministry has 
also been advised by the expert group and Norges 
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Bank that a different approach should be taken to 
managing the risk associated with the real estate 
investments. 

Benchmark index of listed equities and bonds

In accordance with the obtained analyses and 
assessments, the Ministry proposes to move away 
from the current strategic benchmark index with 
a dedicated real estate portfolio and related return 
measure. The Fund’s strategic benchmark index 
will thus comprise the equity and bond indices 
only. The Ministry considers such a benchmark 
index better suited than the IPD index to the eval-
uation of Norges Bank’s performance in the con-
text of real estate management. The Bank’s per-
formance will thus be measured against a broadly 
composed index which can, in principle, be fol-
lowed closely and at low cost. This entails a 
clearer distribution of fund management responsi-
bility between the Ministry and the Bank.

Further, the equity and bond benchmark indi-
ces have a robust foundation, and ensure broad 
diversification. The equity index includes real estate 
in the form of listed real estate companies and 
funds, as well as real estate owned by companies in 
other sectors. The Ministry has noted that the 
expert group did not conclude that listed real estate 
equities provide a better risk-return ratio than equi-
ties in other sectors. This indicates that the financial 
markets are generally well-functioning and that 
equities carrying equal risk can be expected to gen-
erate similar returns irrespective of economic sec-
tor. After reviewing the financial literature, the 
expert group concluded that investments in listed 
and unlisted real estate generally have similar char-
acteristics in the long term. It is thus uncertain 
whether investments in unlisted real estate will 
improve diversification or deliver a higher expected 
return due to lower liquidity. Furthermore, the lim-
ited data available on unlisted investments make it 
difficult to draw clear conclusions.

With the new benchmark index, the scope and 
composition of the real estate investments will be 
decided by Norge Bank subject to the limits stipu-
lated in the mandate issued by the Ministry of 
Finance. Such regulation is consistent with the 
findings that there are no suitable benchmark 
indices for unlisted real estate and that this type of 
management demands specialist expertise and 
market proximity. The expected return will be 
uncertain and dependent on the manager’s advan-
tages and specific investment choices. Moreover, 
this distribution of responsibilities between the 

Ministry of Finance and Norges Bank also under-
pins other strategies, including the harvesting of 
factor premiums and diversification beyond the 
benchmark index. The Ministry would underline 
that the risk and return associated with the Fund’s 
real estate portfolio depend on the profile of 
Norges Bank’s real estate investments to date. It 
is not possible to undertake investments that 
closely mirror the IPD index, and the Bank has 
chosen a composition for the real estate invest-
ment portfolio which deviates from the index. 

Risk regulation model

The Ministry of Finance agrees with both the 
expert group and Norges Bank that the real estate 
investments should be better regulated than at 
present. The Ministry therefore proposes to 
include real estate investments in the tracking 
error limit which already applies to other devia-
tions from the benchmark index. The Ministry 
also proposes to keep the current expected track-
ing error limit unchanged, at 1.25 percentage 
points. In its letter of 26 November 2015, Norges 
Bank confirmed that it has the operational capac-
ity required to manage a more integrated frame-
work, in line with this proposal. 

The Ministry of Finance has therefore not 
adopted the expert group’s proposal to employ a 
so-called opportunity cost model. Under this 
model, the market risk associated with invest-
ments in unlisted real estate and infrastructure 
must match the market risk level of the bench-
mark index, while other types of risk are managed 
by supplementary risk limits. The Ministry has 
noted that this model is used by several other 
large funds, and that it appears to be conceptually 
simple, but has nevertheless concluded that its 
implementation would be operationally challeng-
ing.

In the Ministry’s view, and as recommended 
by Norges Bank, it is reasonable to use a risk mea-
sure with which the Bank has extensive opera-
tional management experience. The Bank’s pro-
posal outlines a general approach to the manage-
ment assignment, as well as an overall limit on the 
market and currency risk of the Fund. According 
to the Bank, these changes entail a framework 
design that will permit and facilitate further devel-
opment of the investment strategy.

The Ministry will collaborate with Norges 
Bank on continued implementation of the Fund’s 
new regulatory framework for real estate in the 
mandate for the GPFG. 
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Cap on unlisted real estate investments

Expected tracking error will limit investments in 
unlisted real estate in the same way as other strat-
egies entailing deviation from the benchmark 
index. In addition, the mandate restricts the risk 
associated with different investment strategies 
through supplementary risk limits. The Ministry 
proposes to cap the GPFG’s investments in 
unlisted real estate. The experts and Norges Bank 
have proposed a total cap on unlisted real estate 
investments of 10 percent and 15 percent, respec-
tively. These limits are somewhat higher than the 
proportion of unlisted real estate in the market 
portfolio, which the expert group has estimated at 
five to six percent based on equity value.

Research indicates that large funds can achieve 
economies of scale in unlisted markets. The man-
date for the management of the GPFG should give 
Norges Bank leeway to exploit the Fund’s size. 
Nevertheless, there is reason to be cautious about 
granting wider scope for investment in unlisted 
assets. Real estate valuations are based on apprais-
als, making it difficult to measure performance on 
an ongoing basis and evaluate whether a compara-
tive advantage relative to other investors has in fact 
been achieved. Further, it is uncertain whether an 
additional return can be expected on such invest-
ments, and the management of unlisted invest-
ments is generally more complex. Although the 
Fund has some years’ experience of this type of 
management, a gradual approach is appropriate. 
Unlisted investments are also more expensive to 
downscale in the event of negative experiences.

The Ministry of Finance proposes to cap the 
proportion of unlisted real estate investments at 
seven percent of the GPFG. Returns on unlisted 
real estate may at times differ from the return on 
listed equities and bonds. Accordingly, Norges 
Bank must arrange its management in such a way 
that the proportion of unlisted real estate is lower 
than the cap in order to avoid breaching the limit 
and having to liquidate investments in the event of 
sharp, sudden drops in the value of listed invest-
ments. In the Ministry’s opinion, a cap of seven 
percent will allow for a long-term unlisted real 
estate proportion of approximately five percent of 
the GPFG. This limit is sufficiently high to allow 
for the realisation of any economies of scale 
offered by the market.

Economic consequences and next steps

The fixed-income portion of the benchmark index 
for the GPFG has gradually been reduced from 40 

percent by a proportion corresponding to the real 
estate investments, which amounted to 3.1 per-
cent at the end of 2015. The expert group has 
pointed out that the risk associated with real 
estate investments is more closely linked to stock 
market fluctuations than volatility in the bond 
markets. Norges Bank has also stated that the 
real estate investments impact the Fund’s overall 
market risk.

The Ministry of Finance proposes to keep the 
total market risk of the GPFG largely unchanged, 
and will evaluate the detailed composition of the 
benchmark indices for equities and bonds on this 
basis. The Ministry would also point out that the 
Government intends to review the equity portion 
of the benchmark index in the report on the Fund 
for 2016, following analyses and recommenda-
tions received from an official commission and 
Norges Bank; see section 3.5.

3.3 Infrastructure investments

3.3.1 Introduction

The Ministry of Finance has considered whether 
to permit the GPFG to invest in unlisted infra-
structure. As part of this process, the Ministry 
consulted an expert group (Van Nieuwerburgh, 
Stanton and de Bever) and Norges Bank; see also 
section 3.2.

The Ministry received the analyses and rec-
ommendations of the expert group and Norges 
Bank in December 2015. These were discussed at 
a specialist seminar arranged by the Ministry on 
17 December 2015. The Ministry also held a dia-
logue meeting on 21 January 2016 at which infra-
structure was on the agenda.

3.3.2 Recommendations concerning unlisted 
infrastructure investments

Both the expert group and Norges Bank esti-
mate the combined value of listed and unlisted 
infrastructure at approximately three percent of 
the global capital market. The analysis and index 
provider MSCI calculates the value of the infra-
structure market at 3.2 percent, with the unlisted 
market accounting for around 0.5 percentage 
points.

Limited data are available on the risk and 
return characteristics of unlisted infrastructure 
investments. Both Norges Bank and the expert 
group have stated that the weakness of the under-
lying data makes it difficult to draw clear conclu-
sions and renders assessments uncertain.
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The expert group analysed historical returns 
on indices composed of listed infrastructure equi-
ties. The historical data cover a brief period, and 
the experts therefore had no basis for concluding 
that a dedicated infrastructure allocation would 
improve the risk-return ratio of the Fund. The 
experts concluded that infrastructure appears a 
more attractive investment object than real estate 
due to lower systematic risk and higher dividend 
growth, but also stated that current investment 
prices appear to be elevated.

Norges Bank examined data relating to the 
unlisted sector and concluded that these indicated 
an attractive risk-return ratio for unlisted infra-
structure investments. However, the Bank also 
emphasised that the data covered a limited num-
ber of transactions. The Bank was sceptical about 
using listed infrastructure data as a basis for eval-
uating unlisted infrastructure because listed infra-
structure prices will reflect developments in the 
stock market, not necessarily developments in 
investments relevant to the GPFG. Norges Bank 
concluded that any decision to invest in unlisted 
infrastructure must generally be based on qualita-
tive, forward-looking risk and return assessments. 
In the Bank’s view, it is reasonable to assume that 
unlisted infrastructure investments can improve 
the risk-return ratio in the long term. 

Both the expert group and Norges Bank take 
the view that the GPFG is well suited to the devel-
opment and exploitation of economies of scale in 
unlisted markets. In a letter of 2 December 2015, 
Norges Bank wrote that the Fund’s size and long 
time horizon may indicate suitability to invest in 
certain types of infrastructure. The Bank also 
wrote that, if this type of investment were to be 
permitted, the proportion of the Fund invested in 
unlisted infrastructure would be small over the 
next few years, and that the Bank would approach 
investment opportunities and develop expertise 
gradually, in the same manner as for real estate. 
Initially, the Bank envisages assessing infrastruc-
ture investments which offer highly secure future 
earnings, and that the first investments will be 
made in the most developed countries. In Norges 
Bank’s view, it is logical not to make the initial 
investments on a stand-alone basis.

The experts and Norges Bank have recom-
mended permitting the GPFG to invest in unlisted 
infrastructure, but also that no target or separate 
allocation should be set for this type of investment 
other than as implied by the GPFG’s listed bench-
mark index. In the absence of a dedicated unlisted 
infrastructure allocation, the scale of investments 
will be determined by Norges Bank subject to the 

limits stipulated in the management mandate. The 
Bank recommends the inclusion of unlisted infra-
structure investments in the current limit on devi-
ations from the benchmark index as measured by 
expected tracking error, and that the cap on 
unlisted infrastructure be specified as a range 
from zero to five percent at this time. The expert 
group has recommended that the risk associated 
with unlisted investments be regulated by means 
of an opportunity cost model; see the discussion 
in section 3.2. To limit the GPFG’s aggregate risk, 
the expert group recommended a cap of 10 per-
cent on infrastructure investments, and that other 
types of risk be managed by special limits.

3.3.3 Distinctive characteristics of unlisted 
infrastructure investments

In its letter of 2 December 2015, Norges Bank 
wrote that individual opportunities to invest in 
unlisted infrastructure involve large amounts, and 
that projects are illiquid and of long duration. 
Investment opportunities arise at irregular inter-
vals, and investments can be difficult to sell. The 
Bank also wrote that unlisted infrastructure invest-
ments are non-standardised and more costly, and 
require different monitoring from listed invest-
ments. On the other hand, infrastructure invest-
ments can be managed by a considerably smaller 
number of employees than real estate. Norges 
Bank envisages that any equity investments in 
infrastructure by the GPFG will primarily be made 
via subsidiaries to limit the Bank’s liability.

According to Norges Bank, the cost of manag-
ing unlisted real estate and infrastructure portfo-
lios will be higher than the cost of managing listed 
equities and bonds. In particular, the Bank has 
pointed out that tax may comprise a substantial 
cost in some real estate and infrastructure invest-
ments, although it has also stated that there is no 
indication that infrastructure investments raise 
new tax issues beyond those arising in connection 
with real estate.

The Canadian company CEM Benchmarking 
Inc. prepares an annual comparison between the 
GPFG’s asset management costs and those of 
other large funds. According to its 2014 report, 
the average infrastructure management costs of 
other large funds amounted to around 0.3 percent 
in the case of in-house management and around 
2.4 percent when investments were made through 
fund structures. The expert group estimates that 
the internal asset management costs for directly 
owned investments will total between 0.5 percent 
and 1.0 percent.
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Norges Bank has pointed out that many 
infrastructure projects are of social importance, 
and therefore subject to the supervision of dedi-
cated authorities or governed by long-term 
agreements. Such investments carry a risk of 
changes in framework conditions, i.e. regulatory 
risk. In countries with a short history of such 
regulation, decisions may be inconsistent and 
difficult to predict, increasing risk for investors. 
In its letter of 2 December 2015, the Bank 
pointed out that in principle the GPFG is not bet-
ter suited to bear this type of risk than other 
investors.

Political risk is related to regulatory risk, and 
encompasses, for example, the risk of expropria-
tion, cancellation or amendment of agreements, 
altered tax laws and political instability. This type 
of risk is particularly relevant when investing in 
sectors associated with high and irreversible 
costs, large economies of scale and a high degree 
of centrally regulated pricing, such as telecommu-
nications and electricity production. According to 
Norges Bank, political risk is higher in emerging 
markets than developed markets. The Bank has 
also stated that the risk of corruption may be 
higher in emerging markets.

The expert group pointed out that unlisted 
investments are associated with many non-finan-
cial risks, including political, reputational and cli-
mate risk, and that infrastructure carries a high 
risk of attracting official attention. 

The expert group was divided in its view on 
whether Norges Bank should invest in infrastruc-
ture. Two of the experts (Van Nieuwerburgh and 
Stanton) concluded that the majority of infrastruc-
ture investments should comprise listed instru-
ments. In this regard, it was pointed out that most 
privately owned infrastructure investments are 
currently held by listed companies, and that 
unlisted investments are associated with high 
operational complexity and non-financial risks. 
Norges Bank is already permitted to invest in 
listed infrastructure.

The third member of the expert group (de 
Bever) took the view that the GPFG should invest 
primarily in unlisted infrastructure, stating for 
example that most other large funds are invested 
in unlisted infrastructure assets. Further, de 
Bever stated that the real estate and infrastructure 
asset classes are generally less efficient and offer 
opportunities for funds that are able to invest sta-
ble capital over a long period to generate added 
value. He also concluded that direct ownership 
ensures better management and control of indi-
vidual assets. 

3.3.4 Renewable energy infrastructure and 
infrastructure in emerging markets

Investment in renewable energy

Renewable energy infrastructure primarily com-
prises facilities for solar, wind, hydropower, bio-
mass and geothermal energy production. The 
market has grown significantly over the past 
decade, and continues to develop.

The expert group has recommended that the 
GPFG should be permitted also to invest in 
unlisted renewable energy infrastructure. The 
experts point out that such investments are 
expected to account for more than half of all 
investments in energy production in the next 30 
years. Changes in the energy market are generat-
ing investment opportunities, but the experts also 
stated that such investments are risky. There is a 
close connection between the return on invest-
ments in unlisted renewable energy infrastructure 
and traditional energy such as oil and gas. For 
example, a drop in oil and gas prices will, in isola-
tion, reduce the value of renewable energy invest-
ments and thus incentives to make new invest-
ments. The experts stated that investments in 
unlisted renewable energy infrastructure are not 
only exposed to oil-price risk but are generally 
also highly dependent on the authorities for 
favourable regulatory conditions. In the experts’ 
view, uncertainty about future subsidy policies 
constitutes a major risk which is difficult to quan-
tify.

The expert group reviewed historical returns 
and risk relating to renewable energy invest-
ments. The average annual return on listed equi-
ties in renewable energy companies since 2007 is 
minus seven percent – a considerable negative 
excess return compared to broad market indices. 
The analyses also show considerable fluctuations 
in returns, with the greatest volatility occurring in 
2008 when the market value of such companies 
dropped by some 65 percent; see Figure 3.3, 
which illustrates the development of renewable 
energy, equity and bond returns. Even though 
renewable energy investments have historically 
generated weak returns, the expert group’s analy-
ses show that such companies currently have 
high valuations. 

Norges Bank takes the view that it would be 
possible to invest in unlisted renewable energy 
infrastructure subject to the same profitability 
requirement as applies to other investments. The 
Bank is of the opinion that the risk profile of insti-
tutional investors makes large-scale renewable 
energy projects most relevant, since such invest-
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ments are capital-intensive, offer stable equity div-
idends and have a long investment horizon. How-
ever, this risk profile assumes predictable regula-
tory frameworks. This constitutes a material risk 
which must be thoroughly assessed prior to 
investment.

Investments in emerging markets

The expert group has recommended that the 
GPFG should also be permitted to invest in 
unlisted infrastructure in emerging markets. The 
experts state that this sub-market features both 
substantial investment opportunities and a high 
level of risk. According to the expert group, there 
will be substantial demand for infrastructure 
investment in developing countries in future, not 
least as a result of economic growth and urbanisa-
tion. Private institutional investors can play an 
important role in co-financing infrastructure proj-
ects with local authorities and various develop-
ment institutions. Further, unlisted infrastructure 
investments are generally associated with risks 
which do not arise in connection with listed invest-
ments. This applies particularly to investments in 
emerging markets, and encompasses both politi-
cal and regulatory risk as well as management 
and governance risk, including the risk of corrup-
tion. Operational risk is also high in emerging 
markets. Operational problems or accidents in 

infrastructure projects in which an investor has a 
large, direct ownership share may present consid-
erable reputational risk.

The expert group also pointed out that there is 
no lack of private capital available for investment 
in emerging markets. According to the experts, 
the considerable volume of available private capi-
tal on the one hand and the high demand for such 
projects on the other indicates a gap between the 
demanded risk-return ratio for such investments 
and available projects. The experts state that insti-
tutions like the IMF and World Bank can play an 
important role in reducing infrastructure invest-
ment risk in emerging markets to make invest-
ments attractive to investors.

Norges Bank has stated that the need for infra-
structure investments in emerging markets is 
considerable and probably growing. In the Bank’s 
view, such investments would present challenges 
because many types of risk are higher in emerg-
ing markets than in developed economies, includ-
ing risks relating to macro- and microeconomics, 
countries, currencies, politics, regulation, expro-
priation, reputation, corporate governance/cor-
ruption and operations. Co-investment with insti-
tutions that have extensive experience of these 
markets may help reduce risk somewhat. Accord-
ing to Norges Bank, if the Ministry were to permit 
investment in unlisted infrastructure, the Bank 
would develop its expertise gradually and initially 

Figure 3.3 Accumulated returns on the S&P Global Clean Energy Index, Barclays Global Aggregate Bond 
Index and MSCI ACWI Equity Index from February 2007 to July 2015. USD

Sources: Van Nieuwerburgh, Stanton and de Bever (2015).
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concentrate on investments offering highly 
secure future revenues in the most developed 
countries.

3.3.5 The Ministry’s assessment

The Ministry of Finance has noted the recommen-
dation of the expert group and Norges Bank that 
the GPFG should be permitted to invest in 
unlisted infrastructure. Both the expert group and 
Norges Bank take the view that this would grant 
access to an expanded investment universe and 
better opportunities to exploit the Fund’s distinc-
tive characteristics and advantages.

Further, unlisted investments are more com-
plex and resource-intensive to manage than listed 
investments, and there is a need to develop differ-
ent, more specialised expertise. Performance 
measurement is also more difficult with such 
investments, as is the measurement and manage-
ment of risk.

Lack of data on unlisted infrastructure makes 
it difficult to evaluate whether such investments 
give the average investor better risk diversifica-
tion or higher expected returns. Research into 
real estate investments shows that broad invest-
ments in unlisted and listed real estate have gen-
erated similar risk and return over time. This indi-
cates that it is uncertain whether investments in 
unlisted markets will help reduce risk through 
diversification or produce a higher expected 
return due to low liquidity. Investments in unlisted 
infrastructure are therefore expected to improve 
the risk-return ratio only if the manager has com-
parative advantages relative to other investors.

Although permitting investment in unlisted 
infrastructure may, in isolation, improve the range 
of investment opportunities available to the man-
ager, the Ministry has identified several important 
factors which speak against such an expansion of 
the Fund’s investment universe.

Many infrastructure investments are exposed 
to high regulatory or political risk. Long-term con-
tracts are commonplace in the infrastructure sec-
tor, and profitability is subject to the direct influ-
ence of political authorities in other countries 
through the setting of tariffs and other regula-
tions. There have been several examples in recent 
years of authorities amending the conditions for 
such investments through the renegotiation of 
signed agreements or changes to grant schemes.

In the case of unlisted investments, the owner-
ship stake in each individual investment will gen-
erally be large. As a result, the Fund’s investments 
will also be more visible and likely subject to criti-

cism. In the Ministry’s view, any conflicts relating 
to investments which are important public goods, 
or with the authorities of other countries, will be 
difficult to manage and entail high reputational 
risk for the GPFG. The Ministry considers that a 
transparent, politically endorsed sovereign fund 
like the GPFG is less suited to bear this type of 
risk than other investors. High transaction costs 
and low liquidity make divestment more challeng-
ing if problems were to arise.

The Ministry would also point out that the 
unlisted infrastructure market available to the 
GPFG is small. Unlisted infrastructure only 
accounts for approximately 0.5 percent of the 
global investable capital market, and most invest-
able infrastructure is listed. Infrastructure differs 
from real estate in this respect, since most of the 
real estate market is unlisted. Permitting invest-
ment in unlisted infrastructure will to a lesser 
degree expand the Fund’s investment opportuni-
ties than the decision to invest in unlisted real 
estate.

Both the expert group and Norges Bank have 
discussed the Fund’s distinctive characteristics 
and potential management advantages. Such 
advantages are difficult to quantify. The Ministry 
is of the opinion that more experience should be 
gained with the current portfolio of unlisted real 
estate investments before any expansion to 
include additional types of unlisted investment. 
Unlisted markets represent a type of management 
of which the GPFG has just a few years’ experi-
ence and, moreover, the unlisted real estate 
investments are still being built up.

Following an overall assessment, the Ministry 
of Finance has concluded that the GPFG should 
not be permitted to invest in unlisted infrastruc-
ture at this stage.

This also precludes unlisted infrastructure 
investments in the renewable energy and emerg-
ing markets sectors. These sectors have histori-
cally been associated with high financial, political 
and regulatory risk. In general, the Ministry of 
Finance considers that no separate guidelines 
should be issued on the proportion of the Fund’s 
capital to be invested in individual sectors or coun-
tries beyond what follows from the benchmark 
index. This applies especially to unlisted markets. 
Investments in unlisted markets are characterised 
by highly varying returns and risk levels, high 
transaction costs, a lack of publicly available infor-
mation and capacity limitations.

The GPFG has a financial target, and is not an 
instrument for promoting state investment in devel-
oping countries or renewable energy. There are 
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already several public policy instruments designed 
to promote investment in renewable energy and cli-
mate technology. Bodies such as Innovation Nor-
way, the Research Council of Norway and 
Gassnova have launched grant schemes and 
research and development programmes. Enova 
issues grants in support of energy-saving measures 
and renewable energy projects. Public investment 
in renewable energy occurs through channels 
including Investinor, Norfund and various interna-
tional development banks co-funded by Norway. 
Furthermore, the Storting has asked the Govern-
ment to prepare the establishment of a limited com-
pany mandated to invest in partnership with the pri-
vate sector in companies that develop and utilise 
green technologies. The Government will revert to 
this question in its revised budget for 2016.

3.4 New reporting and risk 
management requirements

3.4.1 Background

Norges Bank manages the GPFG on the basis of a 
mandate set by the Ministry of Finance. The man-
date expresses the investment strategy for the 
Fund, and contains provisions on matters includ-
ing the Fund’s benchmark index and risk limits.3

The Bank is permitted to deviate from the bench-
mark index within certain risk limits. The scope 
for deviations is defined by expected tracking 
error, which provides an indication of how much 
the return on the GPFG may be expected to devi-
ate from the benchmark index under normal cir-
cumstances. The report on the Fund for 2014 pro-
posed an increase in the scope for deviations from 
1 to 1.25 percentage points. The aim is to provide 
Norges Bank with better opportunities to exploit 
the distinctive characteristics of the Fund and 
management advantages to improve the risk-
return ratio.

In the management mandate, the Ministry of 
Finance requires Norges Bank to set a number of 
risk limits to supplement the limit on expected 
tracking error. The report on the Fund for 2014 
proposed the inclusion in the mandate of a 
requirement for a new, supplementary risk limit 
for large losses which are expected to materialise 
infrequently – referred to as tail risk. It was also 
proposed that new requirements be introduced 

regarding more detailed reporting on the risk 
assumed by the Bank in active management.

The changes proposed by the Ministry were 
based on the recommendations of an expert 
group comprising Andrew Ang, Michael Brandt 
and David Denison, who in 2013–2014 evaluated 
Norges Bank’s management of the GPFG.4 The 
Storting endorsed the amendments.

As part of the Ministry’s inclusion of new 
requirements in the management mandate, 
Norges Bank was asked, in a letter of 26 June 
2015, to make recommendations as to the form of 
such a supplementary risk limit, the expansion of 
public reporting on deviations between the return 
on the GPFG and the benchmark index set by the 
Ministry, and amendment of the reporting 
requirements in the mandate. The letter was dis-
cussed in the National Budget 2016. The Bank 
submitted its recommendations and assessments 
to the Ministry in a letter of 29 September 2015.

On 1 February 2016, the Ministry of Finance 
incorporated new risk limits and reporting 
requirements into the mandate to Norges Bank. 
The changes to the mandate are based on propos-
als sent to Norges Bank in a letter of 10 December 
2015 and the Bank’s reply of 28 January 2016. The 
new requirements for a supplementary risk limit 
and more detailed reporting are discussed further 
below. The scope for deviations from the bench-
mark index was increased as announced in the 
report on the Fund for 2014, in concert with the 
inclusion of new mandate requirements. 

3.4.2 New supplementary risk limit

There is no single risk measure that captures all 
risk dimensions arising in the management of the 
GPFG. Accordingly, a number of risk manage-
ment measures are used in different areas and at 
different management levels of the Fund. The 
Ministry of Finance regulates Norges Bank’s 
scope to deviate from the benchmark index 
through the limit on expected tracking error.

In the management mandate, the Ministry 
requires Norges Bank to set several supplemen-
tary risk limits for the investment activities. These 
include limits on credit and liquidity risk, leverage 
and securities borrowing. Insight into the opera-
tional consequences of these supplementary lim-
its requires market proximity, and their formula-
tion has therefore been delegated to the Bank. 

3 See section 2.1 for a detailed account of the investment 
strategy and chapter 8 for a discussion of the GPFG’s 
benchmark index.

4 The report by Ang, Brandt and Denison (2014) is available 
on the Ministry of Finance website. It is also discussed in 
the report on the Fund for 2013. 
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Nonetheless, the specific design of the limits must 
be submitted to the Ministry prior to implementa-
tion, as required in the mandate for the GPFG.

Long-term investors like the GPFG will gener-
ally be well suited to harvesting risk premiums 
over time by pursuing counter-cyclical strategies 
and strategies that systematically tilt investments 
towards assets with particular characteristics, 
referred to as factor strategies. Not all such risk 
premiums can be harvested passively by altering 
the composition of the benchmark index set by 
the Ministry of Finance. The harvesting of several 
such premiums has therefore been delegated to 
Norges Bank subject to the limits specified in the 
mandate.

The Ministry of Finance has previously dis-
cussed analyses showing that, historically, the 
harvesting of factor premiums has improved the 
risk-return ratio for investors like the GPFG. How-
ever, such strategies may entail long periods of 
higher or lower returns than on the benchmark 
index, and may have a clearly negative impact 
during periods of market turmoil. Ang, Brant and 
Denison also pointed out that factor strategies 
may result in sometimes sizable deviations 
between the return on the GPFG and the bench-
mark index when markets are turbulent. It is 
therefore important that the risk associated with 
such investment strategies is prudently managed 
and reported.

Expected tracking error fails to measure such 
risk adequately. Ang, Brandt and Denison there-
fore recommended that the risk of large devia-
tions between the GPFG return and the return on 
the benchmark index – which are expected to 
arise only rarely – be measured and restricted by 
means of a supplementary limit. They also pointed 
out that limits of this kind present several techni-
cal and operational challenges, and that it will be 
difficult to calculate such risk. In response, in its 
letter of 26 June 2015, the Ministry of Finance 
asked Norges Bank to consider how such a limit 
could be defined.

In accordance with Norges Bank’s proposal in 
its letter of 29 September 2015, the mandate for 
the GPFG was expanded with effect from 1 Febru-
ary 2016 through the inclusion of the requirement 
that the Bank must set a supplementary limit in 
respect of large anticipated negative deviations 
between the return on the equity and fixed-
income portfolios and the related benchmark 
index (expected shortfall risk). While the allow-
ance for expected tracking error measures and 
caps how much the return on the Fund is nor-
mally expected to deviate from the benchmark 

index, the limit on expected shortfall risk is 
designed to measure and cap the negative devia-
tion which can be expected in extreme cases.

The risk measurement function of the 
expected tracking error limit is based on a statisti-
cal distribution. The limit on expected shortfall 
risk, on the other hand, is designed to specify 
future outcomes on the basis of historical simula-
tions for the current portfolio. The measurement 
of expected shortfall risk is thus based on esti-
mates of the most negative deviations between the 
return on the GPFG and the return on the bench-
mark index the current portfolio would have expe-
rienced in the past. The calculations also incorpo-
rate a longer time period than the allowance for 
expected tracking error. Norges Bank has stated 
that these assumptions are meant to ensure that 
the limit on expected shortfall risk supplements 
the limit on expected tracking error.

Norges Bank presented the limit on expected 
shortfall risk to the Ministry of Finance in a letter 
of 8 February 2016. The Bank envisages that the 
limit on expected shortfall risk will be set so as to 
cap the negative deviation expected between the 
return on the GPFG and the return on the bench-
mark index in extreme cases at 3.75 percentage 
points.

Norges Bank has previously pointed out that 
proper use of this type of risk limit requires quali-
tative assessments to avoid undesirable portfolio 
adjustments and the restriction of opportunities to 
employ factor strategies and counter-cyclical man-
agement strategies that exploit the Fund’s distinc-
tive characteristics. In a letter of 1 February 2016, 
the Ministry of Finance asked Norges Bank to 
explain how the design of the limit ensures that 
shortfall risk is effectively measured and limited 
in the GPFG. In its letter of 8 February 2016, 
Norges Bank stated that the rules stipulate that 
the Bank’s Executive Board must be notified 
immediately when, in special situations, extreme 
market movements trigger a material change in 
the Fund’s measured shortfall risk, for example 
through the inclusion of new extreme observa-
tions in the calculation basis. The limit may be 
suspended until the Executive Board has consid-
ered the matter. In a letter to the Bank of 26 Feb-
ruary 2016, the Ministry assumed that the chair 
of the Executive Board, or one of the deputy 
chairs, will consider and if appropriate approve a 
suspension of the limit until the Executive Board 
can deal with the matter.

In its letter of 8 February 2016, Norges Bank 
stated that the Executive Board will in such situa-
tions consider amending the investment strate-
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gies, increasing the limit on shortfall risk beyond 
3.75 percentage points and, if relevant, the contin-
ued suspension of the limit. In the Bank’s view, 
this design will provide leeway not only to avoid 
undesirable portfolio adjustments, but also to pur-
sue strategies that exploit the Fund’s characteris-
tics and advantages in extreme market situations, 
while still measuring and limiting shortfall risk 
effectively.

3.4.3 New reporting requirements

The Government is focused on ensuring the 
greatest possible transparency in the manage-
ment of the GPFG. The Fund is currently 
regarded as one of the world’s most transparent 
funds. Transparency is an important principle in 
its own right, and a prerequisite for broad confi-
dence in and support for the management of the 
Fund. Prudent and relevant reporting is also 
important for the governance and supervision of 
the Fund.

Transparency about the management of the 
GPFG also strengthens the basis for maintaining 
profitable, long-term strategies during periods of 
weak results. Norges Bank is required to seek the 
highest possible return on the GPFG after asset 
management costs, subject to the limits applicable 
to its management activities. The allowance for 
deviations gives the Bank the opportunity to 
exploit the Fund’s distinctive characteristics and 
management advantages. Deviations from the 
benchmark index may raise or lower the GPFG’s 
absolute risk relative to the benchmark index. 
Long-term strategies used by the Bank in its man-
agement may produce weak returns during peri-
ods of market unrest. The experts Ang, Brandt 
and Denison proposed more detailed and relevant 
reporting to explain and support profitable long-
term investment choices. They recommended 
requiring the Bank to describe the principles 
which underpin, and the sources of, the excess 
return achieved through active management and 
to report on the expected risk budgets and histori-
cal results for each of these. A further recommen-
dation was that reports on risk and return relative 
to the benchmark index should distinguish 
between the contributions made by factor strate-
gies, increased investment diversification and 
security selection.

In its letter of 26 June 2015, the Ministry of 
Finance asked Norges Bank to evaluate and make 
recommendations on the expansion of the report-
ing requirements in the mandate and public 
reporting based on the recommendations of Ang, 

Brandt and Denison. In this connection, Norges 
Bank’s Executive Board asked an expert group 
consisting of Professors Magnus Dahlquist, Chris-
topher Polk, Richard Priestley and Bernt Arne 
Ødegaard to advise the Bank on the development 
of its performance and risk reporting.

In its reply of 29 September 2015, Norges 
Bank referred to planned changes in its public 
reporting. Reports on performance and risk are to 
be collated and expanded in a dedicated report. 
Returns and risks associated with different invest-
ment strategies will be decomposed as recom-
mended by Ang, Brandt and Denison. The recom-
mendations of Dahlquist, Polk, Priestley and Øde-
gaard (2015) will also be taken into account when 
designing the annual report. In the Bank’s view, 
the provision in the mandate that all relevant man-
agement risks must be reported on covers all 
detailed reporting needs the Ministry may have, 
and there is thus no need to include more detailed 
reporting requirements in the mandate for the 
management of the GPFG.

The mandate was amended as of 1 February 
2016 through the inclusion of more detailed 
reporting requirements relating to risk assumed 
by the Bank in active management, as outlined in 
the report on the Fund for 2014. The purpose of 
adopting new public reporting requirements is to 
provide better support for profitable, long-term 
strategies as recommended by Ang, Brandt and 
Denison. 

The Ministry of Finance has laid down a clear 
objective for Norges Bank’s public reporting on 
the management of the GPFG in section 6–1 of the 
mandate. The purpose is to promote the greatest 
possible transparency about the management of 
the Fund. Reports must provide true and compre-
hensive information on the Bank’s choices and 
priorities, the results achieved and utilisation of 
the limits set in the mandate.

The content requirements for public reports 
are set out in section 6–2 of the mandate. A dis-
tinction is made between three different levels of 
reporting: strategic, quarterly and annual.

The strategic reporting requirement is new, 
and emphasises the responsibility of Norges 
Bank’s Executive Board to adopt and report on 
the choice of investment strategies used in the 
management of the GPFG. The purpose of strate-
gic reporting is to secure public support for the 
investment strategies which are employed. Rele-
vant reporting and transparency about investment 
strategy choices can strengthen opportunities to 
maintain profitable long-term strategies during 
periods of weak results. Accordingly, section 1–7 
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of the mandate, which concerns the requirement 
for a strategic management plan, has also been 
amended. The provision now states that the 
Executive Board must have a strategic plan for the 
management of the GPFG. In its letter of 10 
December 2015 to Norges Bank, the Ministry of 
Finance emphasised that this responsibility may 
not be delegated.

The strategic report must separately describe 
the investment strategies adopted for the equity, 
fixed-income and real estate portfolios by the Exec-
utive Board. This includes the overarching princi-
ples governing the selection of strategies, the risk 
and return properties of the strategies and how the 
strategies aim to exploit the Fund’s distinctive char-
acteristics and the Bank’s asset management 
advantages. A separate account must be included of 
different investment strategies employed in the 
management of the equity and fixed-income portfo-
lios which may affect the Fund’s market risk and 
shortfall risk. The strategic report must also 
describe the framework for risk management and 
control, and how the asset management is organ-
ised. The strategic report must be issued regularly, 
and at least every three years.

In Norges Bank’s view, the reporting require-
ments should not be linked with a particular defini-
tion of the management assignment or the manage-
ment strategies. Rather, they should provide room 
for gradual development over time. The new 
reporting requirements have been designed 
accordingly. They are worded generally, and do not 
link the provisions with particular investment strat-
egies or a given definition of the management 
assignment. The Ministry of Finance therefore pro-
vided a number of clarifications of the provisions’ 
scope and delimitation in its letters to Norges Bank 
of 10 December 2015 and 1 February 2016.

The provisions on quarterly and annual report-
ing have been expanded through the inclusion of 
a requirement that Norges Bank must include a 
separate account of the sources of positive and 
negative excess returns in the equity and fixed-
income portfolios. Both Ang, Brandt and Denison 
(2014) and Dahlquist, Polk, Priestley and Øde-
gaard (2015) issued advice and recommendations 
on this type of performance breakdown. The Min-
istry of Finance referred to this advice in its letter 
to Norges Bank of 10 December 2015.

If reporting is too detailed and frequent, costs 
may arise, for example because other investors 
can exploit the information to profit from the 
Fund’s transactions. At the same time, transpar-
ency about the risk assumed in management is 
important. The new provisions on annual report-

ing require Norges Bank to provide a separate 
account of the results of all investment strategies 
entailing significant costs or high relative risk.5 The 
requirement is designed to promote transparency 
and public support for individual strategies with a 
material impact on the Fund’s relative results, 
irrespective of which level of the Bank’s gover-
nance structure has defined the strategy; see the 
discussion in the Ministry’s letter to Norges Bank 
of 1 February 2016. For each of these investment 
strategies, there must be given an account of the 
contribution to the differential return, utilisation 
of the expected tracking error limit, expected 
shortfall risk and asset management costs. In its 
letter to Norges Bank of 10 December 2015, the 
Ministry of Finance emphasised that pursuant to 
this requirement the Bank must present the 
results of different security selection strategies. A 
further requirement is that the Executive Board 
must evaluate the management performance.

Reports should generally provide insight into 
whether the manager has generated a higher 
return than could alternatively have been achieved 
by increasing risk by adjusting the benchmark 
index. However, no single model or single set of 
assumptions provides an unambiguous answer to 
the question of how, in hindsight, risk has influ-
enced results. Nor is there an unambiguous answer 
to the question of what adjustments can be made to 
the benchmark index. Accordingly, financial 
research employs a variety of approaches and mod-
els, all of which are based on different assumptions 
and produce different results. This indicates that a 
cautious approach should be taken when interpret-
ing estimates produced by such models, and that 
several approaches should be used to illuminate 
results. This is also consistent with the recommen-
dations of Dahlquist, Polk, Priestley and Ødegaard. 
The new provisions on annual reporting require 
Norges Bank to include a separate account of the 
risk-return ratio of the GPFG. Several methods and 
measures must be used when reporting on the risk-
adjusted return.

A further requirement is that Norges Bank 
must report annually on management revenues 
and costs, for example revenues generated by 
securities lending, tax costs, external asset man-
agement costs and estimated transaction costs.

Under the new requirements, quarterly 
reports must be published no later than one 

5 This follows from section 6–2(3)(a), as opposed to the pro-
vision regarding specification of excess return sources in 
quarterly and annual reports, which is found in section 6–
2(2)(b).
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month after the end of the quarter, while annual 
reports must, as at present, be published no later 
than three months after yearend. In its letter of 10 
December 2015, the Ministry of Finance stated 
that Norges Bank may choose to publish quar-
terly reports in electronic form only.

There is strong public interest in data on the 
investments of the GPFG. Data access allows 
reporting to be verified and supports the objective 
of ensuring the greatest possible transparency 
about management. In its letter of 29 September 
2015, Norges Bank stated that it would seek to 
ensure that methods for decomposing risk and 
return can be verified by control institutions out-
side the management organisation. In section 6–3 
of the mandate, the Ministry of Finance has 
included a requirement that data and methods
must be described and published insofar as possi-
ble.

The mandate for the GPFG and the letters 
referred to above are available on the Ministry of 
Finance website. 

3.5 Assessment of the equity portion

The proportion of the GPFG invested in equities 
is the single decision with the greatest impact on 
the Fund’s overall long-term risk and return. The 
GPFG was permitted to invest in equities in 1998. 
At that time, the equity portion was set at 40 per-
cent. This was increased to 60 percent in 2007. 
The remaining capital in the Fund is invested in 
fixed-income securities and real estate.

The GPFG has grown substantially since the 
initial capital transfer in 1996, and now totals more 
than two-and-a-half times the GDP of the Norwe-
gian mainland economy. In isolation, a higher 
equity portion will boost the Fund’s expected 
long-term return, but also entails higher risk and 
greater fluctuations in Fund value.

In the National Budget 2016, the Ministry of 
Finance announced a review of the GPFG’s equity 
portion. In January, the Government appointed a 
commission for this purpose. The commission will 
analyse expected risk and return with different 
equity portions, and is authorised to recommend 
changes to the equity portion. The assessment 
will examine matters such as the GPFG’s objec-
tive, time horizon, size and expected withdrawals. 
The commission will also consider whether any 
change to the equity portion should affect other 
fundamental choices in the investment strategy, 
such as the composition of the benchmark indices 
for equities and fixed-income securities.

The commission is composed of the following 
persons: 
– Chief Economist and Adjunct Professor Knut 

Anton Mork (chair), Oslo
– Chief Economist Harald Magnus Andreassen, 

Oslo
– Professor Hilde C. Bjørnland, Bærum
– Investor Harald Espedal, Stavanger
– Director Kristin Halvorsen, Oslo
– Associate Professor Espen Henriksen, Oslo
– County Governor Sigbjørn Johnsen, Ringsaker
– Group Executive Vice President Kari Olrud 

Moen, Oslo
– Professor Karin Thorburn, Bergen

The commission is due to submit its report by 15 
October 2016. The Ministry of Finance intends to 
circulate the report through a public consultation. 
Analyses and assessments will also be obtained 
from Norges Bank.6 The Ministry aims to discuss 
the question of the GPFG’s equity portion in the 
report on the Fund to be submitted to the Storting 
in the spring of 2017. 

3.6 Norges Bank’s governance 
structure

Norges Bank has developed a competent organi-
sation and delivered good long-term results in the 
management of the GPFG. However, the complex-
ity of management has increased in recent years 
as the size of the Fund has grown significantly and 
investments have been spread across different 
asset classes and securities. Asset management 
accounts for an increasing proportion of the 
Bank’s overall operations. Work on developing the 
management strategy for the Fund continues.

These developments impose new demands on 
the governance of the GPFG. This is the reason 
for the Government’s proposal to increase the 
number of deputy governors at Norges Bank from 
one to two as of 2016. The new deputy governor 
has been given special responsibility for asset 
management.

In April 2015, the Government appointed a com-
mission to review the Norges Bank Act (the Cen-
tral Bank Act) and the governance of Norges Bank. 
The commission’s mandate also includes a review 
of the governance structure for the management of 
the GPFG. The commission is chaired by Svein 
Gjedrem and is due to present its report in the 
spring of 2017.

6 See letter to Norges Bank of 12 February 2016.
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4  The Government Pension Fund Norway: 
strategy and performance

4.1 The current investment strategy

Folketrygdfondet manages the Government Pen-
sion Fund Norway (GPFN) in accordance with a 
mandate issued by the Ministry of Finance. The 
return on the GPFN is not transferred to the Trea-
sury, but is added to the Fund capital on an ongo-
ing basis. 

The long-term investment strategy for the 
GPFN is expressed through the composition of 
the benchmark index and appurtenant risk limits 
specified in the mandate. The benchmark index 
comprises 60 percent equities and 40 percent 
fixed-income securities, with allocations of 85 per-
cent to Norway and 15 percent to the rest of the 
Nordic region excluding Iceland; see Figure 4.1. 

The distinctive characteristics of the Fund, 
such as size and a long time horizon, distinguish 
the GPFN from many other investors in the Nor-
wegian capital market. The long time horizon 
enables the use of long-term investment strate-
gies, such as rebalancing of the equity portion. 

Size also entails certain benefits, including the 
ability to exploit economies of scale in asset man-
agement. At the same time, the size of the Fund 
relative to the Norwegian capital market makes it 
challenging to implement major changes to the 
investment composition within a short space of 
time.

Folketrygdfondet may, within moderate limits, 
deviate from the benchmark index. The purpose 
of such deviations is to generate an excess return 
over time, as well as to ensure cost-effective 
adjustment to the benchmark index. 

The mandate for the GPFN only allows for 
investment in unlisted companies in which the 
board of directors has expressed an intention to 
seek a listing on a regulated market place. How-
ever, it does not allow for the GPFN to be invested 
in unlisted assets like real estate and infrastruc-
ture on a general basis. The Ministry’s assess-
ment of whether investment of parts of the GPFN 
in unlisted real estate and infrastructure should 
be permitted is discussed in chapter 5.

Figure 4.1 Strategic benchmark index for the GPFN. Percent

Source: Ministry of Finance.
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Rebalancing rules form part of the investment 
strategy for the GPFN. Rebalancing involves the 
Fund adding to its holdings in the asset class with 
the weakest value performance in order to main-
tain the fixed allocation between equities and 
fixed-income securities as stipulated in the man-
date. To avoid influencing the market and to 
ensure the sound execution of asset management, 
the detailed rebalancing rules are exempt from 
public disclosure, in line with the advice of Folke-
trygdfondet.

4.2 Performance

4.2.1 Market developments

The Norwegian and Nordic stock markets had a 
positive development in 2015. The main index of 
the Oslo Stock Exchange (OSEBX) gained 5.9 
percent. Non-energy companies made a strong 
contribution. Low and falling oil prices resulted in 
negative returns on companies in the energy sec-
tor, particularly oil service companies. The Dan-
ish, Finnish and Swedish stock markets rose by 
38.4 percent (OMXCB index), 15.2 percent 
(OMXHB index) and 6.1 percent (OMXSB index), 
respectively, as measured in local currency.

Yields on Norwegian government bonds with 
a long time to maturity were approximately 

unchanged in 2015. At yearend, the yield on 10-
year Norwegian government bonds was about 
1.5 percent. Yields on corresponding bonds in 
Denmark, Finland and Sweden rose somewhat, 
but were lower than the yield on Norwegian gov-
ernment bonds at the end of the year. Private 
enterprises normally have to pay a higher inter-
est rate than the state when borrowing money. 
This mark-up, called the credit spread, increased 
substantially in 2015, particularly in the case of 
bonds issued by industrial enterprises and 
banks.

4.2.2 Market value

At yearend 2015, the market value of the GPFN 
was NOK 198.4 billion; see Figure 4.2A. The mar-
ket value increased by NOK 12.8 billion after asset 
management costs during the course of 2015. The 
value of the equity portfolio was NOK 118 billion. 
Norwegian equities accounted for NOK 95 billion 
of this total, whilst the value of stocks of compa-
nies in other Nordic countries, excluding Iceland, 
amounted to NOK 23 billion. The value of the 
fixed-income portfolio was NOK 80 billion, com-
prising NOK 64 billion from Norwegian bond issu-
ers and NOK 16 billion from issuers in other Nor-
dic countries. See Figure 4.2B for the GPFN’s 
investment distribution at the end of 2015.

Figure 4.2 Market value of the GPFN since 1996 and distribution of actual investments at yearend 2015
1 A major part of the GPFN’s capital was invested with the Treasury in the form of mandatory deposits until 2005. Folketrygd-

fondet’s participation in the mandatory deposit arrangement was discontinued in December 2006, and fund assets amounting to 
NOK 101.8 billion were repaid to the state.

Sources: Folketrygdfondet and Ministry of Finance.
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4.2.3 Return

The return on the GPFN in 2015 was 7.0 percent, 
measured in Norwegian kroner and before the 
deduction of asset management costs; see Table 
4.1. The return on both the equity and fixed-
income portfolios contributed positively to the 
aggregate return. Since January 1998, the GPFN 
has delivered an average annual return of 7.3 per-
cent. This corresponds to an average annual real 
rate of return after costs of 5.2 percent.

The Norwegian krone depreciated against the 
euro, the Swedish krona and the Danish krone in 
2015. As a result, the returns on the GPFN’s 
investments in affected countries were higher 

measured in Norwegian krone than in local cur-
rency. 

Equities

The equity portfolio achieved a return of 9.9 per-
cent in 2015; see Table 4.1. The Norwegian com-
panies in the equity portfolio generated a return 
of 6.6 percent, whilst the Nordic companies 
returned 25.3 percent, measured in Norwegian 
kroner. Whilst Nordic equities outperformed 
Norwegian equities on average, the depreciation 
of the Norwegian krone also contributed to the 
high return on the Nordic holdings measured in 
Norwegian krone. The average annual return on 

1 Nordic equity investments commenced in May 2001.
2 Nordic fixed-income investments commenced in February 2007.
Sources: Folketrygdfondet and Ministry of Finance.

Table 4.1 Return on the GPFN in 2015, in the last 3, 5 and 10 years, as well as over the period 1998–2015,  
measured in Norwegian kroner and before the deduction of asset management costs. Annual geometric 
average. Percent and percentage points

2015
Last 

3 years
Last 

5 years
Last 

10 years 1998–2015

GPFN

Actual portfolio 6.95 11.05 8.09 7.57 7.32

Benchmark index 6.47 10.43 7.40 6.46 6.79

Excess return (percentage points) 0.48 0.61 0.69 1.11 0.53

Equities1

Actual portfolio 9.89 14.74 8.88 8.34 8.21

Benchmark index 9.19 13.98 8.23 6.95 6.82

Excess return (percentage points) 0.69 0.76 0.65 1.39 1.39

Fixed-income securities2

Actual portfolio 2.93 5.25 6.32 6.08 6.10

Benchmark index 2.72 4.71 5.46 5.30 5.87

Excess return (percentage points) 0.21 0.54 0.86 0.78 0.23

Real return

Inflation 2.12 2.09 1.65 1.96 2.00

Costs 0.09 0.09 0.09 0.08 0.05

Net real rate of return 4.65 8.69 6.25 5.42 5.16
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the equity portfolio since January 1998 is 8.2 
percent.

Fixed-income securities

The fixed-income portfolio generated a return of 
2.9 percent in 2015. The return on the Norwegian 
part of the portfolio was 1.7 percent, whilst Nordic 
bonds generated a return of 9.4 percent measured 
in Norwegian kroner. The depreciation of the Nor-
wegian krone was the primary reason for the dif-
fering returns on Norwegian and Nordic bonds in 
2015. The average annual return on the fixed-
income portfolio since January 1998 is 6.1 per-
cent.

Duration is a measure of the average time to 
maturity for a fixed-income portfolio based on 
weighted future interest and coupon payments. 
The longer the duration, the greater the capital 
loss in the fixed-income portfolio if interest rates 
were to rise. At yearend 2015, the GPFN’s fixed-
income portfolio had a duration of 4.6 years, 
approximately in line with the benchmark index. 
Although yields on five-year Norwegian and Finn-
ish government bonds fell somewhat in 2015 – a 
development which in isolation entailed capital 
gains on these securities – rising yields on corre-
sponding Swedish and Danish bonds triggered 
capital losses. Yields remain higher in Norway 
than in the other Nordic countries, boosting cur-
rent returns on Norwegian government bonds. 
Increasing credit spreads entailed weaker returns 
on bonds issued by private companies.

4.2.4 Management excess return

The return on the actual investments in the GPFN 
is measured against the return on the benchmark 
index set by the Ministry of Finance. The differ-
ence between the two returns is referred to as the 
gross excess return, and is a measure of the 
results achieved by Folketrygdfondet in its man-
agement of the GPFN. This performance measure 
reflects the division of labour between the Minis-
try and Folketrygdfondet, and is a reasonable esti-
mate of net value added through active manage-
ment. See chapter 7 for further discussion of the 
gross excess return as a management perfor-
mance measure.

In 2015, Folketrygdfondet achieved a return 
on the GPFN which was 0.48 percentage points 
higher than the return on the benchmark index; 
see Table 4.1. The excess return is attributable to 
the adoption of a somewhat different investment 
composition for the GPFN than implied by the 

benchmark index. Income from the lending of 
securities to other investors also contributed to 
the excess return.

Equities

The return on the equity portfolio in 2015 was 
0.69 percentage points higher than the return on 
the benchmark index for equities. The excess 
return on Norwegian equities contributed 0.52 
percentage points, whilst the excess return on 
other Nordic equities contributed 0.08 percentage 
points. Securities lending revenues accounted for 
0.08 percentage points of the excess return on the 
equity portfolio.

The excess return on the equity portfolio is 
primarily due to different strategies in the area of 
security selection, including a strategy which 
emphasises the companies’ long-term risk and 
return properties. Folketrygdfondet typically 
invests less in companies with high financial or 
operational risk. In 2015, this strategy entailed 
that the equity portfolio generally included a 
lower proportion of energy-sector companies than 
implied by the benchmark index. In isolation, this 
contributed 1.1 percentage points to the excess 
return. Strategies which reduced the proportion 
invested in companies in the materials and con-
sumer goods sectors produced a negative excess 
return in 2015.

Fixed-income securities

Folketrygdfondet’s strategy for the fixed-income 
portfolio was adjusted in January 2015. The 
reported excess return is now split between a 
strategy for fixed-income holdings, a credit strat-
egy and securities lending revenue. As a result of 
the change, the distribution of the excess return 
in the fixed-income portfolio between Norwegian 
and Nordic issuers no longer reflects the result of 
Folketrygdfondet’s real risk-taking.

The return on the fixed-income portfolio was 
0.21 percentage points higher than the return on 
the fixed-income benchmark index in 2015. The 
strategy for fixed-income holdings entailed the 
adoption of a different maturity structure for the 
government bonds in the fixed-income portfolio 
than that of the benchmark index, and contributed 
0.06 percentage points to the excess return. The 
credit strategy increased the proportion of corpo-
rate bonds in the GPFN compared to the bench-
mark index, but also reduced the maturities of the 
credit bonds somewhat. This strategy contributed 
0.03 percentage points. Securities lending reve-
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nue totalled 0.04 percentage points. Other effects 
contributed 0.08 percentage points.

Excess return over time

The Ministry of Finance has previously stated an 
expectation of annual net value added through 
active management to total 0.25–0.5 percentage 
points. Since January 1998, Folketrygdfondet has 
achieved a return on the GPFN which is 0.53 per-
centage points higher than the return on the 
benchmark index adopted by the Ministry. Calcu-
lations by the Ministry estimate the GPFN’s gross 
excess return in the period January 1998–2015 at 
approximately NOK 9.4 billion.1 More than NOK 
8 billion of this total is attributable to the excess 
return on Norwegian equities. Figure 4.3 illus-
trates the development of the gross excess return.

4.2.5 Risk-adjusted return

In the management mandate for the GPFN, the 
Ministry of Finance has stipulated a scope for devi-
ation from the benchmark index of 3 percentage 
points, measured by expected tracking error. The 
allowance permits Folketrygdfondet to exploit the 

Fund’s distinctive characteristics and advantages to 
secure an excess return through active manage-
ment. Deviations from the benchmark index may 
entail somewhat higher or lower absolute risk for 
the GPFN relative to the benchmark index. In 
financial literature, different models and measures 
are used to evaluate the excess return by reference 
to the risk taken by the manager. These include the 
information ratio and the Sharpe ratio.

The literature also employs models to explain 
historical results where a distinction is made 
between returns achieved by the manager through 
the acceptance of systematic risk and returns 
stemming from other deviations. Such methods 
are associated with considerable uncertainty; see 
the discussion in section 7.4. The Ministry of 
Finance regularly reviews the management of the 
GPFN, analysing and evaluating risk-taking. The 
risk-taking analyses in the most recent reviews of 
the management of the GPFN show that Folke-
trygdfondet’s excess return cannot be explained 
by increased systematic risk-taking.

Information ratio

The scope for expected tracking error is the most 
important limit on market risk in the mandate 
issued by the Ministry. The information ratio mea-
sures the excess return achieved by Folke-
trygdfondet through its management activities by 
reference to relative risk. This measure of the 

1 The gross excess return in Norwegian kroner is calculated 
by multiplying the monthly gross return by the capital 
invested at the beginning of the month and then adding up 
all the monthly totals. The calculation therefore excludes 
the effect of compound interest.

Figure 4.3 Gross excess return from Folketrygdfondet’s active management in 2015 and since 1998

Sources: Folketrygdfondet and Ministry of Finance.
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risk-adjusted return is therefore relevant in 
assessing Folketrygdfondet’s active management

In 2015, the information ratio for the GPFN 
was 0.83; see Table 4.2 and Figure 4.4B. Accord-
ingly, every percentage point of relative risk was 
on average compensated by 0.83 percentage 
points of excess return. Measured in this way, 
active management has helped secure compensa-
tion for the relative risk taken in both the equity 
portfolio and the fixed-income portfolio. The cal-
culations for individual years are based on a limi-
ted number of observations, and are therefore 
uncertain.

In the period 1998–2015, Folketrygdfondet 
achieved an information ratio of 0.36 for the 
GPFN. During this period, the Fund received 
approximately equal compensation for the relative 
risk taken in the equity portfolio and the fixed-
income portfolio.

Sharpe ratio

In 2015, Folketrygdfondet achieved a Sharpe ratio 
for the GPFN which exceeded the corresponding 
ratio for the benchmark index by 0.08. This indi-
cates that Folketrygdfondet’s active management 
helped secure better compensation for the portfo-
lio’s aggregate risk than would have been achieved 
by investing in line with the benchmark index. 
However, the calculation is based on a limited num-
ber of observations, and is therefore uncertain. 

The difference between the Sharpe ratio for the 
actual investments and the benchmark index in the 
period January 1998–2015 is also 0.08. Although 
the GPFN has had a lower risk level than the 
benchmark index, it has generated a somewhat 
higher return. The result is a better risk-return 
ratio compared to the benchmark index.

4.2.6 Risk and limits

Absolute risk

Folketrygdfondet has estimated the expected flu-
ctuations in the GPFN at 8.3 percent at yearend 
2015, or about NOK 16.6 billion, as measured by 
standard deviation. Assuming a normally distrib-
uted return figure, the fluctuations will exceed 
one standard deviation in one out of three years. 

Absolute volatility figures for the GPFN and 
the equity and fixed-income portfolios are based 
on actual monthly return data, and show that his-
torical fluctuations in the GPFN are lower than the 
fluctuations in the benchmark index; see Figure 
4.5A. Historically, therefore, Folketrygdfondet’s 
active management has contributed to reduce fluc-
tuations in the GPFN. The figure also shows that 
the fluctuations in the benchmark index largely 
determine the fluctuations in the Fund. In connec-
tion with its review of Folketrygdfondet’s manage-
ment of the GPFN – discussed in the report on the 
Fund for 2014 – the Ministry of Finance calculated 

Figure 4.4 Risk-adjusted return for the GPFN in 2015 and since 1998

Sources: Folketrygdfondet and Ministry of Finance.
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that over 98 percent of the fluctuations in the 
return on the GPFN in the period January 1998–
2014 can be explained by fluctuations in the return 
on the benchmark index. The proportion of fluctu-
ations attributable to fluctuations in the bench-
mark index has increased over time.

Relative risk

At yearend 2015, expected tracking error totalled 
0.6 percentage points – 0.1 percentage points 

lower than at the beginning of the year. Folke-
trygdfondet is thus utilising a small proportion of 
the 3 percentage point deviation allowance 
granted by the Ministry.

Realised tracking error expresses historical 
fluctuations in the excess return. Last year, the 
fluctuations in the difference in returns between 
the GPFN and the Fund’s benchmark index 
totalled approximately 0.5 percentage points; see 
Figure 4.5B. Both expected and realised tracking 
error were low at the end of 2015 compared to the 

Sources: Folketrygdfondet and Ministry of Finance.

Table 4.2 Absolute and relative risk measures for the GPFN in 2015, in the last 3, 5 and 10 years, as well as over 
the period 1998–2015. Annual figures based on monthly observations

2015
Last 

3 years
Last 

5 years
Last 

10 years 1998–2015

GPFN

Absolute volatility actual portfolio  
(percent) 6.71 5.59 7.07 10.51 8.29

Absolute volatility benchmark index 
(percent) 6.85 5.81 7.26 11.11 8.85

Tracking error (percentage points) 0.51 0.60 0.55 1.20 1.24

Sharpe ratio difference 0.08 0.16 0.11 0.12 0.08

Information ratio 0.83 0.90 1.14 0.81 0.36

Equity portfolio

Absolute volatility actual portfolio  
(percent) 11.18 9.26 12.28 18.85 20.02

Absolute volatility benchmark index 
(percent) 11.51 9.70 12.63 20.04 21.30

Tracking error (percentage points) 0.82 0.99 0.91 2.29 3.55

Sharpe ratio difference 0.08 0.13 0.06 0.08 0.07

Information ratio 0.70 0.63 0.61 0.45 0.29

Fixed-income portfolio

Absolute volatility actual portfolio  
(percent) 2.14 2.39 2.32 2.60 2.57

Absolute volatility benchmark index 
(percent) 2.25 2.52 2.54 2.64 2.86

Tracking error (percentage points) 0.50 0.37 0.55 0.65 0.77

Sharpe ratio difference 0.14 0.29 0.50 0.30 0.17

Information ratio 0.39 1.37 1.47 1.13 0.27
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average since January 1998. This finding accords 
with analyses showing that fluctuations in the 
return on the benchmark index explain a large 
and increasing proportion of the return on the 
GPFN.

Tracking error is generally affected by various 
factors, including market fluctuations. During 
periods of large market movements, tracking 
error is expected to increase.

Credit risk

The overall value-weighted credit quality of Folke-
trygdfondet’s fixed-income investments can be cal-
culated based on the market values and credit rat-
ings2 of the bonds in the portfolio. In 2015, the 
fixed-income portfolio had a value-weighted credit 
quality of AA, measured by credit rating. The 
value-weighted credit quality was unchanged from 
the beginning of the year. During 2015, Folke-
trygdfondet reduced the proportion of bonds with 
the lowest credit quality (high-yield bonds).

High-yield bonds are not included in the 
benchmark index for the GPFN. In the manage-

ment mandate, the Ministry of Finance has 
allowed for investments in high-yield bonds sub-
ject to a specified limit. At the end of 2015, high-
yield bonds accounted for seven percent of the 
market value of corporate bonds in the fixed-
income portfolio, equivalent to just over five per-
cent of the fixed-income portfolio as a whole. This 
is well within the limit stipulated by the Ministry.

4.2.7 Costs

Folketrygdfondet’s actual annual asset manage-
ment costs relating to the GPFN are covered sub-
ject to a limit set by the Ministry of Finance. In 
2015, the cost limit was set at NOK 175 million. 
Folketrygdfondet’s asset management costs for 
the GPFN amounted to NOK 168.1 million,3

including equity dividends of NOK 1.4 million pay-
able to the state. Measured as a proportion of 
average capital under management in 2015, the 
costs totalled 8.6 basis points (0.086 percent).

Figure 4.6 shows developments in asset man-
agement costs over time. The GPFN’s manage-
ment costs increased substantially in 2007 and 
2008 measured in both krone value and basis 
points. This was due to the repayment of NOK 
101.8 billion to the state when Folketrygdfondet’s 

2 The rating scale for credit quality is AAA, AA, A, BBB, BB, 
B, CCC, CC, C, D, with AAA as the top rating. Bonds with a 
credit rating from AAA to BBB, inclusive, are deemed to 
have high creditworthiness and are termed “investment 
grade” bonds. Bonds with lower creditworthiness are 
deemed to have low creditworthiness and are termed “high 
yield” bonds.

Figure 4.5 Rolling 12-month standard deviation of the return on the GPFN

Sources: Folketrygdfondet and Ministry of Finance.
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sion scheme into a contribution-based scheme.



60 Meld. St. 23 Report to the Storting (white paper) 2015–2016
The management of the Government Pension Fund in 2015
participation in the mandatory deposit arrange-
ment was discontinued in December 2006. This 
approximately halved the GPFN’s market value. 
In addition, stricter risk management and compli-
ance and reporting requirements were introduced 
in 2007, of which necessitated substantial invest-
ments and recruitment of additional employees.

The Canadian company CEM Benchmarking 
Inc. compares the costs of the GPFN with the 
costs of other funds internationally. It follows from 
the report for 2014 that the costs of the GPFN are 
significantly lower than those of comparable 
funds. This is primarily because the GPFN is not 
invested in assets such as unlisted equities, real 
estate and infrastructure, which generally involve 
higher costs than listed equities and bonds. How-
ever, CEM has found that the costs of the GPFN 
are low even if adjusted for asset composition dif-
ferences. The main explanation for this is that all 
management of the GPFN is handled internally by 
Folketrygdfondet, and that internal management 
costs are low compared to those of other funds.

4.2.8 The Ministry’s assessment

2015 was a year of substantial stock market fluctu-
ations and falling oil prices. Interest rates 
remained approximately unchanged, while credit 
spreads on bonds issued by private companies 

rose significantly. The deprecation of the Norwe-
gian krone contributed to high returns on the 
GPFN’s investments in other Nordic countries, 
measured in Norwegian kroner. The Ministry is 
satisfied with the fact that, in a challenging year, 
the GPFN achieved a return on a par with the 
average return since 1998. The return on the 
fixed-income investments was low, and interest 
levels remained low at yearend. Bonds are 
expected to continue generating low returns 
going forward.

The return achieved on the GPFN in 2015 
exceeded the return on the benchmark index by 
0.48 percentage points. This is in line with the 
average since 1998. The excess return was high 
relative to the utilisation of the scope for devia-
tions from the benchmark index, both in absolute 
terms and compared to the average since 1998. 
The Ministry of Finance emphasises performance 
development over time, and has noted that the 
average annual gross return since 1998 has been 
about 0.5 percentage points higher than the 
benchmark index, which is in the upper range of 
the Ministry’s expressed expectation as to the 
long-term excess return.

The asset management costs of the GPFN are 
low compared to other funds. The Ministry finds 
it satisfactory that the management of the GPFN 
appears to be cost effective, and will continue 
emphasising cost-effective asset management 
going forward.

4.3 Third party verification

4.3.1 Assurance engagement

As part of the Ministry of Finance’s follow-up and 
supervision of the management of the GPFN in 
2015, the audit firm Ernst & Young has reviewed 
the design and implementation of certain aspects 
of the part of the framework established by Folke-
trygdfondet. The reports on such reviews, so-
called assurance statements, are available on the 
Ministry’s website.

One of the review topics is Folketrygdfondet’s 
design and implementation of the governance and 
compliance framework for leverage, borrowing, 
securities lending and short selling. This includes 
the risk management and compliance processes 
for financial and operational risk established to 
support the implementation of leverage, borrow-
ing, securities lending and short selling. As part of 
the engagement, the auditor has, inter alia, 
reviewed governing documents and other rele-
vant written materials, held meetings with senior 

Figure 4.6 Development in GPFN asset manage-
ment costs, 1998–2014. NOK million (left axis) and 
basis points (right axis). One basis point = 0.01 percent

Sources: Folketrygdfondet and Ministry of Finance.
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executives and employees at Folketrygdfondet, 
and reviewed relevant processes.

The auditor has not examined whether risk 
management and compliance measures have been 
effective and have functioned as intended, nor 
evaluated whether the risks identified by Folke-
trygdfondet are complete and representative of its 
management activities.

The assurance statement concludes that, in all 
material respects, the design and implementation 
of the framework conform to the measurement 
criteria adopted by the auditor. The assessment is 
based on the current risk profile of Folketrygdfon-
det. It is emphasised that matters currently con-
sidered immaterial may become more important, 
and thus require reassessment by reference to a 
new risk profile, in the event of material changes 
to the product range of financial instruments or an 
increase in the applicable limits.

A further review topic is Folketrygdfondet’s 
design and implementation of the framework for 
calculating the benchmark index, including 
return calculations for 2015. The auditor has 
reviewed Folketrygdfondet’s process and method 
for calculating the return on the benchmark 
index, recalculating the return and comparing 
selected index values included in the calculations 
with those received from external index provid-
ers.

The assurance statement concludes that the 
design and implementation of Folketrygdfondet’s 
framework for calculating the benchmark index 
for 2015 complies with the Ministry’s mandate for 
the management of the GPFN in all material 
respects. The return calculation for 2015 also 
complies with the GPFN mandate in all material 
respects.
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5  The Government Pension Fund Norway: 
refinement of strategy and management

5.1 Unlisted real estate and 
infrastructure

5.1.1 Background

The Ministry of Finance has reviewed investment 
in unlisted real estate and infrastructure by the 
Government Pension Fund. The report on the 
Fund for 2014 discussed Folketrygdfondet’s rec-
ommendations and assessments.

In a letter to the Ministry of Finance of 13 
November 2014, Folketrygdfondet recom-
mended that the Government Pension Fund 
Norway (GPFN) should be permitted to invest 
in unlisted real estate and infrastructure subject 
to a cap of 10 percent of the Fund’s capital. It 
was recommended that unlisted real estate and 
infrastructure should not be included in the 
benchmark index for the GPFN, but rather be 
measured against the current benchmark index 
composed of listed equities and bonds. Folke-
trygdfondet envisaged initially investing in Nor-
way before subsequently expanding into the 
Nordic region. It argued that such an expansion 
of the investment universe could help spread 
the Fund’s risk and increase the return after 
costs.

In the report on the Fund for 2014, the Minis-
try of Finance indicated that it would revert to the 
question of including unlisted real estate and 
infrastructure investments in the GPFN after fur-
ther evaluation. A corresponding assessment was 
also to be undertaken for the GPFG.

5.1.2 The Ministry’s assessment

When assessing investments in unlisted real 
estate and infrastructure, it is deemed appropriate 
to start with the objective of risk diversification 
and potential advantages. In the Ministry’s view, 
there are material differences between the GPFN 
and GPFG in this respect. It is also important to 
consider the analyses and recommendations the 
Ministry has received on the inclusion of unlisted 
investments in the GPFG; see section 3.2.

As opposed to the GPFG, the investment strat-
egy for the GPFN is not based on the broadest 
possible diversification of risk. The current bench-
mark index for the GPFN is composed primarily 
of listed equities and bonds in Norway. The com-
position of the benchmark index for equities is 
thus determined by which companies are listed on 
the Oslo Stock Exchange at any given time, and 
corresponding market values. The earnings of 
many of the companies listed on the Oslo Stock 
Exchange are materially affected by changes in 
commodity prices and international economic 
conditions.

In isolation, permitting investment in unlisted 
real estate and infrastructure may improve risk 
diversification in the GPFN compared to the cur-
rent benchmark index, but this can also be 
achieved by other, simpler means. As stated, 
GPFN’s investment strategy is not designed to 
achieve broad risk diversification, since the Nor-
wegian state already meets this objective through 
its investments in the GPFG.

The state already has substantial real estate 
and infrastructure holdings in Norway. In the view 
of the Ministry of Finance, this must be taken into 
account when evaluating whether the state’s 
aggregate risk would be reduced by permitting 
the GPFN to invest more in unlisted real estate 
and infrastructure. The Ministry regards the Nor-
wegian infrastructure investment market as small 
and underdeveloped. Any investments in unlisted 
infrastructure by the GPFN would most likely 
result from the sale of such assets by central or 
local government. Such a transfer of ownership 
would leave the state’s overall risk level 
unchanged, and usually generate significant trans-
action costs. Moreover, financial investors in this 
market are subject to extensive public regulation, 
since infrastructure is normally an important pub-
lic good.

Unlisted investments are generally more diffi-
cult to implement than listed investments. When 
making unlisted investments, a manager cannot 
invest in accordance with a market index at low 
cost as in a listed market. It is also more difficult 
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to measure performance and manage risk in con-
nection with such investments, and unlisted 
investments are more expensive to downscale in 
the event of negative experiences.

The expert report on real estate and infra-
structure in the GPFG (Van Nieuwerburgh, Stan-
ton and de Bever, 2015) contains a review of rele-
vant financial literature. It shows that broad 
investments in unlisted and listed real estate have 
generated similar returns and risk over time. It is 
therefore uncertain whether broad investment in 
unlisted markets will help reduce risk through 
diversification or produce a higher expected 
return due to low liquidity. Further, the range of 
results achieved by the managers in unlisted mar-
kets is wider than the range of results achieved in 
listed markets, indicating that unlisted invest-
ments should only be made if the manager has or 
can develop advantages.

In the Ministry’s view, it is uncertain whether 
Folketrygdfondet has natural advantages or will 
be able to develop advantages in the unlisted real 
estate and infrastructure markets. The expert 
report on real estate and infrastructure in the 
GPFG refers to two studies which found that large 
investors who develop internal expertise can 
achieve both reduced costs and higher returns 
than smaller investors. Any unlisted real estate 
and infrastructure investments by the GPFN will 
be small in comparison with many other manag-
ers of such asset. In addition, the GPFN’s capital 
is too small to make Folketrygdfondet a major 
player in the Nordic market compared to other 
international investors.

Following an overall assessment, the Ministry 
of Finance is not prepared to permit the GPFN to 
invest in unlisted real estate and infrastructure.
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6  Responsible management

6.1 The current framework

The objective for the investments in the Govern-
ment Pension Fund is to achieve the highest pos-
sible return, given a moderate level of risk. The 
Fund shall also be a responsible investor. The 
Ministry of Finance sets the general framework 
for Norges Bank and Folketrygdfondet’s responsi-
ble management of the GPFG and GPFN, respec-
tively.

The Ministry of Finance assumes that a good 
long-term return depends on well-functioning 
markets and a sustainable development. This 
applies particularly to a large, diversified and long-
term investor like the Fund, which will generally 
achieve a return in line with value creation in the 
economy. Individual companies may profit by 
ignoring serious harm to others (negative exter-
nalities). For a universal, long-term owner, how-
ever, such gains may be counteracted by lower 
returns on other parts of the portfolio, or in the 
future.

The mandates for the management of the 
GPFG and GPFN refer to internationally rec-
ognised responsible management principles and 
standards, such as the UN Global Compact, the 
OECD Principles of Corporate Governance and 
the OECD Guidelines for Multinational Enter-
prises. These international standards specify good 
corporate governance norms and set out expecta-
tions to companies’ handling of issues such as 
environmental and social conditions; see Box 6.1.

The Ministry of Finance, Norges Bank and 
Folketrygdfondet have also joined the Principles 
for Responsible Investment (PRI) Initiative, which 
concentrates on asset owners, asset managers and 
professional collaboration partners. It is sup-
ported by two UN partners: the Global Compact 
and the UN Environment Programme Finance Ini-
tiative (UNEP FI). The PRI Initiative encompasses 
six responsible investment principles, including 
respect for the environment, society and corpo-
rate governance in management and the exercise 
of ownership rights.

Figure 6.1 Distribution of roles and responsibilities in the responsible management of the Government 
Pension Fund

Source: Ministry of Finance. 
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Box 6.1 International standards and principles

The mandates for the GPFG and GPFN refer to 
three internationally recognised standards and 
principles designed to ensure that good corpo-
rate governance and environmental and social 
conditions are taken into account in the asset 
management.

OECD Guidelines for Multinational Enterprises 

The OECD Guidelines for Multinational Enter-
prises are voluntary, non-statutory recommen-
dations intended to promote responsible con-
duct in all business sectors. They were launched 
in 1976, and most recently updated in 2011. Indi-
vidual enterprises should assess independently 
how the guidelines can best be implemented. 
Countries which have adopted the guidelines 
are obliged to establish a national contact point 
for responsible business conduct. The contact 
points are mandated to spread knowledge about 
the guidelines and offer dialogue and mediation 
in individual cases. The Norwegian contact 
point is an independent specialist body subject 
to the administrative oversight of the Ministry of 
Foreign Affairs.

The guidelines are based on the existing 
obligation of states under international law to 
protect individuals against violations by third 
parties, in this case businesses. The principles 
emphasise that states should formulate clear 
expectations that companies located in their 
jurisdiction must respect human rights both 
nationally and internationally. However, any fail-
ure by a business to respect human rights does 
not constitute a human rights violation in a legal 
sense.

The guidelines provide that companies must 
avoid causing or contributing to negative effects 
through their own operations or business rela-
tionships, and that they must address cases in 
which such effects do occur. Guidance is also 
provided on how companies should follow up on 
their supply chains. Finally, the guidelines ask 
companies to conduct due diligence assess-
ments to ensure that obligations are met. 

UN Global Compact 

The UN Global Compact is currently the world’s 
largest corporate social responsibility initiative, 
with more than 12,000 participants in over 170 

countries. The initiative is voluntary and focuses 
primarily on the commercial sector. Companies 
are urged to comply with 10 universal principles 
relating to human rights, labour rights, the envi-
ronment and anti-corruption. Participants must 
report annually on their efforts to implement 
the principles in their operations. The results 
are published in the annual Global Corporate 
Sustainability Report.

The principles are based on the Universal 
Declaration of Human Rights, the ILO Declara-
tion on Fundamental Principles and Rights at 
Work, and the Rio Declaration on Environment 
and Development. The principles are general in 
nature and state, inter alia, that businesses 
should respect human rights, should uphold the 
freedom of association and collective bargain-
ing, and eliminate all forms of forced and com-
pulsory labour, child labour and discrimination 
with respect to employment and occupation. 
Furthermore, businesses should support a pre-
cautionary approach to environmental chal-
lenges and promote the environment, develop-
ment and environmentally friendly technologies. 
They should also combat all forms of corrup-
tion, including extortion and bribery. 

G20/OECD Principles of Corporate Governance 

The G20/OECD Principles of Corporate Gover-
nance address matters such as the distribution 
of roles and responsibilities between the own-
ers, board of directors and the senior executives 
of a company. The principles are designed to 
promote a common understanding of best prac-
tice in areas such as transparency and disclo-
sure, equitable treatment of shareholders, and 
the responsibilities and liabilities of board of 
directors. The principles also give input to 
national decision-makers on executive remuner-
ation, the conduct of institutional investors and 
the establishment of well-functioning stock mar-
kets.

The principles are based on the view that 
good governance over time promotes company 
value growth, access to financing and well-func-
tioning capital markets. Effective corporate 
governance and capital allocation in turn pro-
mote welfare and general economic growth. 
The G20 adopted the principles in the autumn 
of 2015.



66 Meld. St. 23 Report to the Storting (white paper) 2015–2016
The management of the Government Pension Fund in 2015
Important tools in the responsible manage-
ment of the Fund include the promotion of 
standards, principles and relevant research. 
Further tools are the expression of expectations 
as an owner, the exercise of ownership rights 
through engagement with companies and voting 
at general meetings. Considerations relating to 
corporate governance, the environment and social 
conditions are integrated into management activi-
ties.

The Ministry of Finance has adopted the ethi-
cally motivated guidelines for observation and 
exclusion from the GPFG; see Box 6.2. Some cri-
teria provide for the exclusion of companies based 
on their products, such as tobacco, weapons and 
coal. Other exclusion criteria are conduct-based 

and address matters such as serious human rights 
violations and severe environmental damage. The 
Council on Ethics makes recommendations as to 
whether a company should be excluded or placed 
under observation. The final decision is made by 
Norges Bank.

The use of policy instruments relating to coal 
and petroleum companies has been amended in 
accordance with the Storting’s deliberation of the 
report on the Fund for 2014 and the National Bud-
get 2016. Among other things, the Ministry of 
Finance has included a conduct-based climate cri-
terion and a product-based criterion directed at 
coal companies in the guidelines for observation 
and exclusion from the GPFG. The new criteria 
took effect on 1 January and 1 February 2016, 

Box 6.2 Guidelines for Observation and Exclusion from the Government Pension 
Fund Global

The Ministry of Finance has adopted ethically 
motivated guidelines on the observation and 
exclusion of companies from the GPFG. Some 
exclusion criteria are product-based, while oth-
ers focus on conduct. The Fund is also prohib-
ited from investing in bonds issued by certain 
sovereign states. Companies may be placed 
under observation if there is doubt about 
whether the exclusion conditions are met or 
uncertainty as to future developments, or when 
deemed appropriate for other reasons.

The product criteria provide that the Fund’s 
assets may not be invested in companies which 
themselves or through entities they control:
– produce weapons that violate fundamental 

humanitarian principles through their nor-
mal use;

– produce tobacco; or 
– sell weapons or military materiel to sovereign 

states in whose government bonds the Fund 
is barred from investing.

The weapons criterion encompasses chemical 
weapons, biological weapons, anti-personnel 
mines, undetectable fragmentation weapons, 
incendiary weapons, blinding laser weapons, 
cluster munitions and nuclear arms.1 Moreover, 
the Fund shall not be invested in companies that 
develop or produce key components for these 
types of weapons.

The tobacco criterion is limited to the actual 
tobacco product, and does not include associ-

ated products such as filters and flavour addi-
tives or the sale of tobacco products. All compa-
nies that grow tobacco plants or process tobacco 
into end products, whether directly or through 
entities they control, shall be excluded.

Observation or exclusion may also be 
decided for mining companies and power pro-
ducers which themselves or through entities 
they control derive 30 per cent or more of their 
income from thermal coal or base 30 per cent or 
more of their operations on thermal coal; see 
section 6.3.

The conduct criteria provide that observation 
or exclusion may be decided for companies 
where there is an unacceptable risk that the 
company contributes to or is responsible for:
– serious or systematic human rights viola-

tions, such as murder, torture, deprivation of 
liberty, forced labour and the worst forms of 
child labour;

– serious violations of the rights of individuals 
in situations of war or conflict;

– severe environmental damage;
– acts or omissions that on an aggregate com-

pany level lead to unacceptable greenhouse 
gas emissions;

– gross corruption; or
– other particularly serious violations of funda-

mental ethical norms.

1 See the Revised National Budget 2004.
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respectively. The implemented changes are dis-
cussed in section 6.3.

Norges Bank and Folketrygdfondet make 
investment decisions and exercise ownership 
rights independently of the Ministry, within the 
limits of the management mandates and guide-
lines. Figure 6.1 illustrates the distribution of 
roles and responsibilities relating to responsible 
management of the Government Pension Fund.

The frameworks for and use of policy instru-
ments in the responsible management of the 
GPFG and GPFN are largely based on a common 
platform.

6.2 Responsible management efforts

This section describes the work done by the 
Council on Ethics, Folketrygdfondet and Norges 
Bank in the area of responsible management. 
Implementation of the ethically motivated guide-
lines on observation and exclusion is discussed in 
section 6.2.3.

6.2.1 The Government Pension Fund Global

The mandate for the GPFG requires Norges 
Bank to seek to establish a chain of responsible 
management measures and to adopt a set of 
responsible investment principles to be inte-
grated into management of the GPFG. The man-
date states that the principles shall be based on 
the principles that the investments have a long 
time horizon and must be broadly diversified. 
The principles shall reflect the objectives of good 
corporate governance and environmental and 
social considerations in line with internationally 
recognised standards. The mandate also identi-
fies contributions to research and the develop-
ment of good standards, as well as environment-
related investments, as part of the responsible 
management efforts. Norges Bank is required to 
publish the principles and measures applied in 
this work.

The Executive Board of Norges Bank estab-
lished a corporate governance committee in 2015. 
The committee is mandated to prepare matters for 
and make recommendations to the Executive 
Board, including on the observation and exclu-
sion of companies. Norges Bank’s own principles 
and expectations relating to responsible manage-
ment were revised in January 2016. This included 
incorporation of a direct reference to the UN 
Guiding Principles on Business and Human 
Rights (UNGP).

On 4 February 2016, Norges Bank presented a 
separate report on responsible investment in 
2015. The Bank groups its responsible investment 
activities into three categories: standard setting, 
ownership and risk management. 

Standard setting

The GPFG is invested in several thousand compa-
nies globally. The average ownership share was 
1.3 percent at the end of 2015. Work on common 
standards can be an effective means of influencing 
company practice. Standards may range from reg-
ulations, listing requirements and best practice 
codes to norms, formal standards and observed 
market practice. In the area of standard setting, 
Norges Bank gives priority to broad international 
principles and standards. The G20/OECD Princi-
ples of Corporate Governance, OECD Guidelines 
for Multinational Enterprises and UN Global Com-
pact are examples of such, and are referred to spe-
cifically in the mandate from the Ministry of 
Finance. Norges Bank supports the development 
of selected international standards, including 
through participation in international forums and 
consultations. The Bank also promotes good mar-
ket practice through dialogue with regulatory 
authorities, other standard setters and market 
participants.

The Bank works with industry standards, spe-
cific markets and topics such as company report-
ing and corporate governance, as well as stand-
alone standards. One example of a global report-
ing initiative supported by Norges Bank is CDP 
(formerly known as the Carbon Disclosure Proj-
ect). CDP is an independent organisation that 
gathers and publishes information on companies’ 
emissions of greenhouse gases, water and defor-
estation to promote improved reporting by com-
panies.

Last year, Norges Bank submitted comments in 
11 consultations relating to international or com-
pany- or market-specific standards and regulations.

Norges Bank also promotes research in sup-
port of its responsible management efforts. 
Research is considered particularly useful in areas 
with unanswered questions, such as the relation-
ship between sustainability and profitability of busi-
ness operations. In 2015, the Bank supported vari-
ous research projects and contributed to a number 
of seminars and conferences. The Norwegian 
Finance Initiative (NFI) is a research programme 
with the purpose of facilitating research into sub-
jects of potentially high importance in the long-
term management of the Fund. Among other 
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things, the NFI has made active ownership one of 
its research programme topics. Norges Bank has 
included the topic of financial economics and cli-
mate change in this programme. 

Ownership

Ownership can be exercised by voting at general 
meetings, participating in governing bodies, 
engaging in dialogue with companies and commu-
nicating with boards of directors. Norges Bank 
premises its exercise of ownership rights on the 
principle that the board of directors and company 
management bear primary responsibility for busi-
ness strategy and operations of the company.

Norges Bank regards voting at general meet-
ings as the most important tool for influencing 
companies. The Bank has adopted a set of voting 
principles which provide, for example, that the 
Bank shall generally vote at all shareholder meet-
ings and that its voting decisions must be pub-
lished. Voting must reflect the Fund’s long-term 
interests and take into account long-term value 
creation, sustainable business operation, board 
liability, shareholder rights, equal treatment of 
shareholders and transparent company communi-
cation. The Bank’s voting guidelines and princi-
ples are based on the G20/OECD Principles of 
Corporate Governance.

Norges Bank publishes its voting decisions 
on its website the day after each general meet-
ing. Starting in 2015, the Bank announced in 
some instances its voting intentions prior to 
annual or extraordinary general meetings to pro-
mote clear expectations, transparency and share-
holder influence. The Bank also published posi-
tion papers on selected corporate governance 
topics. These papers are intended to support 
good market practice and the Bank’s own voting. 
In 2015, the Bank published position papers on 
voting for individual board candidates and the 
right of shareholders to propose board candi-
dates in US companies.

Norges Bank voted on 112,601 resolutions in 
11,562 general meetings in 2015. Some 98 percent 
of the resolutions were proposed by the compa-
nies themselves, whilst three percent were pro-
posed by shareholders. Since the board of direc-
tors plays a key role in the value added and long-
term strategy of a company, the Bank pays partic-
ular attention to the choice of chair and composi-
tion of the board. Norges Bank also gives priority 
to participation in individual nomination pro-
cesses through involvement in nomination com-
mittees and direct dialogue with board chairs. 

Company dialogue is another responsible 
management instrument. In 2015, the Bank 
arranged a total of 3,520 meetings between Fund 
representatives and company executives and spe-
cialists. The most important contacts for the Bank 
in its capacity as shareholder are the board chair 
and directors. Companies are normally prioritised 
based on investment value, ownership share, 
selected topics and challenges specific to the indi-
vidual company. In 2015, Norges Bank prioritised 
five topics in its interaction with companies: nomi-
nation processes in connection with board elec-
tions, equal treatment of shareholders, corporate 
governance form in Japan, corruption and sustain-
ability. The Bank also engaged in dialogue in 
response to events in companies and assessments 
based on the ethically motivated guidelines on 
observation and exclusion.

Risk management

In 2015, Norges Bank enhanced its risk monitor-
ing of companies in the Fund, including through 
more intensive gathering and development of non-
financial data.

The Bank conducted 2,517 documented risk 
assessments during the year. Emphasis is given to 
matters with a potentially significant impact on an 
individual company or the Fund’s investments 
overall. The Bank has stated that priorities must 
be set to ensure that ownership and risk efforts 
have optimal effect.

Norges Bank focuses primarily on the owner-
ship and risk management measures with the 
greatest potential impact on the portfolio as a 
whole. The Bank has also chosen to prioritise 
three so-called focus areas:
– children’s rights
– climate change
– water management 

Norges Bank has, for each of these three areas, 
formulated expectations as to how companies 
should manage risk and report on their activities. 
The Bank published updated expectation docu-
ments on all three areas in 2015, as well as a new 
expectation document on human rights (in Febru-
ary); see section 6.5.

During the year, Norges Bank carried out 
assessments of the reporting of a total of 2,113 
companies by reference to the focus areas. 
Around half of these evaluations concerned cli-
mate change, with the remainder being distrib-
uted fairly evenly between water management and 
children’s rights. The value of the evaluated com-
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panies accounted for 45 percent of the equity port-
folio’s market value.

Norges Bank analyses the greenhouse gas 
emissions of the companies in the equity portfolio. 
A company with high emissions may represent a 
risky investment, not least because it is vulnerable 
to regulatory changes and new technological 
developments. The Bank evaluates emissions by 
reference to company size. Not all companies 
report their emissions in a standardised manner, 
and Norges Bank’s analyses therefore rely exten-
sively on emissions models from external provid-
ers.

In recent years, the Bank has made certain 
divestments in response to risk assessment find-
ings. Such adjustments of the portfolio are finan-
cially motivated, and differ from exclusions based 
on the ethically motivated guidelines for observa-
tion and exclusion. Risk-based divestment reduces 
the Bank’s scope for deviations from the bench-
mark index. Divestment decisions are made follow-
ing a systematic review of corporate governance, 
environmental and social conditions. Greenhouse 
gas emissions, water scarcity, waste, climate 
change and biodiversity are all factors incorporated 
into the assessment. Under the heading of social 
conditions, consideration is given to child labour, 
human capital, health and safety. Corporate gover-
nance focuses primarily on corruption risk.

In its responsible investment report for 2015, 
Norges Bank states that it divested from 73 com-
panies during the year. These divestments were 
based on greenhouse gas emissions (eight compa-
nies engaged in cement production, 16 companies 
active in coal power generation, 11 companies 
working with coal extraction for power-generation 
purposes and seven companies in other seg-
ments), social and governance-related matters 
(nine companies in the construction sector, five 
companies on corruption grounds, one company 
for other reasons), deforestation (two palm-oil 
producers, four paper producers, one coal mine in 
India), and water and conflict (nine companies 
engaged in general mining and precious metals 
production). In total, the bank has divested from 
187 companies since initiating risk-based divest-
ment in 2012.

Environment-related investment mandates

Since the adoption of separate environment-
related investment mandates in 2009, Norges 
Bank has established internal and external man-
agement mandates focusing on companies which 

contribute to reducing environmental problems, 
particularly through the development of new envi-
ronmental technologies. At the end of 2015, NOK 
53.8 billion was invested in securities under the 
environment-related mandates. In recent years, 
these mandates have produced a lower return 
than the Fund as a whole; see section 2.2.

6.2.2 The Government Pension Fund Norway

The Board of Directors of Folketrygdfondet has 
adopted responsible management principles 
based on the UN Global Compact, OECD Princi-
ples of Corporate Governance and OECD Guide-
lines for Multinational Enterprises. Folketrygd-
fondet also refers to the UN PRI and the Norwe-
gian Code of Practice for Corporate Governance 
(NUES). These principles define a general 
framework for how Folketrygdfondet is to deal 
with environmental, social and corporate gover-
nance issues in seeking to maximise returns 
over time. 

Folketrygdfondet is of the view that company 
follow-up contributes to both lower risk and 
favourable portfolio performance over time. As a 
financial investor, Folketrygdfondet engages in 
key ownership issues like financial objectives 
and capital structure, board composition, corpo-
rate governance, reporting and transparency. 
Folketrygdfondet also considers monitoring of 
corporate executive remuneration policies an 
important instrument for safeguarding share-
holder value.

Folketrygdfondet has prepared guidance 
notes for companies’ handling of executive remu-
neration schemes, financial objectives and capital 
structure, human rights, labour rights, the envi-
ronment, climate issues and anti-corruption. The 
guidance notes are designed to facilitate effective 
dialogue with companies by clarifying Folketrygd-
fondet’s expectations of companies in terms of 
understanding, dealing with and reporting on 
material risks and opportunities in these areas. 
The notes are incorporated into Folketrygdfon-
det’s responsible investment principles and based 
on the UN Global Compact and NUES.

Folketrygdfondet has integrated the responsi-
ble management effort into both its investment 
activities and its ownership follow-up. In 2015, 
Folketrygdfondet included the ownership report 
in its annual report. The document “Folketrygd-
fondet’s exercise of ownership rights”, which 
details how the Fund practises its ownership in 
Norwegian and Nordic businesses, was updated. 
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Focus areas for active ownership

Folketrygdfondet has for several years prepared 
risk analyses relating to environmental, social and 
corporate governance issues (so-called ESG 
issues) for all Norwegian companies in the equity 
portfolio. The Fund also has access to external 
ESG analyses for some Norwegian companies and 
all Nordic companies. Based on these analyses, 
Folketrygdfondet decided to focus particularly on 
companies’ financial objectives and capital struc-
ture, greenhouse gas emissions and corporate 
anti-corruption efforts in 2015. The analyses also 
constitute the basis for dialogue with the portfolio 
companies, during which Folketrygdfondet dis-
cusses current challenges and outlines its princi-
ples and expectations.

In the Norwegian stock market, Folketrygd-
fondet holds regular meetings and maintains reg-
ular contact with company executives, and with 
the board chair on matters that fall within the 
responsibilities of the board of directors. In its 
annual report for 2015, Folketrygdfondet states 
that it has engaged in dialogue with all 49 Norwe-
gian portfolio companies on key ownership issues 
and specific incidents. 

For the Nordic companies, Folketrygdfondet 
uses an external service provider to monitor com-
pliance with international norms and environmen-
tal, social and corporate governance standards. 
The service provider reports suspected breaches. 
In response, Folketrygdfondet conducts its own 
analyses and considers how the notified problem 
should be dealt with. Folketrygdfondet received 
three such reports in 2015, relating to human 
rights, corruption and workers’ rights. Based on 
related analyses, Folketrygdfondet took steps 
with respect to one company.

The issuers in the fixed-income portfolio are 
regularly monitored, and efforts are made to inte-
grate ESG analyses into ongoing credit assess-
ments. In Folketrygdfondet’s view, how an issuer 
handles environmental and social issues provides 
an indication of credit risk. 

Folketrygdfondet seeks to incorporate infor-
mation on climate risk into its management activi-
ties, including through a CO2 analysis of the 
investment portfolio. 

General meetings and election committees

Folketrygdfondet votes at the general meetings of 
all companies in which it holds ownership stakes. 
In 2015, Folketrygdfondet cast votes at a total of 
49 ordinary general meetings and 10 extraordi-

nary general meetings of companies listed on the 
Oslo Stock Exchange. Over that period, Folke-
trygdfondet voted against proposals put forward 
by the boards of five Norwegian companies. 
These proposals concerned, inter alia, executive 
remuneration, good corporate governance and 
option schemes.

As regards the Nordic companies in its portfo-
lio, Folketrygdfondet voted at a total of 90 general 
meetings in 2015, all by proxy with voting instruc-
tions. In the Nordic region, Folketrygdfondet 
voted against, or abstained from voting on, a total 
of 26 proposals put forward by company boards. 
These proposals concerned, inter alia, executive 
remuneration and incentive schemes.

Folketrygdfondet emphasises the important 
role of election committees in composing compe-
tent boards. In 2015, Folketrygdfondet was repre-
sented on seven election committees of Norwegian 
companies. It also participated in four corporate 
assemblies and three shareholders’ committees.

Development of best practice

Folketrygdfondet is involved in various external 
initiatives to develop best practice and robust 
standards for business activity, including the 
Norwegian Institute of Directors, the Norwegian 
Society of Financial Analysts and the Eierforum 
group of institutional investors. Folketrygd-
fondet is also one of the driving forces behind 
and an active member of the Norwegian Forum 
for Sustainable and Responsible Investment 
(NORSIF).

6.2.3 Observation and exclusion of companies 
from the GPFG

The Ministry of Finance has adopted ethically 
motivated guidelines on observation and exclu-
sion of companies from the GPFG; see Box 6.2. 
The Council on Ethics makes recommendations 
as to whether a company should be excluded or 
placed under observation. The decision is made 
by Norges Bank.

A list of the companies excluded or under 
observation is available on the Norges Bank web-
site, while the relevant recommendations are 
available on the website of the Council on Ethics. 
According to the list, 64 companies were excluded 
and one company was under observation as at the 
end of 2015. Four new companies were excluded 
during the course of the year. Observation of one 
company was concluded, and one new company 
was placed under observation. 
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Product-based exclusion

The Council on Ethics uses an external consul-
tancy firm that continuously monitors the portfo-
lio companies for production potentially in viola-
tion of the guidelines. In addition, the Council on 
Ethics collaborates with other financial institu-
tions to identify companies that produce cluster 
munitions.

The Council on Ethics normally contacts com-
panies if there is reason to believe that they are 
engaged in production in violation of the guide-
lines for the Fund. If a company confirms the 
information held by the Council, an exclusion rec-
ommendation is sent to Norges Bank. Companies 
that fail to respond to an enquiry from the Council 
are recommended for exclusion if the Council’s 
documentation shows that they are highly likely 
involved in the production of goods encompassed 
by the exclusion criteria. This procedure is 
designed to achieve a reasonable degree of assur-
ance that companies making products in violation 
of the guidelines are excluded from the Fund. 
However, there is no guarantee that the Council’s 
monitoring system will cover all companies at all 
times.

The government bond exclusion provision was 
introduced in 2010, and currently applies to inter-
est-bearing securities issued by North Korea and 
Syria. The Council on Ethics has thus far not iden-
tified any portfolio companies that sell weapons or 
military materiel to these countries. One company 
was excluded when Myanmar was previously 
included on the list, but this exclusion was subse-
quently revoked. Iran was removed from the list 
in February 2016.

As at yearend 2015, 39 companies were 
excluded from the Fund under the product-based 
criteria. Some 18 of these companies have been 
excluded on the basis of production of weapons 
that violate fundamental humanitarian principles 
in their normal use, while 21 companies are 
excluded for producing tobacco. 

Conduct-based exclusion

The Council on Ethics assigns priority to compa-
nies and topics for conduct-based follow-up. While 
problem areas are typically reviewed in accor-
dance with a long-term plan, individual cases are 
usually investigated in response to news coverage. 
An external consultancy firm monitors a range of 
news sources in multiple languages every day for 
material on portfolio companies. The Council 
receives quarterly reports from the consultancy 

firm and investigates the companies which appear 
to present the greatest risk of future breaches of 
standards. The Council also receives and assesses 
enquiries from individuals and organisations relat-
ing to specific companies or issues. 

Amongst the cases identified through news 
searches, external enquiries and sector studies, 
the Council on Ethics selects the most serious 
instances for further investigation. The Council 
gives weight to, inter alia, how serious the norm 
violation is, whether the company is accused of 
several counts of unethical conduct, whether it is 
likely that norm violations will continue, and the 
scope for documenting the conduct of which the 
company is accused. The aim is to identify compa-
nies where there is an unacceptable risk that viola-
tions of the ethical guidelines are taking place and 
that such violations will continue.

Norges Bank is also authorised to draw the 
Council on Ethics’ attention to potential problems, 
and sent 16 letters relating to such matters in 
2015. Further, the Council obtains information 
from researchers and research institutions, inter-
national, regional and national organisations and 
various other sources. The Council often engages 
consultants to investigate suspected guideline vio-
lations. The portfolio companies themselves are 
also an important source of information. There is 
often close dialogue, both oral and written, with 
the companies during the investigation process.

For several years, the Council on Ethics has 
systematically reviewed the investments of the 
GPFG in companies involved in certain types of 
activity capable of causing serious environmental 
problems. In 2015, the Council devoted consider-
able attention to companies establishing planta-
tions in tropical rainforests and companies 
involved in unregulated, unreported or illegal fish-
ing. Under the human rights criterion, the Council 
surveyed portfolio companies engaged in textiles 
production in certain Asian countries, as well as 
companies involved in construction projects in 
Qatar. The Council’s risk approach in corruption 
cases is to review countries and sectors which 
international rankings indicate to be particularly 
vulnerable to corruption. Thus far, the Council 
has concentrated on the building and construction 
industry, the oil and gas sector, the defence indus-
try and the telecommunications industry.

The Council on Ethics contacts companies at 
an early stage in its examination of cases. Compa-
nies are requested to answer questions or send 
information to the Council. In 2015, the Council 
contacted 42 companies, and met with 11 of these. 
The Council prioritises obtaining information 
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directly from companies, but may also issue a rec-
ommendation to Norges Bank if a company fails 
to respond to the Councils’ enquiries. 

At yearend 2015, a total of 25 companies were 
excluded from the GPFG under these criteria, 
including 17 companies excluded because they 
are deemed to cause severe environmental dam-
age. Three companies are excluded on the basis 
of contributions to serious or systematic human 
rights violations, while two companies are 
excluded based on other particularly serious viola-
tions of fundamental ethical norms. Three compa-
nies have been excluded on the basis of serious 
violations of individuals’ rights in situations of war 
or conflict.

Observation

The observation of one company pursuant to the 
gross corruption criterion has been concluded. 
During the observation period, the Council on 
Ethics monitored matters such as the company’s 
development of anti-corruption systems. A new 
company which has established palm-oil planta-
tions in tropical rainforests has been placed under 
observation pursuant to the severe environmental 
damage criterion. 

Discontinuation

The Council on Ethics evaluates annually whether 
the grounds for excluding or observing a com-
pany continue to apply. If new information indi-
cates that the basis for exclusion or observation is 
no longer pertinent, the Council on Ethics recom-
mends the revocation of the earlier decision.

6.3 Climate considerations and coal 
companies in the GPFG

6.3.1 Introduction

The GPFG’s investments in and use of measures 
towards coal companies were discussed in the 
report on the Fund for 2014 and the National Bud-
get 2016. Pursuant to the Storting’s deliberation of 
these documents, the Ministry of Finance has 
amended the guidelines for observation and 
exclusion from the GPFG; see Recommendation 
No. 290 (2014–2015) and Recommendation No. 2 
(2015–2016).

The Ministry of Finance adopted a conduct-
based climate criterion for observation and exclu-
sion of companies with effect from 1 January 
2016. The criterion targets companies associated 

with an unacceptable risk that they contribute to 
or are responsible for “acts or omissions that on 
an aggregate company level lead to unacceptable 
greenhouse gas emissions”. The overarching 
understanding of the criterion was discussed in 
the report on the Fund for 2014, in which it was 
also pointed out that the detailed interpretation of 
the provision would develop over time. The crite-
rion is incorporated in a new sub-paragraph (d) in 
section 3 of the guidelines.

The Ministry has also included a new product-
based coal criterion in the guidelines with effect 
from 1 February 2016. Further, a number of other 
changes have been made to the guidelines and 
mandate for the management of the GPFG as a 
result of the new criterion; see sections 6.3.2–
6.3.4.

Various other processes of relevance to these 
topics have been initiated. Norges Bank is cur-
rently reviewing the risk associated with portfolio 
companies involved in activities such as coal 
extraction, coal power generation and coal-based 
energy conversion, where these activities repre-
sent a significant part of the companies’ business; 
see section 6.3.5. The Ministry plans to discuss 
financial risk resulting from climate change in the 
report on the Fund to be published in the spring 
of 2017. The Ministry also intends to return to the 
question of whether the GPFG’s investment strat-
egy should be considered from a national wealth 
perspective allowing for oil-price risk in the Nor-
wegian economy to be illustrated in a broader per-
spective; see the report on the Fund for 2014. This 
topic is to be covered in the forthcoming report 
on long-term perspectives for the Norwegian 
economy.

6.3.2 Details of changes to the responsible 
management framework

The Council on Ethics and Norges Bank have 
been consulted on the proposed changes to the 
responsible management framework. Neither 
institution made any material comments. The 
Council on Ethics’ letter of 19 January 2016 and 
the letter of 28 January 2016 from Norges Bank 
are available on the Ministry of Finance’s web-
site.

The wording of the main provision on prod-
uct-based observation and exclusion of coal com-
panies in section 2(2) of the guidelines is as fol-
lows:

“Observation or exclusion may be decided for 
mining companies and power producers which 
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themselves or through entities they control 
derive 30 per cent or more of their income from 
thermal coal or base 30 per cent or more of 
their operations on thermal coal.”

According to the Storting’s consideration the cri-
terion shall:
– Apply to mining companies and power produc-

ers which produce or use coal for energy pur-
poses, so-called thermal coal. The term “ther-
mal coal” has been added compared to the 
wording presented in the National Budget 
2016. Metallurgical coal, for example for use in 
steel production, is not covered.

– Apply to actual production. The purchase and 
sale of coal, its transportation and distribution, 
and energy trading are not covered.

– Be interpreted to mean that it is sufficient for a 
company to exceed one of the threshold values 
(income/operational) in order for the propor-
tion of coal to be deemed material. Difficulties 
inherent in threshold assessments are 
described in the National Budget 2016, and it is 
stated that detailed interpretation and practice 
must develop over time.

Further, the relevant assessment basis will be 
whether a parent company directly or through 
units under its control (subsidiaries) exceeds 
either the income threshold or the proportion-of-
operation threshold. The income assessment 
should be based on consolidated accounting fig-
ures. In Recommendation No. 2 (2015–2016) the 
Standing Committee on Finance and Economic 
Affairs states that the provision on controlling 
units “shall be interpreted to mean that the com-
pany cannot automatically remain in the portfolio 
simply by establishing one or more subsidiaries 
for its coal operation. The majority notes that the 
relevant assessment basis will be whether the 
company directly or through subsidiaries con-
trolled by the company in question exceeds either 
the income threshold or the proportion-of-opera-
tion threshold.”

The wording of the criterion permits applica-
tion of the criterion to be adjusted as experience is 
gained. The criterion has been given an overarch-
ing, general and discretionary form providing the 
necessary leeway to make forward-looking 
assessments and facilitate a chain of measures as 
emphasised by the Storting, for example in Rec-
ommendation No. 290 (2014–2015).

The objective of forward-looking assessments 
is sought to be safeguarded through the wording 
of section 2(3):

“In assessments pursuant to subsection (2) 
above, in addition to the company’s current 
share of income or activity from thermal coal, 
importance shall also be attached to forward-
looking assessments, including any plans the 
company may have that will change the share 
of its business based on thermal coal and the 
share of its business based on renewable 
energy sources.”

In its letter of 28 January 2016, Norges Bank 
stated that some discretion should be allowed, for 
example to assess the appropriate weight to be 
attached to the proportion of renewable energy in 
a power producer’s operation in the overall assess-
ment. The Ministry supports this approach.

The wording of the second paragraph has 
been adjusted slightly compared to the wording 
presented in the National Budget 2016. The addi-
tion of a third paragraph on forward-looking 
assessments meant that the second paragraph 
had to be amended to relate only to the current 
situation.

In accordance with Recommendation No. 2 
(2015–2016), section 2 of the guidelines contains a 
new fourth paragraph stating that recommenda-
tions and decisions on exclusion shall not include 
a company’s green bonds, provided that these are 
recognised through inclusion in specific indices 
for green bonds or are verified by a recognised 
third party.

Before making a decision on exclusion, 
Norges Bank shall consider whether other mea-
sures, including the exercise of ownership rights, 
may be more suited to reduce the risk of contin-
ued norm violations, or whether such alternative 
measures may be more appropriate for other rea-
sons. The Bank shall consider the full range of 
measures at its disposal and apply these in a 
coherent manner. The provision in section 6(3) 
also applies to the new coal criterion. Correcting 
an oversight, this provision no longer applies to 
decisions on the reinclusion of companies or 
cancellation of observations. 

The same transparency procedure applies as 
under the other criteria, namely that the name of 
companies which are placed under observation or 
excluded – and the decision basis – must be pub-
lished.

6.3.3 Division of labour between the Council 
on Ethics and Norges Bank 

Pursuant to Recommendation No. 2 (2015–2016), 
Norges Bank has been given formal responsibility 
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for identifying and excluding companies under the 
coal criterion, also where the Council on Ethics has 
not made a recommendation. The same applies to 
reinclusion. In addition, the Council has indepen-
dent authority to recommend observation and 
exclusion of companies under the coal criterion.

The same transparency procedure applies as 
to recommendations from the Council on Ethics. 
This entails publication of the decision basis 
drawn up by the Bank.

Provisions in this regard have been included 
in section 1(4) on the scope of the guidelines, sec-
tion 6(1) on Norges Bank’s jurisdiction and tasks, 
and section 8(1) on publication.

6.3.4 Financial divestment of coal companies

In recent years, Norges Bank has made risk-
based divestments from some coal companies 
under the scope for deviations from the bench-
mark index. Based on the Storting’s endorsement 
in Recommendation No. 2 (2015–2016), section 
12(2) of the guidelines now states that securities 
which would have been covered by the new prod-
uct criterion if they had still been included in the 
portfolio may be excluded and eliminated from 
the benchmark index. Hence, such securities will 
no longer form part of the benchmark index 
against which the Bank’s investments are mea-
sured. The same procedures must be followed as 
for other decisions, including publication of the 
company’s name and the decision basis.

6.3.5 Report on the risk associated with coal 
investments

In June 2015, the Ministry of Finance asked 
Norges Bank to review the risk associated with 
investments in companies for which activities 
such as coal extraction, coal power generation or 
coal-based energy conversion constitute a mate-
rial proportion of operations.

In August 2015, Norges Bank engaged the 
Smith School of Enterprise and the Environment 
at the University of Oxford to analyse and write a 
report on the risk associated with coal invest-
ments. It was emphasised that different risk fac-
tors facing companies involved in coal mining, 
coal power generation and other coal-based 
energy conversion (“coal-to-liquid”) should be 
evaluated. The Smith School of Enterprise and the 
Environment published a report covering the 100 
largest coal-power companies, the 30 largest coal-
mining companies and the 30 largest “coal-to-liq-
uid“ companies in January 2016. The analysis 

includes a forward-looking assessment of environ-
ment-related risks for coal companies, such as air 
pollution, regulatory changes, pricing of CO2
emissions, access to water of sufficient quality and 
technological changes.

The report forms part of the Bank’s analysis of 
climate risk. The primary objective of the Bank in 
requesting the report is to convert research 
results into a useful foundation for the work of 
investors in the areas of risk management, exer-
cise of ownership rights and divestment. Studies 
of environment-related risk commonly examine 
CO2 emissions and intensity based on company-
level reporting (the “top-down approach”). This 
report analyses the individual assets in the ther-
mal-coal value chain based on a range of environ-
ment-related risk factors (the “bottom-up 
approach”). According to the report, this provides 
better insight into companies’ future prospects. 

6.4 OECD Guidelines for Multinational 
Enterprises

The OECD Guidelines for Multinational Enter-
prises are voluntary recommendations intended 
to promote responsible conduct in all business 
sectors. They were launched in 1976, and have 
most recently been updated in 2011. The guide-
lines are not legally binding, and individual enter-
prises are required to assess independently how 
they can best be implemented. In some areas, the 
guidelines overlap with other standards, such as 
the UN Guiding Principles on Business and 
Human Rights (UNGP).

Adhering governments are obliged to set up a 
national contact point for responsible business 
conduct. The contact points are mandated to 
spread knowledge about the guidelines and offer 
dialogue and mediation in individual cases. The 
Norwegian contact point is an independent spe-
cialist body subject to the administrative oversight 
of the Ministry of Foreign Affairs.

The management mandate for the GPFG 
requires Norges Bank to adopt a broad set of 
responsible investment principles. The principles 
must be based on the objectives of good corporate 
governance and environmental and social consid-
erations in line with internationally recognised 
principles and standards, including the OECD 
Guidelines for Multinational Enterprises. Norges 
Bank exercises the Fund’s ownership rights, and 
has in this context stated that companies in which 
the Fund is invested are expected to follow the 
recommendations in the guidelines.
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A research report prepared in 2013 showed 
that many financial institutions regarded the 
OECD Guidelines for Multinational Enterprises as 
unclear, and that the guidelines are little used in 
the financial sector. In 2014, the OECD discussed 
the interpretation of certain principles and terms 
in the guidelines, among other things in response 
to an enquiry from Norway. This work was super-
vised by the OECD’s investment committee and a 
working group on responsible business conduct. 
It was agreed that the guidelines are applicable to 
the financial sector and also, in principle, to 
minority shareholders. However, the guidelines 
do not discuss explicitly what responsibility finan-
cial investments entail. This contrasts with the 
provisions on, for example, the responsibility of 
purchasers for suppliers.

The OECD has for several years worked to 
develop concrete guidance documents on practi-
cal application of the guidelines in different sec-
tors. In the autumn of 2015, work began on draft-
ing guidance on the use of the guidelines in the 
financial sector. This work is being supervised by 
the working group on responsible business con-
duct and a reference group comprising represen-
tatives from central governments, industry, inter-
national organisations, trade unions and academic 
institutions. The Ministry of Finance and Norges 
Bank are involved in the reference group. The 
guidance documents are due to be issued during 
the course of 2016.

6.5 Expectation document on human 
rights

In connection with its consideration of the report 
on the Fund for 2014, the Storting adopted the fol-
lowing petition resolution on 5 June 2015: “The 
Storting requests the Government to ask Norges 
Bank to consider whether an expectation docu-
ment on human rights can be prepared, and which 
human rights areas can be included in such a doc-
ument.”

Pursuant to this resolution, the Ministry of 
Finance asked Norges Bank, in a letter of 23 June 
2015, to consider the feasibility of preparing such a 
document. In its reply of 1 February 2016, the Bank 
described how human rights are incorporated into 
the GPFG’s responsible management efforts and 
discussed the question of a new expectation docu-
ment. In February 2016, Norges Bank presented an 
expectation document on human rights.

Norges Bank uses expectation documents in 
selected areas as a tool in its work on responsible 

investments. The expectation documents are gen-
eral in nature, and express expectations directed 
at company boards on topics such as strategy, risk 
management, reporting and transparency. The 
expectations also serve as a starting point for the 
asset manager’s engagement with companies.

The expectation document on human rights 
presented in February specifies Norges Bank’s 
expectations, in its capacity as a financial investor, 
that companies shall respect human rights in 
accordance with the international UNGP guide-
lines. The Bank states that companies have an 
independent responsibility to evaluate how, and to 
what extent, the UNGP guidelines are relevant to 
their activities. Companies must demonstrate due 
care and seek to reduce the risk of human rights 
violations. Norges Bank considers respect for 
human rights as an aspect of good business prac-
tice and risk management. Company boards are 
also expected to give appropriate consideration to 
other affected parties and deal with their interests 
in an orderly manner.

Norges Bank points to the initial framework 
for company reporting on the UNGP which was 
developed in 2015. Reliable reporting is important 
for the human rights-related efforts of the authori-
ties, shareholders, companies and other stake-
holders.

The Bank also states that roles and responsibili-
ties should be distributed between shareholders 
and company boards in conformity with recognised 
international corporate governance principles. This 
guides expectations as to what can be achieved 
through the exercise of ownership rights. Investors 
have special ownership rights, including the right 
to vote at general meetings and a right to informa-
tion. Investors can also initiate dialogue with com-
panies, although minority shareholders should not 
seek to micromanage. The Bank’s expectations 
documents are therefore general in nature, and 
directed at company boards. 

In Norges Bank’s view, effective exercise of 
ownership rights must be based on principles and 
standards which enjoy broad shareholder sup-
port. Expectations towards companies in the area 
of human rights should be based on the UNGP 
and OECD guidelines and principles, and thus 
aim to reflect and promote such accepted stan-
dards.

The expectation document does not refer sep-
arately to individual human rights. Rather, it 
adopts the same breadth of rights as the UNGP 
and OECD guidelines. Key instruments in this 
context include the Universal Declaration of 
Human Rights, the International Covenant on 
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Economic, Social and Cultural Rights (ICESCR) 
and the International Covenant on Civil and Politi-
cal Rights (ICCPR), as well as the ILO core con-
ventions on fundamental rights and principles at 
work. Norges Bank understands this approach to 
be widely supported.

The expectation document on human rights 
supplements existing documents on climate 
change, water management and children’s rights. 
These were updated in 2015. The updated docu-
ment on children’s rights reflects the normative 
basis the UNGP provides for human rights in gen-
eral, and children’s rights in particular.

6.6 Exclusion of companies from the 
GPFN, etc.

Both the GPFG and the GPFN are invested in 
listed equities and bonds in Denmark, Finland and 
Sweden. The Council on Ethics is responsible for 
evaluating whether the GPFG’s investments con-
flict with the ethically motivated guidelines on 
observation and exclusion from the GPFG. The 
Council makes recommendations to Norges Bank 
on observation and exclusion from the GPFG, but 
has no corresponding role with respect to the 
GPFN. However, it is assumed that a Nordic com-
pany in which both the GPFG and GPFN are 
invested will be excluded from the investment uni-
verses of both funds if a decision is made to 
exclude the company from the GPFG.1 The man-
date for the management of the GPFN reflects this.

Decision-making authority on observation and 
exclusion of companies from the GPFG was trans-
ferred to Norges Bank with effect from 1 January 
2015. Since the ethically motivated observation 
and exclusion criteria are determined by the polit-
ical authorities also under the new arrangement, 
and decisions are based on a recommendation 
relating to the GPFG, the Ministry of Finance 
assumes that companies which are excluded from 
the GPFG shall continue to be excluded from the 
GPFN’s investment universe. The same is 
assumed to apply to reinclusions.

On this basis, the Ministry has laid down a 
general restriction in the mandate for the manage-
ment of the GPFN stating that the Fund shall not 
be invested in securities which are excluded pur-
suant to the guidelines for observation and exclu-

sion from the GPFG (see section 3–1(3) and sec-
tion 3–6(8), amended on 14 March 2016). This 
means that such securities will not be included in 
the investment universe of the GPFN, and that no 
specific decision to exclude from the GPFN’s 
investment universe is required in each individual 
case. In the Ministry’s view, it is no longer appro-
priate for the Ministry to make individual deci-
sions concerning exclusion from the GPFN; see 
the discussion in the report on the Fund for 2013.

Nor shall securities which are excluded pursu-
ant to the guidelines be included in the bench-
mark index for the GPFN. The Ministry of 
Finance sets the date for exclusion and reinclu-
sion of such securities in the benchmark index; 
see section 3–1(3) of the mandate. This mirrors 
the arrangement for the GPFG; see section 6.7.

The established procedure is that the Ministry 
notifies Folketrygdfondet once Norges Bank’s 
exclusion or reinclusion decision is announced 
publicly. Folketrygdfondet is required to report 
on exclusions and reinclusions in its quarterly and 
annual reports.

Exercise of ownership rights independently of the 
Ministry of Finance

Documents such as the preparatory works to the 
Government Pension Fund Act2 envisage that the 
Ministry of Finance will not instruct Folketrygd-
fondet on issues relating to the exercise of owner-
ship rights in individual companies. As of 14 
March 2016, section 1–2(3) of the mandate for the 
management of the GPFN states that Folketrygd-
fondet shall exercise ownership rights inde-
pendently of the Ministry.

Clarification of the objective for responsible 
management efforts

On 14 March 2016, a new formulation of objec-
tives was included in section 1–3 of the mandate 
for the management of the GPFN. A general 
clause (section 2–1) on responsible management 
principles was included at the same time. These 
changes reflect corresponding changes to the 
mandate for the GPFG implemented on 1 January 
2015. The amendments relating to the GPFG were 
discussed in the report on the Fund for 2013, in 
which the Ministry stated that the link between 
sustainable development and robust long-term 
returns must be understood as a specification of 

1 See for example the report on the Fund for 2006 and the 
preparatory works to the Act relating to Folketrygdfondet 
(Proposition No. 49 (2006–2007) to the Odelsting, section 
2.2, penultimate paragraph, on fund management).

2 Proposition No. 2 (2005–2006) to the Odelsting relating to 
the Government Pension Fund Act, section 3.4.2.
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the overarching objective of achieving the highest 
possible return.

In addition, some linguistic and minor editorial 
changes have been made to reflect the terminol-
ogy and structure of the GPFG’s mandate. This 
applies, for example, to the term “responsible 
investment”, which has been replaced by “respon-
sible management”.

6.7 Adjustment of the benchmark 
index when companies are 
excluded from the GPFG

The guidelines for observation and exclusion from 
the GPFG provide that companies may be excluded 
on the basis of conduct (e.g. serious human rights 
violations and severe environmental damage) or 
production (e.g. tobacco, weapons and coal). Equi-
ties and bonds issued by excluded companies shall 
not be included in the GPFG’s benchmark index; 
see section 3–2(9) and section 3–3(5) of the GPFG 
mandate. Pursuant to section 3–1(3), Norges Bank 
must have guidelines in place for excluding and 
reincluding companies in the Fund’s investment 
universe and benchmark index.

In a letter of 4 December 2015, Norges Bank 
recommended that the Ministry of Finance 
should set a date for exclusion from and reinclu-
sion in the benchmark index. The Ministry sup-
ports this proposal, and has with effect from 1 
February 2016 included a provision in this regard 
in the mandate; see section 3–1(3), new second 
sentence. Further, a new second sentence stating 
that the Bank shall inform the Ministry of exclu-
sion and reinclusion decisions has been added to 
section 2–5, which assigns the authority to make 
decisions under the guidelines for observation 
and exclusion to Norges Bank.

6.8 Evaluation of the new distribution 
of responsibility for excluding 
companies from the GPFG

The Ministry of Finance has adopted ethically 
motivated guidelines on observation and exclu-
sion of companies from the GPFG. The Council on 
Ethics makes recommendations as to whether a 
company should be excluded or placed under 
observation, while the decisions in such cases are 
made by Norges Bank. Until 2015, the Ministry 
decided whether a company should be excluded 
or placed under observation. The members of the 
Council on Ethics are still appointed by the Minis-

try, and the candidates are recommended by 
Norges Bank.

A proposal for a new division of labour was dis-
cussed in the report on the Fund for 2012, pub-
lished in the spring of 2013. One purpose of the 
change was to facilitate productive cooperation 
between the Council on Ethics and Norges Bank 
to make integrated assessments of the different 
policy instruments easier and support appropriate 
use of these in each individual case. The Storting 
followed up on this objective in its consideration of 
the report, with the majority of the Standing Com-
mittee on Finance and Economic Affairs writing, 
among other things, that “… when the exclusion 
mechanism is transferred to Norges Bank, it will 
be important that the Strategy Council’s recom-
mendations on clearer lines of responsibility and 
better communication and integration of work 
between Norges Bank and the Council on Ethics 
are implemented and improved to ensure that the 
chain of policy instruments is as coherent as pos-
sible and that external communications are 
regarded as unambiguous“ (Recommendation 
No. 200 (2013–2014)). The majority of the commit-
tee assumed that the new organisational structure 
would be evaluated in the annual reports to the 
Storting. The report on the Fund for 2014 stated 
that the Ministry would return to this issue in this 
report.

The new framework has been effective for a 
relatively short time. In this initial evaluation, the 
Ministry of Finance has therefore concentrated 
on individual and joint procedures and work meth-
ods adopted by Norges Bank and the Council on 
Ethics in implementing the framework. The Min-
istry asked Norges Bank and the Council to pro-
vide their evaluations. The Bank and the Council’s 
letters of reply – both of 29 January 2016 – are 
available on the Ministry of Finance’s website. 

Norges Bank’s Executive Board has adopted 
principles for the Bank’s work on responsible 
management. As discussed in the Bank’s report 
on responsible investment in 2015 the Executive 
Board has also established a corporate gover-
nance committee which prepares matters for and 
makes recommendations to the Executive Board 
concerning responsible management and obser-
vation and exclusion of companies from the Fund. 
The committee comprises one of the Bank’s dep-
uty governors and two external board members. 
Decisions are made by the Executive Board.

In addition to recommendations from the Coun-
cil on Ethics, the Executive Board gathers input 
from the Bank’s asset management unit, NBIM, 
regarding companies which are candidates for 
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exclusion or observation. In this context, consider-
ation is also given to whether exercise of ownership 
rights may be a more appropriate instrument. 
These evaluations are based on factors such as the 
amount invested, whether a relationship has been 
established with the company, the Fund’s owner-
ship share in the company and the matters raised 
in the Council’s recommendation.

The Ministry understands the aim of ensuring 
“that the chain of policy instruments is as coher-
ent as possible“ to mean that all measures must be 
considered from an integrated perspective, and 
that they must collectively be applied in the most 
purposive manner possible. This will only be pos-
sible if strong procedures are in place for the 
exchange of information between the Bank and 
the Council on Ethics.

Norges Bank and the Council on Ethics have 
introduced procedures for the exchange of infor-
mation and coordination. Norges Bank keeps the 
Council updated on which companies the Fund is 
invested in, and on contact between the Bank and 
portfolio companies. The Council notifies Norges 
Bank of companies under investigation. The Bank 
and the Council hold quarterly meetings to dis-
cuss the work on individual companies and future 
work plans.

According to the guidelines, “communications 
with companies shall be coordinated and aim to 
be perceived as consistent”. The Council on Eth-
ics informs Norges Bank, represented by NBIM, 
when it wishes to contact a company. If deemed 
purposive, NBIM informs the company that it will 
be contacted. The Council gives priority to 
explaining its role in the responsible management 
framework to relevant companies.

Norges Bank and the Council on Ethics empha-
sise transparency. However, it is generally impossi-
ble to name companies under evaluation before a 
recommendation has been issued and a decision 
made. All exclusion decisions in 2015 were pub-
lished after the divestment was concluded. The 

Council published its recommendation at the same 
time as Norges Bank made its decision public. 
Both the Council and Norges Bank discuss recom-
mendations and decisions in their annual reports 
and on their respective websites.

The Ministry’s assessment

The changes in division of labour have resulted in 
the Council on Ethics and Norges Bank now 
being in direct contact regarding responsible 
management issues. However, they play different 
roles. The Council makes recommendations to 
Norges Bank regarding companies to be placed 
under observation or excluded from the Fund, 
while the Bank makes decisions under the guide-
lines. The Council is an independent body, and 
there are clear lines of responsibility.

The different measures available, such as 
observation, exclusion and exercise of ownership 
rights, should not be considered in isolation. 
Closer contact between the Council on Ethics and 
Norges Bank provides a basis for viewing the 
instruments from a more integrated perspective 
and utilising them optimally in each individual 
case. This demands reliable procedures for the 
exchange of information between the Council and 
Norges Bank. The Council and the Bank have 
adopted such procedures.

The guidelines have been effective for a rela-
tively short time, and the Ministry considers that 
the Council on Ethics and Norges Bank have 
made good progress in the implementation of 
such guidelines. The Ministry expects these 
efforts to continue. When more time has passed, a 
review will provide an assessment of whether the 
new organisational structure has contributed to 
strong, uniform responsible management of the 
GPFG. Evaluations will be conducted regularly, 
and will be discussed in the relevant reports on 
the Fund.
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7  Gross excess return as a management performance measure

7.1 Introduction

The Ministry of Finance has adopted mandates 
for the management of the Government Pension 
Fund Global (GPFG) and Government Pension 
Fund Norway (GPFN) by Norges Bank and 
Folketrygdfondet, respectively. The mandates 
express the funds’ investment strategies, 
including provisions on the composition of the 
respective benchmark indices and risk limits. 
The mandates provide that the managers shall 
seek to achieve the highest possible returns on 
the GPFG and GPFN – measured in interna-
tional currency and Norwegian kroner, respec-
tively – after asset management costs.

The mandates permit Norges Bank and 
Folketrygdfondet to deviate from the applicable 
benchmark indices subject to given risk limits. 
The limit on market risk as measured by 
expected tracking error is key. It allows the 
managers to exploit the funds’ distinctive char-
acteristics and advantages to achieve excess 
returns compared to the benchmark indices, 
and offers an opportunity for cost-effective 
adjustment to the benchmark indices. Devia-
tions from the benchmark indices may raise or 
lower the funds’ absolute risk relative to the 
benchmark indices. 

The Ministry of Finance employs gross excess 
return, defined as the difference in the returns 
on the Fund and the benchmark index, as the 
management performance measure. The figure 
is based on the audited accounts and is indepen-
dent of model assumptions and estimated 
parameters. The performance measure is a 
gross quantity that ignores costs. However, 
index management also incurs costs. The Min-
istry has previously referred to calculations pre-
pared by Norge Bank and Folketrygdfondet 
which support the view that gross excess return 
may be a reasonable approximation of net value 
added. 

7.2 The division of labour between the 
asset owner and the manager

The benchmark indices adopted by the Ministry 
of Finance for the GPFG and GPFN are based on 
leading, easily accessible and broad market indi-
ces for equities and bonds prepared by rec-
ognised index providers. The expected returns on 
the benchmark indices reflect the excess returns 
compared to risk-free investments achievable by 
harvesting risk premiums with a robust theoreti-
cal and empirical foundation, such as equity and 
credit premiums. Investments in line with broad 
market indices also ensure good risk diversifica-
tion by reducing the significance of incidents in 
individual companies, sectors and markets.

Market indices are standardised products in 
which index providers decide on various choices 
and priorities relating to the representation of 
markets and securities. The requirement that 
included securities and markets must be liquid 
allows investors to buy securities in an index with-
out incurring high transaction costs. In principle, 
indices can be followed closely at low cost. The 
benchmark indices for the GPFG and GPFN may 
therefore provide a suitable starting point for mea-
suring the value added by the managers.

The choices and priorities of index providers 
are adapted to a theoretical average investor in 
the market. Accordingly, market indices do not 
necessarily express the optimal risk-return ratio 
for investors with distinctive characteristics that 
deviate significantly from the average, such as 
large size and a long investment horizon. 

The scope for deviations from the benchmark 
indices stipulated in the mandates adopted by the 
Ministry of Finance is designed to afford the man-
agers some leeway to make progressive adjust-
ments to the composition of the investments in 
the two funds. Changes to investment composi-
tion to ensure cost-effective adaptation to the 
benchmark indices, greater risk diversification 
than in the benchmark indices, exploitation of fac-
tor strategies and appropriate security selection 
may, over time, improve the risk and return prop-
erties of the GPFG and GPFN. Such changes in 
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investment composition require specialist exper-
tise, market proximity and the ability to make 
time-critical decisions, and are therefore dele-
gated to the two managers.

In accordance with this division of labour, the 
Ministry of Finance uses gross excess return to 
measure the results of Norges Bank and Folke-
trygdfondet’s management of the GPFG and 
GPFN, respectively. Gross excess return encom-
passes all deviations from the benchmark indices. 
This means that the results of all changes in the 
composition of the investments in the GPFG and 
the GPFN compared to the benchmark indices 
are attributed to the two managers. This is consis-
tent with the management objective as expressed 
in the mandates from the Ministry.

7.3 The link between gross excess 
return and net value added

To assess the value added to the GPFG and GPFN 
by Norges Bank and Folketrygdfondet, respec-
tively, the returns on the two funds must be com-
pared to the returns, after costs, which could alter-
natively have been achieved. In principle, the 
returns on the benchmark indices cannot be 
achieved at zero cost.

The purchase and sale of securities in order to 
match investment to the benchmark indices – so-
called index management – incur both manage-
ment and transaction costs. Moreover, in the 
GPFG and GPFN, some transaction costs will be 
due to rebalancing of the equity portion to the 
strategic weighting stipulated by the Ministry of 
Finance. In the GPFG’s case, costs have histori-
cally also been incurred in conjunction with capi-
tal inflows to the Fund. Changes in asset alloca-
tion have also historically imposed transaction 
costs on the GPFG and GPFN. Transaction and 
asset management costs are excluded from the 
return calculation for the benchmark indices. In 
principle, therefore, index management will entail 
a negative excess return compared to the bench-
mark indices.

Net value added through active management 
is a measure of the capital value added after costs, 
and is defined as the difference between the 
returns on the funds less actual asset manage-
ment costs and the returns which could have been 
achieved through index management. The 
returns on the two funds, the returns on the 
benchmark indices and actual asset management 
costs have been audited and verified. Historical 
index management costs, on the other hand, are 

based on uncertain estimates of costs linked to 
factors such as capital inflows, rebalancing, 
changes in portfolio composition and index adjust-
ments. It is also necessary to estimate historical 
asset management costs related to index manage-
ment. 

Uncertainty about the size of these costs ren-
ders the precise amount of net value added uncer-
tain.

As part of their management, Norges Bank 
and Folketrygdfondet lend securities to other 
investors and receive compensation for doing so. 
Securities lending is associated with risk, includ-
ing counterparty risk. There is thus a need for 
reliable risk management systems and a robust 
legal framework. The Ministry of Finance has pre-
viously pointed out that, to some extent, it is rea-
sonable to regard securities lending revenues as 
additional returns secured through active man-
agement; see the report on the Fund for 2009. 
Such revenues are included in the gross excess 
return, but are excluded from the return on the 
benchmark indices.

In connection with reviews of the management 
of the GPFG and GPFN discussed in the reports 
on the Fund for 2013 and 2014, respectively, both 
Folketrygdfondet and Norges Bank presented 
estimates of historical index management costs.1

These estimates indicate that comparisons of 
gross amounts (gross excess return) and net 
amounts (net value added) produce similar 
results. This is because the estimated historical 
negative excess return achieved through index 
management is approximately equal to the actual 
historical asset management costs. The calcula-
tions do not take excess returns due to securities 
lending revenues into account. Accordingly, the 
gross excess return has thus far been regarded as 
a reasonable estimate of net value added.

7.4 Risk adjustment

Managers can achieve excess returns compared 
to benchmark indices in various ways, including 
by assuming additional risk. In financial literature, 
models are commonly used to explain historical 
results. A distinction is made between returns a 
manager secures by assuming systematic risk and 

1 The analyses are documented in a letter from Norges Bank 
to the Ministry of Finance of 12 March 2014 and a corre-
sponding letter from Folketrygdfondet of 10 March 2015. 
The letters are available on the Ministry’s website. Norges 
Bank has updated the analyses in its annual report for 
2015.
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returns due to other deviations. The latter esti-
mates the risk-adjusted excess return, and is 
termed “alpha”. In principle, the purpose of such 
risk adjustments is to provide greater insight, in 
hindsight, into factors which may explain the 
excess return. The models assume that the owner 
can accept higher systematic risk directly, by 
adjusting the benchmark index. However, no sin-
gle model or single set of assumptions provides an 
unambiguous answer to the question of how, in 
hindsight, risk has impacted performance. Nor is 
there an unambiguous answer to the question of 
what adjustments the owner can make to the 
benchmark index.

Under the Capital Asset Pricing Model, the 
risk associated with investing in the market port-
folio is the only risk compensated for by the 
expected excess return beyond risk-free invest-
ment of the capital. Risk adjustment often employs 
the manager’s benchmark index as an approxima-
tion of the market portfolio. Under this model, the 
manager’s return is adjusted for the return 
achieved by accepting more or less systematic 
risk than the benchmark index. For example, the 
manager can accept more systematic risk by con-
centrating investments in assets which increase 
fluctuations in the return on the benchmark 
index. In the Capital Asset Pricing Model, the 
owner of the capital can directly increase or 
reduce systematic risk by debt financing invest-
ments in the benchmark index or making risk-free 
investments, respectively. Positive alpha can be 
interpreted as meaning that the manager has 
achieved a return above the return implied by 
compensation for risk-taking.

A manager may also employ so-called factor 
strategies through which investments are system-
atically tilted towards assets with particular char-
acteristics, such as low market value, low relative 
price and low liquidity. Harvesting risk premiums 
has historically improved the risk-return ratio for 
investors like the GPFG. However, such strategies 
may entail long periods of higher or lower returns 
than the benchmark index and have a sizable neg-
ative impact during periods of market turbulence.

Although there is no agreement in the finan-
cial literature regarding which factors are priced 
into the capital markets or what risks factor premi-
ums may potentially compensate for, models 
which adjust for the harvesting of factor premi-
ums are still frequently used. In such models, the 
manager’s return is adjusted for the return 
achieved by accepting more or less systematic 
risk than in the benchmark index and other 
(assumed) systematic risk expressed by a 

selected number of factor premiums. However, 
these factor premiums can reasonably be 
regarded more as explanatory variables than as 
compensation for accepting systematic risk 
(Eckbo and Ødegaard, 2015).

Different risk-adjustment models are based on 
different assumptions, and may produce different 
results. As Eckbo and Ødegaard (2015) have 
pointed out, adjustments may produce a positive, 
zero or negative alpha depending on which factor 
strategies are adjusted for and how these are mea-
sured.

Alpha is used to measure the manager’s skill 
in security selection, the exploitation of time varia-
tions in risk premiums and the harvesting of risk 
premiums excluded from the risk adjustment 
(Hsu, Kalesnik and Wermers, 2011). Alpha is 
therefore a conditional estimate of risk-adjusted 
excess return which depends on the risk model 
and data employed. Uncertainty about the choice 
of model, data and theoretical basis for different 
factor premiums suggests that care should be 
taken when interpreting estimates produced by 
such models. Using alpha from models which 
adjust for the harvesting of factor premiums as a 
management performance measure can also be 
problematic. As Dahlquist, Polk, Priestley and 
Ødegaard (2015) have pointed out, it can be 
argued that the results achieved by harvesting 
certain factor premiums must be attributed to the 
manager, and that no adjustment should be made 
for them.

An important point is that not all risk premi-
ums can be harvested by adjusting the bench-
mark index. In the report on the Fund for 2010, 
the Ministry of Finance concluded that giving 
greater emphasis to factor strategies in the man-
agement of the GPFN was ineffectual. Among 
other things, it was pointed out that it is difficult to 
identify an unambiguous set of factors in the Nor-
wegian market, and that factor premiums are 
insufficiently stable over time. Such factors mean 
that there is little purpose in seeking to adjust the 
benchmark index for the GPFN to harvest factor 
premiums. 

The report on the Fund for 2012 contained 
comprehensive analyses of factor strategies for 
large global equity portfolios like that of the 
GPFG.2 It was stated that it is difficult to identify 
the most appropriate adjustments, and that such 
adjustments may change over time. For a large 
fund like the GPFG, some strategies will entail 

2 The analyses were prepared by the index provider and con-
sultancy firm MSCI (2013).
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large transaction volumes and costs, and have low 
investability. The Ministry therefore emphasised 
the necessity of adapting the strategies to the 
Fund. It was concluded that the GPFG’s distinc-
tive characteristics mean that it is, in principle, 
well positioned to harvest factor premiums, but 
that the strategies should not be incorporated into 
the benchmark index stipulated by the Ministry.

Models which seek to estimate risk-taking by 
managers are also a useful tool for investigating 
how risk may, in hindsight, have impacted results. 
The Ministry of Finance regularly reviews the 
management of the two funds. This includes thor-
ough analysis and evaluation of risk-taking by the 
managers. The risk-taking analyses in the most 
recent review of the GPFN’s management do not 
indicate that Folketrygdfondet is taking on more 
systematic risk by concentrating investments in 
assets which display a higher degree of covaria-
tion with the benchmark index.3 In the GPFG’s 
case, the analysis results are not clear-cut.4 The 
analyses also show that harvesting factor premi-
ums appears to account for a considerable propor-
tion of the excess return, particularly in the 
GPFG. Section 3–5(2) of the mandate for the 
GPFG provides that “[t]he equity and bond portfo-
lio should be composed in such a way that the expec-
ted relative return is exposed to several different sys-
tematic risk factors”.

7.5 Summary

The Ministry of Finance uses gross excess return 
to measure the results achieved by Norges Bank 
and Folketrygdfondet in their management of the 
GPFG and GPFN, respectively. The performance 
measure is based on the division of labour 
between the Ministry and the two managers, and 
on the audited accounts. Calculations indicate that 
the gross excess return is also a reasonable mea-
sure of net value added through active manage-
ment. This is because the actual historical asset 
management costs are approximately equal to the 
estimated historical negative excess return 
achieved through index management. The calcu-

lations exclude the excess return due to revenue 
from securities lending.

The gross excess return is not dependent on 
model assumptions or estimated parameters. The 
Ministry of Finance emphasises that performance 
measures should be as unambiguous as possible, 
and simple to understand and communicate. 
Moreover, the gross excess return should be sup-
plemented by analyses that adjust for any returns 
achieved by the manager through systematic risk-
taking, and analyses illustrating the harvesting of 
any factor premiums.

On 1 February 2016, the Ministry of Finance 
adopted new requirements for more detailed 
reporting on performance, risks and costs in the 
management of the GPFG; see section 3.4. Among 
other things, reports must now be made on the 
risk-adjusted return and the composition of the 
gross excess return.

Although gross excess return is used as the 
primary measure of the results achieved by the 
two managers, several supplementary measures 
and analyses are also employed.

The managers give an account of risk-taking in 
their reports on Fund performance. The Ministry 
of Finance presents supplementary measures in 
its annual report to the Storting on the Govern-
ment Pension Fund, and conducts regular reviews 
of the management of the two funds. These 
reviews include evaluation of risk-taking.
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8  The GPFG’s benchmark index for equities and bonds

8.1 Background

The Ministry of Finance expresses the invest-
ment strategy for the GPFG through a bench-
mark index, risk limits and other provisions in 
the mandate issued to Norges Bank. The bench-
mark index plays an important role in the man-
agement of the GPFG, as it specifies the desired 
capital allocation across asset classes, geo-
graphical regions and currencies. The index 
incorporates separate benchmark indices for 
equities and fixed-income securities, and the 
real estate portfolio.

The long-term strategy for the GPFG specifies 
a fixed allocation to equities (60 percent), up to 
five percent in real estate and the remainder in 
fixed-income securities. See Figure 8.1. Distribu-
tion accross asset classes is the primary determi-
nant of the Fund’s total risk.

The overarching principles underpinning the 
design of the benchmark indices for the equity 
and fixed-income portfolios are discussed below. 
Detailed rules for the fixed-income index and equ-
ity index are set out in section 3–2 and section 3–
3, respectively, of the mandate for the manage-
ment of the GPFG.

Figure 8.1 Benchmark index for the GPFG

Source: Ministry of Finance.
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Figure 8.2 Distribution of the equity and fixed-income benchmark indices across geographical regions and 
sectors as of 31 December 2015

Sources: Norges Bank and Ministry of Finance.
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8.2 Broad market indices

The investment strategy for the GPFG is based on 
the assumption that total risk in the Fund can be 
reduced by spreading the investments across a 
large number of securities, i.e. through diversifi-
cation. The benchmark indices chosen for the 
GPFG’s equity and fixed-income investments are 
based on broad global indices and generally 
reflect the investment opportunities available in 
global equity and bond markets. The benchmark 
indices provide a clear, detailed description of how 
the Fund should in principle be invested in differ-
ent countries, sectors, currencies, individual com-
panies and bonds; see Figure 8.2. 

The broadness of a market index also 
depends on what inclusion criteria the index 
provider applies to securities. Among other 
things, providers decide which markets and 
securities should be included in a given index. 
Indices are generally constructed with the obje-
ctive of broad risk diversification. A further aim 
is that indices should be investable. Highly liquid 
securities are therefore accorded priority in the 
composition of such indices, to ensure that broad 
groups of investors can invest in the selected 
securities at a low transaction cost.

To some extent, different index providers 
apply dissimilar criteria when determining which 
securities are to be included in an index. As a 
result, different equity indices for a given region 
will not necessarily contain the same equities, and 
the selected equities may not have the same rela-
tive weightings. Moreover, various indices may 
incorporate different countries and markets. 
There may be considerable composition differ-
ences between global indices prepared by differ-
ent index providers, even though the indices all 
aim to reflect developments in global stock mar-
kets. The Ministry of Finance would emphasise 
that the Fund’s benchmark index is based on 
index products developed by leading, recognised 
index providers.

Basing the Fund’s benchmark index on stan-
dardised products largely leaves decisions regard-
ing market and company representation to the cho-
sen index provider. The management mandate nev-
ertheless includes a provision stating that Norges 
Bank must pre-approve all markets before funds 
may be invested. This approval requirement applies 
regardless of whether a market is included in the 
benchmark index stipulated by the Ministry of 
Finance. Accordingly, the manager is obliged to con-
duct an independent assessment to establish which 
markets provide the Fund with satisfactory security. 

8.3 The equity index

The benchmark index for the GPFG’s equity 
investments is based on the FTSE Global All Cap 
index, and includes all countries classified by the 
index provider as developed or emerging mar-
kets, with the exception of Norway. At the end of 
2015, the index incorporated 24 developed mar-
kets and 21 emerging markets.1

The index provider classifies stock markets as 
developed, emerging or frontier by reference to 
criteria such as data quality, currency restrictions, 
per capita GDP, the number of limited companies, 
securities pricing quality, the country’s credit rat-
ing and restrictions on foreign ownership. The 
efficiency of settlement systems, market liquidity 
and maturity, total market capitalisation and scope 
for exercising ownership rights also affect classifi-
cation.2 The inclusion of countries in the equity 
index is determined by the index provider’s 
assessments. The country composition of the 
index will vary over time as individual markets are 
included or excluded from the index.

An index in which each individual company is 
given a weighting corresponding to the market 
value of the shares in the company is referred to 
as a market-weighted index. A market-weighted 
index reflects the investment opportunities avail-
able to a typical investor, and can be regarded as 
the portfolio held by the average global investor. 
Developments in a market-weighted index reflect 
the value performance of the stock market as a 
whole, as represented by the index. Basing invest-
ment composition on market-weighted indices 
entails tracking the market’s pricing of the 
included equities. The geographical distribution 
of such an index is determined by the included 
companies’ market value and where they are 
listed.

The FTSE Global All Cap index is based on 
global market weights, but is adjusted for so-
called free float. Free-float adjustment involves 
altering the index weightings for individual com-
panies to reflect the ownership shares of large 
long-term owners and cross-ownership. This 
adjustment reduces index weights of companies 
with many long-term owners. The argument for 
such adjustment is that these ownership shares 
are not freely tradable. The adjusted weights pro-
vide a better measure of the investment opportu-

1 FTSE classifies Belgium and Luxembourg as a single stock 
market. The number of individual countries is thus 46.

2 FTSE Russell Country Classification Process (September 
2015).
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nities available to international financial investors, 
and promote lower transaction costs.

Adjusting index weightings to take free float 
into account also impacts the geographical distri-
bution of such indices. In emerging markets, a 
material proportion of shares in listed companies 
are not freely tradable. These markets are there-
fore given a lower weighting in a market-weighted 
index adjusted for free float than in an index based 
on full market capitalisation.

A geographical distribution in line with market 
weightings provides a natural starting point for 
the composition of the Fund’s equity index. Mar-
ket value weighting also implies that countries in 
which the stock market is largely listed and mar-
ket value is high are accorded a high weighting in 
the index. The proportion of the capital market 
which is listed varies between different countries, 
regions and market types. In the Ministry’s view, 
pure market weighting (free-float adjusted) will 
entail an undesirably high concentration of invest-
ments in the US stock market; see the report on 
the Fund for 2011. The benchmark index for the 
equity investments is supplemented by country 
and market adjustment factors to ensure a more 
balanced geographical distribution. 

8.4 The fixed-income index

The purpose of the fixed-income investments is to 
reduce fluctuations in the total return on the Fund, 
provide liquidity and exposure to risk factors such 
as interest and credit risk. The composition of the 
GPFG’s fixed-income benchmark index is based on 
assessments of the risk and return properties of 
different parts of the bond market, in line with the 
purpose of the fixed-income investments.

While the Fund’s equity benchmark index 
broadly represents the global listed stock mar-
ket, the fixed-income index covers a narrower 
range of investment opportunities in debt instru-
ments. The design of the Ministry’s fixed-income 
index balances the desire for a simple, transpar-
ent and verifiable index with the objectives of 
broad risk diversification and representation of 
investment opportunities in the global bond mar-
ket. Some sub-segments included in broad mar-
ket indices have been excluded based on, inter 
alia, evaluations of market structure, concentra-
tion risk and whether the sub-markets are suited 
for passive management; see the report on the 
Fund for 2011.

The fixed-income benchmark index is based 
on the currencies and individual securities 

included in selected sub-indices provided by Bar-
clays. To be included in Barclays’ broad index of 
fixed-income securities in local currencies, securi-
ties must have a high credit rating (investment 
grade). The securities and the local currency mar-
kets must also be sufficiently liquid and invest-
able. Further, there must be a liquid currency 
market in which international investors can hedge 
against future fluctuations in the value of the local 
currency.

70 percent of the fixed-income benchmark 
index comprises government bonds, inflation-
linked bonds and bonds issued by international 
organisations (the government sub-index). The 
remaining 30 percent comprises corporate bonds 
(company sub-index). The allocation between the 
two sub-indices is fixed, and there is full monthly 
rebalancing to the specified proportions.

The role of the government sub-index is particu-
larly to reduce fluctuations in the Fund’s aggre-
gate return. The composition of the government 
bond index is based on the currencies included in 
Barclays’ broad index3 of nominal government 
bonds issued in local currencies, with the excep-
tion of Norwegian kroner. If the index provider 
alters the selection of currencies in the underlying 
indices, the benchmark index for the GPFG’s 
fixed-income investments will be changed corre-
spondingly. The government sub-index presently 
comprises nominal government bonds issued in 
23 currencies, including 11 emerging-market cur-
rencies. Other securities included in the govern-
ment sub-index are inflation-linked bonds issued 
in currencies of developed economies and bonds 
issued by international organisations like the 
World Bank.4

Market weighting can be a less suitable start-
ing point for investment in government bonds 
than for equities and corporate bonds. The overall 
supply of government bonds is significantly 
impacted by the borrowing needs of individual 
sovereign states. Market weighting implies high 
and increasing exposure to countries with high 
and rising debt levels, and does not necessarily 
ensure good risk diversification.

The weighting of the GPFG’s sub-index for 
government bonds is based on the size of each 

3 Securities are selected in accordance with the Barclay Glo-
bal Treasury GDP Weighted by Country Index.

4 Securities are selected in accordance with the Barclays 
Global Inflation Linked Index and the “Supranational” sub-
segment in the Barclays Global Aggregate Index. Bonds 
issued by international organisations are allocated to 
countries in accordance with the currency denomination of 
each security.
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country’s economy as measured by gross domes-
tic product (GDP). GDP weighting entails lower 
index exposure to countries with high national 
debt relative to the size of the economy than with 
a market-weighted index, and vice versa. The dis-
tribution across different regions and individual 
countries depends on developments in GDP and 
on which markets are included or excluded from 
the index. In each country, sub-segments and 
individual bonds are weighted according to 
market weights. Market weighting ensures equal 
ownership shares in all bonds in the same 
country.

Some countries have high GDP compared to 
the size of the government-bond market. In the 
interests of investability, individual country 
weights in the government sub-index are there-
fore supplemented by adjustment factors. The size 
of the Fund makes the investability requirement 
particularly important.

The management mandate also includes a 
requirement that Norges Bank must take differ-
ences in national fiscal strength into account when 
composing the actual portfolio. This requirement 
is intended to emphasise that one of the objectives 
for the Fund’s investments in government bonds 

is to reduce fluctuations in the Fund’s aggregate 
return over time.

The benchmark index for the company sub-
index contains covered bonds and corporate 
bonds.5 Expected return on corporate bonds is 
assumed to exceed that on government bonds, 
partly due to the compensation expected for 
accepting the credit risk associated with such 
bonds, i.e. the credit premium. The composition 
of the company sub-index in the fixed-income 
index is based on market weights. The index 
incorporates seven approved developed-market 
currencies in Europe and North America.6 

The Ministry of Finance

r e c o m m e n d s :

Recommendation of 5 April 2016 from the 
Ministry of Finance on the Management of the 
Government Pension Fund in 2015 be submitted 
to the Storting.

5 Securities selection is based on the sub-segments “Covered 
Bonds” and “Corporates” in the Barclays Global Aggregate.

6 USD, CAD, EUR, GBP, SEK, DKK, CHF.
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Appendix 1  

Glossary of terms 

Active management

Active management involves the asset manager 
composing, on the basis of analyses and assess-
ments, a portfolio that deviates from the bench-
mark index established by the asset owner. In 
such a portfolio, some securities will be over-
weighted and some underweighted compared to 
the benchmark index. The portfolio may also con-
tain securities which are not included in the index. 
The purpose of such deviations is to achieve an 
excess return or improve the risk-return ratio 
compared to the benchmark index. In the GPFN 
and GPFG, deviation from the benchmark index is 
primarily regulated by means of a limit on 
expected tracking error. See Excess return, Actual 
benchmark index, Index management, Strategic 
benchmark index and Tracking error. 

Actual benchmark index

The actual benchmark index for the GPFG and the 
GPFN is based on the strategic benchmark index. 
The strategic benchmark index specifies the alloca-
tion across asset classes and comprises a given num-
ber of securities, determined by the criteria adopted 
by the index provider for inclusion in the index. 
However, since the various asset classes generate 
different returns over time, the asset allocation of 
the actual benchmark index will drift from the strate-
gic weights. In order to prevent the deviation from 
the strategic weights from becoming excessive, the 
Ministry has adopted rebalancing rules for the 
equity portion for the actual benchmark index. See 
Strategic benchmark index and Rebalancing.

Within the established asset management 
framework, the composition of the actual portfolio 
may deviate from that implied by the actual bench-
mark index. Since the scope for deviations is lim-
ited, the risk and return of the Fund will largely be 
determined by the actual benchmark index. The 
actual benchmark index forms the basis for the 
measurement of excess return and risk assumed 
in active management. See Active management, 
Excess return and Actual portfolio.

Actual portfolio

The term actual portfolio designates the overall 
investments included in the Fund. The actual port-
folio will normally deviate from the benchmark 
index (active management). See Active manage-
ment, Actual benchmark index and Strategic bench-
mark index.

Arithmetic return

Arithmetic return is a measure of the average 
return over several time periods. It is calculated 
by adding up the return achieved in different time 
periods and dividing the sum by the number of 
periods. See Return and Geometric return. 

Asset allocation

Asset allocation means the allocation of capital 
under management across different asset classes. 
A distinction is made between strategic asset allo-
cation and tactical asset allocation. Strategic asset 
allocation expresses the asset owner’s underlying 
risk tolerance and return expectations, and is for 
the Government Pension Fund Global expressed 
through the composition of the benchmark index. 
Within the limits of the investment mandate, the 
asset manager may engage in tactical asset alloca-
tion. This entails actively choosing to deviate from 
the strategic asset allocation on the basis of 
assessments as to whether one asset class is over- 
or underpriced relative to another. See Asset clas-
ses.

Asset classes 

Asset classes are different types or classes of 
financial assets with different risk and return 
properties. The benchmark index for the GPFG 
encompasses three asset classes: equities, bonds 
and real estate. The benchmark index for the 
GPFN includes two asset classes: equities and 
bonds. See Bond.
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Bond

A bond is a tradable loan with a maturity of more 
than one year. Bonds are redeemed by the issuer 
(borrower) upon maturity, and the issuer pays 
interest (so-called coupon) to the bondholders 
during the period between issuance and maturity. 
Most bonds are based on a fixed nominal interest 
rate, i.e. the coupon is a specified predetermined 
amount. A fixed-rate bond will appreciate in value 
when the general interest rate level falls and cor-
respondingly depreciate when the general inter-
est level rises. Bonds may have different features, 
including a floating interest rate, a zero coupon or 
an ongoing redemption structure. 

Capital Asset Pricing Model

The Capital Asset Pricing Model is an equilibrium 
model for the pricing of securities (or a portfolio 
of securities) with an uncertain future return. The 
model features a linear relationship between the 
expected return in excess of a risk-free rate and 
the sensitivity of the security (or portfolio) to mar-
ket risk.

Concentration risk

If investments or loans are concentrated in an 
individual company, industry or market, the port-
folio becomes vulnerable to incidents which affect 
these investments in particular. Concentration 
risk can be reduced through broad diversification 
of investments or loans. See Diversification.

Correlation

Correlation refers to the degree and direction of 
the covariation between two variables. Perfectly 
positive correlation (= 1) means that the variables 
always move perfectly in tandem. Zero correlation 
means that there is no covariation whatsoever. 
Perfect negative correlation means that the vari-
ables always move in exact opposition to each 
other. The risk associated with a portfolio can be 
reduced by diversifying the investments across 
several assets, unless there is perfect positive cor-
relation between the returns on the individual 
investments. See Diversification. 

Counterparty risk 

Counterparty risk is the risk of loss as the result 
of another contracting party not fulfilling its legal 
obligations. See Credit risk. 

Coupon

The interest paid to bondholders during the 
period between issuance and maturity. Bonds may 
be issued with or without a coupon.

Covariation 

See Correlation. 

Credit risk

Credit risk is the risk of loss due to non-fulfilment 
of legal obligations by the issuer of a security or a 
counterparty to a securities trade, for example as 
a result of bankruptcy. See Counterparty risk.

Currency basket

The GPFG is exclusively invested in foreign 
securities, and thus only in securities that are 
traded in currencies other than Norwegian kro-
ner. Hence, the return on the GPFG measured 
in Norwegian kroner will vary with changes in 
the exchange rate between Norwegian kroner 
and the currencies in which the Fund is 
invested. However, the international purchasing 
power of the Fund is unaffected by develop-
ments in the Norwegian kroner exchange rate. 
The return on the Fund is therefore measured in 
foreign currency. This is done on the basis of 
the currency basket for the Fund, which weights 
together the currencies included in the bench-
mark portfolio. 

Differential return 

See Excess return. 

Diversification

The risk associated with a portfolio can normally 
be reduced by including more assets in the port-
folio. Doing so reduces the impact on the portfo-
lio of fluctuations in, for example, an individual 
share, industry or market. This is referred to as 
diversification, or the spreading of risk. Diversifi-
cation is the main reason for spreading the 
benchmark index of the Fund across several 
asset classes and a broad range of countries, sec-
tors and companies. Diversification can improve 
the ratio between expected return and risk. See 
Asset classes.
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Duration

Duration measures how long it takes, on average, 
for the cash flows (coupons and principal) of a 
bond to be redeemed. The value of a bond is sen-
sitive to interest rate changes, and such sensitivity 
increases with longer duration. See Bond.

Emerging markets

The term emerging markets denotes countries 
with economies that are less developed than those 
of traditional industrialised nations. There is no 
unambiguous set of criteria that defines whether a 
market is emerging, and country-classification 
practice varies. The classifications of index provid-
ers such as FTSE are commonly used for invest-
ments in listed stock markets. FTSE classifies 
emerging markets on the basis of, inter alia, gross 
domestic product per capita. Since indices provide 
the foundation for financial investments, account 
is also taken of financial market characteristics 
such as size, liquidity and regulatory framework. 

Excess return 

The contribution made by active management to 
the return on the invested capital is referred to as 
the excess return, and is measured as the differ-
ence in return between the actual portfolio and 
the benchmark index. It is also referred to as the 
differential return, or as a negative excess return 
when the actual portfolio produces a lower return 
than the benchmark index. Risk and asset man-
agement costs are also taken into account when 
evaluating the results of active management in 
this context.

Exchange rate risk 

Investments may feature a different distribution 
across countries and currencies than the goods 
and services they are intended to finance. 
Changes in international exchange rates will 
therefore influence the amount of goods and ser-
vices that can be purchased. This is referred to as 
(real) exchange rate risk. International purchas-
ing power parity plays a key role when it comes to 
measuring such exchange rate risk. See 
International purchasing power parity. 

Expected return

Expected return is a statistical measure of the 
mean value in a set of all possible return out-

comes, and is equal to the average return on an 
investment if repeated numerous times. If an 
investment alternative has a 50 percent probabil-
ity of a 20 percent appreciation, a 25 percent prob-
ability of a 10 percent appreciation and a 25 per-
cent probability of a 10 percent depreciation, the 
expected return is 10 percent: (0.5 x 0.2) + (0.25 x 
0.1) + (0.25 x -0.1) = 10. Expected return may be 
calculated using historical return series or based 
on forward-looking model simulations. See 
Return.

Externalities

Externalities are production or consumption costs 
or benefits that are not incurred by, or accrue to, 
the decision maker. An example of a negative 
externality is environmental damage which 
affects society but not the company which causes 
it. Without regulation, the profitability of a com-
pany will not reflect the negative externalities of 
its production. When an externality is negative, 
the socioeconomic cost is higher than what is paid 
by the producer. The opposite applies to positive 
externalities. Such market failure results in ineffi-
cient resource use compared to scenarios in 
which the company covers the full socioeconomic 
cost. Regulation can promote correct pricing of 
externalities and thus effective use of resources 
for the benefit of society, for example through a 
tax on environmental damage.

Factors

Factors influence the return on a broad range of 
investments. Investors will normally require an 
expected return in excess of the risk-free rate to 
accept exposure to systematic factors, preventing 
the reduction of the risk associated with such fac-
tors through diversification. This is labelled a fac-
tor premium. Known systematic factors in the 
stock market include market risk, size, value, 
momentum, liquidity and volatility. Important sys-
tematic factors in the bond market are term, 
credit and liquidity, with corresponding factor pre-
miums. See Diversification and Systematic risk.

Financial owner

The term financial owner is applied to investors 
who primarily have a financial objective when 
investing in securities. To spread risk, a financial 
owner will often prefer to be a small owner in 
many companies, rather than a large owner in few. 
See Strategic owner.
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Fundamental analysis

Fundamental analysis primarily aims to analyse 
the factors that influence the future (expected) 
cash flow of an asset. A key feature of a fundamen-
tal analysis of individual stocks will be assess-
ments relating to the income, costs and invest-
ments of the company. Fundamental analysis is 
used for, inter alia, the valuation of companies. 
Active management strategies will often involve 
the purchase of equities that are deemed to have a 
low valuation in the stock market relative to the 
estimated fundamental value of the company. The 
investor therefore expects the fundamental value 
of the company over time to be reflected in its 
share price. See Active management.

Geometric return

Geometric return (or time-weighted return) is a 
measure of average return over several time peri-
ods. The measure specifies the average growth 
rate of an investment in each period. The more 
pronounced the variation in the annual return, the 
greater the difference between the geometrically 
and arithmetically calculated returns. In quarterly 
and annual reports, return over time is most com-
monly reported as a geometric average. See 
Arithmetic return.

Index

An index comprises a set of securities defined on 
the basis of the selection criteria applied by the 
index provider, and specifies an average return for 
the securities included in the index. Indices are 
prepared by securities exchanges, consultancy 
firms, newspapers and investment banks. They 
may, for example, be based on countries, regions, 
markets or sectors. If it is possible to invest in a 
portfolio in line with the index composition, the 
index is said to be investable. This will typically be 
the case with highly liquid securities, like listed 
equities. An index of unlisted real estate develop-
ments, on the other hand, will not be investable. 
When an index is used as a return measure for a 
specific securities portfolio, it is referred to as a 
benchmark index. See Index management, Actual 
benchmark index and Strategic benchmark index.

Index management

Index management (passive management) entails 
organising asset management to ensure that the 

actual portfolio reflects the composition of the 
benchmark index. If the composition of the actual 
portfolio is identical to the composition of the 
benchmark index, the return on the actual portfo-
lio will be equal to the return on the benchmark 
index, ignoring transaction costs, taxes and asset 
management costs. If the benchmark index 
includes most of the securities traded in the mar-
ket, index management will achieve a return that 
reflects the return on the market as a whole. The 
costs associated with index management are nor-
mally low. See Index, Actual benchmark index and 
Strategic benchmark index.

Inflation

Inflation is an increase in the general price level.

Inflation risk

Inflation risk is the risk of a loss of purchasing 
power as the result of unexpectedly high inflation. 
See Inflation.

Institutional investor

Institutional investors are organisations set up for 
the purpose of engaging in investment activities, 
typically on behalf of clients. Institutional inves-
tors normally manage large portfolios covering 
several asset classes and geographical markets. 
Examples of institutional investors are pension 
funds, insurance companies, securities funds and 
sovereign wealth funds. Banks and hedge funds 
may also be classified as institutional investors.

International purchasing power parity

This term describes a theory which states that 
over time exchange rates are determined by the 
amount of goods and services which can be pur-
chased using each currency. Exchange rates will 
be drawn to a level at which the prices of goods 
and services converge when measured in a com-
mon currency. No account is taken of transporta-
tion costs, trade barriers or the fact that not all 
goods can be traded internationally. There is a 
broad consensus among researchers that interna-
tional purchasing power parity applies in the long 
run. Purchasing power parity plays a key role in 
the measurement of exchange rate risk. See 
Exchange rate risk.
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Investability

By investability is meant the extent to which an 
investment idea or rule can be implemented in 
operational asset management. Investability may 
differ for small and large funds.

Liquidity premium

A liquid security can be traded relatively quickly 
and at a relatively predictable price. A liquidity 
premium is an expected compensation for invest-
ing in illiquid securities. In practice, liquidity pre-
miums are difficult to define and measure. See 
Risk premiums.

Market efficiency

Market efficiency implies that the price of a finan-
cial asset, such as an equity or a bond, at all times 
reflects all available information about the funda-
mental value of the asset. If this hypothesis is cor-
rect, it will be impossible for a manager consis-
tently to achieve an excess return through funda-
mental analysis. See Active management and 
Fundamental analysis.

Market risk

Market risk is the risk that the value of a securi-
ties portfolio will change as the result of broad 
movements in the market prices of equities, cur-
rencies, commodities and interest rates. It is nor-
mally assumed that higher market risk is accom-
panied by a higher expected return over time. See 
Expected return.

Market value weights

A portfolio or index is market-value weighted 
when the investments in each individual security 
or asset are included with a weight corresponding 
to the security’s or asset’s proportion of total mar-
ket value. See Index.

Nominal return 

Achieved return measured in nominal prices, i.e. 
without inflation adjustment. See Return, Inflation 
and Real rate of return.

Operational risk

Operational risk is the risk of economic loss or 
reputational loss as the result of deficiencies in 

internal processes, human error, systems error or 
other loss caused by circumstances that are not a 
consequence of the market risk in the portfolio. 
Operational risk does not generate a risk pre-
mium. However, in managing operational risk, the 
gain to be made by keeping the probability of such 
losses low must be balanced against the costs 
incurred as a result of increased control, monitor-
ing, etc.

Passive management 

See Index management. 

Portfolio

A collection of different securities and asset 
classes held by an investor. See Diversification.

Principal-agent problem

Principal-agent problems describe situations in 
which there is not a complete alignment of inter-
ests between the person issuing an assignment 
(the principal) and the person performing it (the 
agent). In cases where the principal and the agent 
have access to different information, the agent 
may make choices that are not necessarily in the 
interest of the principal. In the capital markets, 
such situations may generally arise both between 
an asset owner and an asset manager and between 
an asset manager and the senior executives of the 
companies in which investments are made. 

Probability distribution 

A probability distribution describes the relative 
frequency of various values that an uncertain (sto-
chastic) variable may assume. The best known 
probability distribution is the normal distribution, 
which is symmetric around the mean value 
(expected value). Asymmetrical distributions are 
often referred to as skewed. Distributions in 
which extreme outcomes (large or small) carry a 
higher probability than under the normal distribu-
tion are referred to as distributions with “fat“ or 
“heavy“ tails. 

Real rate of return 

Real rate of return is the achieved nominal return 
adjusted for inflation. It may also be referred to as 
return measured in constant prices or in terms of 
purchasing power. See Inflation and Nominal 
return. 
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Rebalancing 

The Ministry has adopted strategic benchmark 
indices for the GPFG and the GPFN which incor-
porate a fixed equity portion and, for the GPFN, 
also a fixed regional allocation. Since returns 
develop differently in respect of each asset class 
and region, the equity portion in the actual bench-
mark index will over time move away from the 
strategic allocation. The Fund’s actual benchmark 
index is therefore permitted to deviate somewhat 
from the strategic composition. Further, rules 
have been issued on the rebalancing of the index. 
When deviations exceed predetermined limits, 
the necessary assets are purchased and sold to 
bring the actual benchmark index into conformity 
with the strategic benchmark index. Rebalancing 
returns the risk in the Fund to the level implied by 
the strategic benchmark index. It also gives the 
investment strategy something of a counter-cycli-
cal flavour, since over time the Fund will buy the 
asset class which has fallen substantially in value 
in relative terms and sell the asset class which has 
experienced high relative value growth. See 
Actual benchmark index and Strategic benchmark 
index. 

Relative return 

See Excess return. 

Return

Historical return is calculated as the change in 
market value from one specific date to another. 
Cash outflows during the period, such as equity 
income and coupons, are included when calculat-
ing the return. See Arithmetic return, Geometric 
return, Excess return and Expected return. 

Risk

Risk is a measure that provides some indication as 
to the probability of an event occurring and the 
consequences thereof, for example in the form of 
losses or gains. There are various aspects to risk. 
One important aspect is the distinction between 
risk that can be quantified and risk that is difficult 
to quantify. An example of the former is the mar-
ket risk associated with investments in the securi-
ties market. An example of the latter is the opera-
tional risk inherent in a portfolio. Standard devia-
tion is one common way of quantifying risk. See 
Market risk, Operational risk, Credit risk, Systema-
tic risk and Standard deviation.

Risk premium

Investors will normally demand an expected 
return beyond the risk-free rate for accepting risk 
which cannot be eliminated by diversification, i.e. 
for exposure to systematic risk factors. This 
excess return is referred to as the risk premium. 
See Diversification and Factors.

Standard deviation 

Standard deviation is often used to measure port-
folio risk. It indicates how much the value of a 
variable (in this case the portfolio return) is 
expected to fluctuate around its mean. The stan-
dard deviation of a constant value will be 0. The 
higher the standard deviation, the larger the 
expected fluctuations (volatility) or risk relative to 
the average return. Linking the standard deviation 
to a probability distribution sheds light on the 
probability of a portfolio decreasing in value by 
more than x percent or increasing in value by 
more than y percent during a given period.

If normally distributed, a return will deviate 
from the average return by less than one standard 
deviation in approximately two out of three 
instances. In 95 percent of the cases, the return 
will deviate by less than two standard deviations. 
Empirical studies of returns in the securities mar-
kets indicate that very low and very high returns 
occur more frequently than implied by a normal 
distribution. This phenomenon is called “fat tails” 
or “tail risk”. See Probability distribution and Risk. 

Strategic benchmark index 

The overarching investment strategy for the Gov-
ernment Pension Fund is expressed through stra-
tegic benchmark indices for the GPFN and the 
GPFG, respectively. The strategic benchmark 
indices specify a fixed allocation of capital across 
different asset classes and, in the GPFN’s case, 
also a fixed regional allocation. The strategic 
benchmark indices provide a detailed description 
of the asset allocation, and are set by the Ministry 
of Finance in the respective fund mandates. See 
Asset allocation, Asset classes and Actual bench-
mark index. 

Strategic owner

The term strategic owner is used to describe 
investors who, unlike financial owners, actively 
seek to exploit their ownership status for non-
financial purposes, for example to secure a 
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desired change in conduct. For a strategic owner, 
it is important to exercise influence over the com-
pany, preferably through a large ownership share 
and a seat on the company’s board of directors. 
Such owners are also referred to as industrial 
owners. See Financial owner.

Systematic risk

Systematic risk refers to the proportion of risk 
associated with a security or portfolio that cannot 
be diversified away by holding more securities. 
Investors cannot diversify away from recessions, 
lack of access to credit or liquidity, market collapse, 
etc. Systematic risk thus reflects the inherent 
uncertainty of the economy. According to financial 
theory, higher systematic risk will be compensated 
for in the form of higher expected returns over 
time. See Diversification and Risk factors. 

Tracking error 

The asset owner will normally define limits as to 
how much risk the asset manager may take. A 
common method is to define a benchmark index, 
together with limits specifying how much the 

actual portfolio may deviate from the benchmark 
index. In the mandates of Norges Bank and 
Folketrygdfondet, the Ministry of Finance has 
defined a limit in the form of a target for expected 
tracking error, i.e. the expected standard devia-
tion of the difference in the returns on the actual 
portfolio and the benchmark index. This means 
that over time, if certain statistical assumptions 
apply and the entire limit is utilised, the actual 
return will deviate from the return on the actual 
benchmark index by less than the defined limit as 
expressed in percentage points in two out of three 
years. See Active management, Excess return, 
Actual portfolio, Actual benchmark index and 
Standard deviation.

Unlisted investments 

Unlisted investments are investments in assets 
which are not traded in open and regulated mar-
kets. 

Volatility

Return variations. Measured by standard devia-
tion. See Standard deviation.
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Appendix 2  

Historical tables

1 Inflation figures in the table are not based on inflation measured in the currency basket of the Fund, but on Norwegian CPI data.
2 The first real estate investment was made in the first quarter of 2011. The five-year return is the annualised return since 1 April 

2011.
Sources: Norges Bank, Macrobond and Ministry of Finance.

Table 2.1 Return on the GPFG in 2015, in the last 3, 5 and 10 years, as well as over the period 1998–2015,  
measured in Norwegian kroner. Annual geometric average. Percent

 2015
Last 

3 years
Last 

5 years
Last 

10 years 1998–2015

GPFG incl. real estate

Actual portfolio 15.54 21.55 13.57 7.80 6.96

Norwegian inflation1 2.12 2.09 1.65 1.96 2.00

Asset management costs 0.06 0.06 0.06 0.09 0.09

Return net of costs and inflation 13.09 19.01 11.66 5.64 4.78

GPFG excl. real estate

Actual portfolio 15.30 21.46 13.52 7.78 6.95

Benchmark index 14.80 21.22 13.38 7.72 6.69

Excess return (percentage points) 0.51 0.24 0.15 0.06 0.27

Equity portfolio

Actual portfolio 16.77 25.63 15.22 8.02 6.83

Benchmark index 15.84 25.18 15.00 7.80 6.36

Excess return (percentage points) 0.94 0.45 0.23 0.23 0.48

Fixed-income portfolio

Actual portfolio 12.83 14.58 10.33 6.56 6.18

Benchmark index 13.10 14.83 10.42 6.51 6.05

Excess return (percentage points) -0.27 -0.25 -0.09 0.04 0.14

Real estate portfolio 

Actual portfolio2 23.71 23.91 14.19
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1 Inflation figures in individual currencies presented in the table are not based on inflation measured in the currency basket of the 
Fund, but on CPI data for each country/currency area.

Sources: Norges Bank, Macrobond, Thomson Reuters Datastream and Ministry of Finance.

Table 2.2 Nominal return on the GPFG and inflation1 in selected currencies and measured in the currency  
basket of the Fund. Annual geometric average. Percent

Year
Currency basket 

of the Fund NOK USD EUR GBP

Return Inflation Return Inflation Return Inflation Return Inflation Return Inflation

1997 9.07 1.75 10.83 2.62 -4.01 2.29 11.87 1.53 -0.16 1.89

1998 9.26 0.92 19.75 2.25 15.87 1.56 7.63 1.10 14.59 1.57

1999 12.44 1.28 13.84 2.30 7.92 2.21 26.43 1.08 11.40 1.26

2000 2.49 2.02 6.53 3.13 -2.91 3.36 3.66 2.14 4.75 0.83

2001 -2.47 1.17 -5.34 3.03 -6.93 2.85 -1.87 2.36 -4.48 1.24

2002 -4.74 1.91 -19.09 1.29 4.76 1.58 -11.11 2.18 -5.30 1.22

2003 12.59 1.57 19.96 2.45 24.92 2.28 3.92 2.13 12.34 1.34

2004 8.94 2.37 3.93 0.44 14.16 2.66 5.94 2.09 6.45 1.32

2005 11.09 2.33 14.28 1.59 2.22 3.39 17.80 2.17 14.32 2.09

2006 7.92 2.13 5.89 2.26 15.16 3.23 3.01 2.24 1.01 2.30

2007 4.26 3.12 -3.90 0.76 10.20 2.83 -0.61 2.07 8.35 2.38

2008 -23.31 1.42 -6.66 3.79 -27.62 3.86 -23.87 3.27 0.21 3.55

2009 25.62 1.82 7.88 2.11 30.77 -0.37 26.69 0.33 16.42 2.24

2010 9.62 1.98 9.49 2.47 8.82 1.68 16.38 1.63 12.24 3.23

2011 -2.54 2.84 -1.39 1.24 -3.96 3.12 -0.75 2.68 -3.25 4.47

2012 13.42 1.98 6.70 0.77 14.42 2.09 12.66 2.51 9.39 2.78

2013 15.95 1.41 25.11 2.13 14.77 1.48 9.81 1.32 12.63 2.60

2014 7.58 0.91 24.23 2.01 0.52 1.59 14.47 0.50 6.78 1.52

2015 2.74 0.86 15.54 2.12 -2.13 0.13 9.02 0.00 3.54 0.00

1998–2015 5.64 1.78 6.96 2.00 5.88 2.19 5.91 1.76 6.53 1.99

1997–2015 5.81 1.78 7.16 2.04 5.34 2.19 6.21 1.75 6.17 1.99
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